. . MTS Partners, Inc. 5
The Office Pal Inc 1st Run Computer Services Inc DBA iPrint Technologies Saitech Inc.
Total Price $6,728.68| Total Price $6,746.00| Total Price $8,082.00| Total Price $15,969.38
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Lexmark MS431DN 1 EA $298.57 $298.57|No Bid $379.00 $379.00 $390.81 $390.81
1.1 Lexmark MS431DN Lexmark 2950050 1 EA $188.57 $243.00 $275.00
1.2 MS431DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $110.00 $136.00 $115.81
2 Lexmark MS621DN 1 EA $619.70 $619.70|No Bid $814.00 $814.00 $754.00 $754.00
2.1  Lexmark MS621DN Lexmark 3650400 1 EA $441.18 $529.00 $589.00
2.2 MS621DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $178.52 $285.00 $165.00
3 Lexmark MS821DN 1 EA $721.84 $721.84|No Bid $998.00 $998.00 $904.62 $904.62
3.1  Lexmark MS821DN Lexmark 50G0100 1 EA $558.92 No Bid $749.00 $680.00
3.2 MS821DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $162.92 $249.00 $224.62
4 Lexmark CS431DW 1 EA 417.17 $417.17|No Bid $488.00 $488.00 $475.95 $475.95
4.1  Lexmark CS431DW Lexmark 40N9320 1 EA $285.07 $349.00 $399.00
4.2 CS431DW - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $132.10 $139.00 $76.95
5 Lexmark CS521DN 1 EA $439.12 $439.12|No Bid $548.00 $548.00 $592.00 $592.00
5.1  Lexmark CS521DN Lexmark 42C0060 1 EA $283.57 $349.00 $415.00
5.2 CS521DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $155.55 $199.00 $177.00
6 Lexmark CS720DE 1 EA $836.39 $836.39|No Bid $1,099.00 $1,099.00 $1,088.00 $1,088.00
6.1  Lexmark CS720DE Lexmark 40C9100 1 EA $579.92 $839.00 $855.00
6.2  CS720DE - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $256.47 $260.00 $233.00
7 Lexmark CX725DHE 1 EA $2,644.70 $2,644.70(No Bid $2,919.00 $2,919.00 $3,286.00 $3,286.00
7.1 Lexmark CX725DHE Lexmark 40C9501 1 EA $1,684.70 $1,990.00 $2,400.00
7.2 CX725DHE - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $960.00 $929.00 $886.00
8 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS431DN - 550 Shee Lexmark 2950600 1 EA $86.60 $86.60(No Bid $106.00 $106.00 $124.00 $124.00
9 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS621DN - 550 Shee Lexmark 3653110 1 EA 116.22 $116.22|No Bid $155.00 $155.00 $178.00 $178.00
10  Lexmark Paper Tray for MS821DN - 550 Shee Lexmark 50G0802 1 EA $145.77 $145.77|No Bid $187.00 $187.00 $223.00 $223.00
11 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS431DW - 250 Shee Lexmark 40N4250 1 EA $86.44 $86.44(No Bid $104.00 $104.00 $116.00 $116.00
12 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS521DN - 550 Sheel Lexmark 42C7550 1 EA $124.63 $124.63|No Bid $115.00 $115.00 $180.00 $180.00
13 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS720DE CX725DHE Lexmark 40C2100 1 EA $191.53 $191.53|No Bid $170.00 $170.00 $274.00 $274.00
14  Fujitsu - fi-7160 Document Scanner Fujitsu PA03670-B085 1 EA No Bid $779.00 $779.00|No Bid $848.00 $848.00
15  Fujitsu - fi-7260 Document Scanner Fujitsu PA03670-B555 1 EA No Bid $1,089.00 $1,089.00(No Bid $1,185.00 $1,185.00
16  Fujitsu - fi-7700 Flatbed Scanner Fujitsu PA03740-B005 1 EA No Bid $4,489.00 $4,489.00(No Bid $4,970.00 $4,970.00
17  Fujitsu - ScanSnap iX1500 Fujitsu PA03770-B615 1 EA No Bid $389.00 $389.00|No Bid $380.00 $380.00
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