
Total Price $6,728.68 Total Price $6,746.00 Total Price $7,623.82

Line # Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Lexmark MS431DN 1 EA $298.57 $298.57 No Bid No Bid

1.1 Lexmark MS431DN Lexmark 29S0050 1 EA $188.57

1.2 MS431DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $110.00

2 Lexmark MS621DN 1 EA $619.70 $619.70 No Bid No Bid

2.1 Lexmark MS621DN Lexmark 36S0400 1 EA $441.18 No Bid

2.2 MS621DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $178.52 No Bid

3 Lexmark MS821DN 1 EA $721.84 $721.84 No Bid No Bid

3.1 Lexmark MS821DN Lexmark 50G0100 1 EA $558.92 No Bid No Bid

3.2 MS821DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $162.92

4 Lexmark CS431DW 1 EA $417.17 $417.17 No Bid No Bid

4.1 Lexmark CS431DW Lexmark 40N9320 1 EA $285.07

4.2 CS431DW - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $132.10

5 Lexmark CS521DN 1 EA $439.12 $439.12 No Bid No Bid

5.1 Lexmark CS521DN Lexmark 42C0060 1 EA $283.57

5.2 CS521DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $155.55

6 Lexmark CS720DE 1 EA $836.39 $836.39 No Bid No Bid

6.1 Lexmark CS720DE Lexmark 40C9100 1 EA $579.92

6.2 CS720DE - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $256.47

7 Lexmark CX725DHE 1 EA $2,644.70 $2,644.70 No Bid No Bid

7.1 Lexmark CX725DHE Lexmark 40C9501 1 EA $1,684.70

7.2 CX725DHE - 3 YEAR EXTENDED WARRANTY 1 EA $960.00

8 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS431DN - 550 Sheet TrayLexmark 29S0600 1 EA $86.60 $86.60 No Bid No Bid

9 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS621DN - 550 Sheet TrayLexmark 36S3110 1 EA $116.22 $116.22 No Bid No Bid

10 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS821DN - 550 Sheet TrayLexmark 50G0802 1 EA $145.77 $145.77 No Bid No Bid

11 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS431DW - 250 Sheet TrayLexmark 40N4250 1 EA $86.44 $86.44 No Bid No Bid

12 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS521DN - 550 Sheet TrayLexmark 42C7550 1 EA $124.63 $124.63 No Bid No Bid

13 Lexmark Paper Tray for CS720DE  CX725DHE - 550 Sheet TrayLexmark 40C2100 1 EA $191.53 $191.53 No Bid No Bid

14 Fujitsu - fi-7160 Document Scanner Fujitsu PA03670-B085 1 EA No Bid $779.00 $779.00 $869.80 $869.80

15 Fujitsu - fi-7260 Document Scanner Fujitsu PA03670-B555 1 EA No Bid $1,089.00 $1,089.00 $1,225.36 $1,225.36

16 Fujitsu - fi-7700 Flatbed Scanner Fujitsu PA03740-B005 1 EA No Bid $4,489.00 $4,489.00 $5,127.82 $5,127.82

17 Fujitsu - ScanSnap iX1500 Fujitsu PA03770-B615 1 EA No Bid $389.00 $389.00 $400.84 $400.84

The Office Pal Inc 1st Run Computer Services Inc iCaught Incorporated
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Total Price $8,016.94 Total Price $8,082.00 Total Price $9,634.52 Total Price $14,070.80 Total Price $15,969.38

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

No Bid $379.00 $379.00 No Bid $484.10 $484.10 $390.81 $390.81

No Bid $243.00 $329.30 $275.00

No Bid $136.00 $154.80 $115.81

No Bid $814.00 $814.00 No Bid $1,154.30 $1,154.30 $754.00 $754.00

No Bid $529.00 $825.60 $589.00

No Bid $285.00 $328.70 $165.00

No Bid $998.00 $998.00 No Bid $1,310.60 $1,310.60 $904.62 $904.62

No Bid $749.00 No Bid $1,046.00 $680.00

No Bid $249.00 No Bid $264.60 $224.62

No Bid $488.00 $488.00 No Bid $627.60 $627.60 $475.95 $475.95

No Bid $349.00 $472.90 $399.00

No Bid $139.00 $154.70 $76.95

No Bid $548.00 $548.00 No Bid $723.30 $723.30 $592.00 $592.00

$349.00 $495.20 $415.00

$199.00 $228.10 $177.00

No Bid $1,099.00 $1,099.00 No Bid $1,313.80 $1,313.80 $1,088.00 $1,088.00

$839.00 $1,012.60 $855.00

$260.00 $301.20 $233.00

No Bid $2,919.00 $2,919.00 No Bid $4,295.50 $4,295.50 $3,286.00 $3,286.00

$1,990.00 $3,152.20 $2,400.00

$929.00 $1,143.30 $886.00

No Bid $106.00 $106.00 No Bid $147.90 $147.90 $124.00 $124.00

No Bid $155.00 $155.00 No Bid $212.90 $212.90 $178.00 $178.00

No Bid $187.00 $187.00 No Bid $267.00 $267.00 $223.00 $223.00

No Bid $104.00 $104.00 No Bid $138.30 $138.30 $116.00 $116.00

No Bid $115.00 $115.00 No Bid $212.90 $212.90 $180.00 $180.00

No Bid $170.00 $170.00 No Bid $327.10 $327.10 $274.00 $274.00

$920.00 $920.00 No Bid $984.70 $984.70 $1,005.90 $1,005.90 $848.00 $848.00

$1,259.99 $1,259.99 No Bid $1,644.20 $1,644.20 $1,406.60 $1,406.60 $1,185.00 $1,185.00

$5,437.95 $5,437.95 No Bid $6,589.16 $6,589.16 $0.00 $0.00 $4,970.00 $4,970.00

$399.00 $399.00 No Bid $416.46 $416.46 $443.00 $443.00 $380.00 $380.00

Konica Minolta Business 

Solutions U.S.A., Inc.
SHI Government Solutions Inc Saitech Inc.B & H Foto & Electronics Corp

MTS Partners, Inc.

DBA iPrint Technologies
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Total Price $16,436.52 Total Price $16,941.77 Total Price $17,327.65 Total Price $17,672.80 Total Price $18,157.00

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

$368.64 $368.64 $348.43 $348.43 $353.90 $353.90 $390.00 $390.00 $416.00 $416.00

$263.12 $286.12 $353.90 $275.00 $296.00

$105.52 $62.31 $0.00 $115.00 $120.00

$889.16 $889.16 $872.62 $872.62 $909.11 $909.11 $942.00 $942.00 $984.00 $984.00

$659.12 $707.16 $909.11 $688.00 $724.00

$230.04 $165.46 $0.00 $254.00 $260.00

$1,032.99 $1,032.99 $1,112.38 $1,112.38 $1,087.09 $1,087.09 $1,095.00 $1,095.00 $1,125.00 $1,125.00

$835.12 $907.54 $1,087.09 $872.00 $895.00

$197.87 $204.84 $0.00 $223.00 $230.00

$483.08 $483.08 $544.03 $544.03 $555.39 $555.39 $524.00 $524.00 $553.00 $553.00

$377.52 $410.90 $555.39 $394.00 $418.00

$105.56 $133.13 $0.00 $130.00 $135.00

$544.64 $544.64 $619.32 $619.32 $597.59 $597.59 $512.00 $512.00 $613.00 $613.00

$395.12 $430.26 $597.59 $335.00 $428.00

$149.52 $189.06 $0.00 $177.00 $185.00

$994.36 $994.36 $1,049.31 $1,049.31 $1,159.75 $1,159.75 $940.00 $940.00 $1,128.00 $1,128.00

$791.12 $879.89 $1,159.75 $686.00 $868.00

$203.24 $169.42 $0.00 $254.00 $260.00

$3,215.48 $3,215.48 $3,409.22 $3,409.22 $3,775.10 $3,775.10 $3,100.00 $3,100.00 $3,785.00 $3,785.00

$2,463.12 $2,739.65 $3,775.10 $2,135.00 $2,800.00

$752.36 $669.57 $0.00 $965.00 $985.00

$119.67 $119.67 $125.00 $125.00 $125.72 $125.72 $127.00 $127.00 $143.00 $143.00

$175.12 $175.12 $179.90 $179.90 $180.92 $180.92 $145.15 $145.15 $205.00 $205.00

$215.59 $215.59 $225.62 $225.62 $226.91 $226.91 $182.00 $182.00 $250.00 $250.00

$111.75 $111.75 $116.87 $116.87 $117.54 $117.54 $119.00 $119.00 $135.00 $135.00

$163.67 $163.67 $179.90 $179.90 $180.92 $180.92 $145.15 $145.15 $205.00 $205.00

$263.12 $263.12 $276.44 $276.44 $278.02 $278.02 $223.00 $223.00 $305.00 $305.00

$942.47 $942.47 $904.46 $904.46 $891.86 $891.86 $979.00 $979.00 $890.00 $890.00

$1,284.79 $1,284.79 $1,264.75 $1,264.75 $1,247.12 $1,247.12 $1,285.00 $1,285.00 $1,300.00 $1,300.00

$5,631.99 $5,631.99 $5,322.15 $5,322.15 $5,247.93 $5,247.93 $6,527.00 $6,527.00 $5,700.00 $5,700.00

No Bid $391.37 $391.37 $392.78 $392.78 $437.50 $437.50 $420.00 $420.00

MVATION WORLDWIDE INC.

Dream Ranch LLC

DBA Dream Ranch Office 

Supplies

ABC Laserjet Inc

DBA ABC Laser USA
Summus Industries, Inc. Hypertec USA, Inc
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Total Price $18,192.94 Total Price $18,319.70 Total Price $18,384.00 Total Price $18,793.00 Total Price $19,082.23

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

$445.71 $445.71 $422.49 $422.49 $365.00 $365.00 $437.00 $437.00 $434.16 $434.16

$315.26 $299.49 $294.00 $288.00 $305.66

$130.45 $123.00 $71.00 $149.00 $128.50

$920.98 $920.98 $1,018.44 $1,018.44 $1,026.00 $1,026.00 $886.00 $886.00 $950.99 $950.99

$790.53 $746.44 $737.00 $598.00 $766.44

$130.45 $272.00 $289.00 $288.00 $184.55

$1,131.95 $1,131.95 $1,184.82 $1,184.82 $1,121.00 $1,121.00 $1,166.00 $1,166.00 $1,195.19 $1,195.19

$1,001.50 $945.82 $939.00 $878.00 $970.98

$130.45 $239.00 $182.00 $288.00 $224.21

$583.19 $583.19 $554.82 $554.82 $570.00 $570.00 $556.00 $556.00 $663.16 $663.16

$452.74 $431.82 $422.00 $398.00 $438.95

$130.45 $123.00 $148.00 $158.00 $224.21

$604.52 $604.52 $640.37 $640.37 $644.00 $644.00 $676.00 $676.00 $666.61 $666.61

$474.07 $450.37 $445.00 $398.00 $459.64

$130.45 $190.00 $199.00 $278.00 $206.97

$1,099.94 $1,099.94 $1,193.01 $1,193.01 $1,166.00 $1,166.00 $1,266.00 $1,266.00 $1,223.67 $1,223.67

$969.49 $921.01 $891.00 $898.00 $939.95

$130.45 $272.00 $275.00 $368.00 $283.72

$3,149.16 $3,149.16 $3,883.38 $3,883.38 $3,869.00 $3,869.00 $3,556.00 $3,556.00 $4,003.84 $4,003.84

$3,018.71 $2,852.38 $2,827.00 $2,398.00 $2,926.73

$130.45 $1,031.00 $1,042.00 $1,158.00 $1,077.11

$145.78 $145.78 $132.90 $132.90 $137.00 $137.00 $158.00 $158.00 $133.64 $133.64

$209.78 $209.78 $190.10 $190.10 $197.00 $197.00 $198.00 $198.00 $192.31 $192.31

$263.12 $263.12 $238.41 $238.41 $247.00 $247.00 $228.00 $228.00 $241.30 $241.30

$136.29 $136.29 $124.27 $124.27 $129.00 $129.00 $148.00 $148.00 $124.94 $124.94

$209.78 $209.78 $191.19 $191.19 $197.00 $197.00 $198.00 $198.00 $192.31 $192.31

$322.37 $322.37 $293.27 $293.27 $302.00 $302.00 $278.00 $278.00 $295.54 $295.54

$1,031.83 $1,031.83 $946.06 $946.06 $965.00 $965.00 $1,158.00 $1,158.00 $1,023.36 $1,023.36

$1,437.39 $1,437.39 $1,322.90 $1,322.90 $1,349.00 $1,349.00 $1,598.00 $1,598.00 $1,425.78 $1,425.78

$6,048.45 $6,048.45 $5,566.62 $5,566.62 $5,675.00 $5,675.00 $5,798.00 $5,798.00 $5,866.38 $5,866.38

$452.70 $452.70 $416.65 $416.65 $425.00 $425.00 $488.00 $488.00 $449.05 $449.05

 Howard Industries Inc.

DBA Howard Technology 

Solutions

Cesco Coin Equipment Service 

Co Inc

DBA Cesco, Inc.

3-C TECHNOLOGY, LLC
Tochukwu Okonkwar

DBA Xyples LLC
Better Direct LLC
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Total Price $19,331.15 Total Price $19,346.93 Total Price $20,217.18 Total Price $20,239.00 Total Price $22,460.00

Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

$367.42 $367.42 $410.00 $410.00 $406.40 $406.40 $508.00 $508.00 $405.00 $405.00

$299.62 $335.00 $342.00 $319.00 $320.00

$67.80 $75.00 $64.40 $189.00 $85.00

$946.43 $946.43 $1,005.27 $1,005.27 $1,036.82 $1,036.82 $1,198.00 $1,198.00 $950.00 $950.00

$751.93 $810.27 $831.46 $769.00 $750.00

$194.50 $195.00 $205.36 $429.00 $200.00

$1,128.82 $1,128.82 $1,284.80 $1,284.80 $1,256.99 $1,256.99 $1,429.00 $1,429.00 $1,325.00 $1,325.00

$951.79 $1,034.80 $1,069.57 $1,049.00 $1,050.00

$177.03 $250.00 $187.42 $380.00 $275.00

$571.55 $571.55 $650.00 $650.00 $633.98 $633.98 $665.00 $665.00

$430.27 $500.00 $482.43 No Bid $515.00

$141.28 $150.00 $151.55 No Bid $150.00

$620.42 $620.42 $740.00 $740.00 $682.66 $682.66 $908.00 $908.00 $735.00 $735.00

$450.55 $505.00 $504.21 $479.00 $540.00

$169.87 $235.00 $178.45 $429.00 $195.00

$1,200.06 $1,200.06 $1,381.67 $1,381.67 $1,346.15 $1,346.15 $1,368.00 $1,368.00 $1,295.00 $1,295.00

$921.38 $1,016.67 $1,051.12 $969.00 $1,110.00

$278.68 $365.00 $295.03 $399.00 $185.00

$3,948.95 $3,948.95 $3,647.72 $3,647.72 $4,346.15 $4,346.15 $4,498.00 $4,498.00 $4,400.00 $4,400.00

$2,890.96 $3,102.72 $3,238.64 $2,999.00 $3,500.00

$1,057.99 $545.00 $1,107.51 $1,499.00 $900.00

$146.12 $146.12 $162.00 $162.00 $158.89 $158.89 $149.00 $149.00 $155.00 $155.00

$209.12 $209.12 $223.47 $223.47 $224.27 $224.27 $219.00 $219.00 $225.00 $225.00

$262.28 $262.28 $280.00 $280.00 $278.73 $278.73 $259.00 $259.00 $295.00 $295.00

$136.61 $136.61 $157.00 $157.00 $149.21 $149.21 $139.00 $139.00 $145.00 $145.00

$209.12 $209.12 $225.00 $225.00 $224.27 $224.27 $209.00 $209.00 $230.00 $230.00

$308.73 $308.73 $340.00 $340.00 $339.27 $339.27 $239.00 $239.00 $350.00 $350.00

$939.67 $939.67 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 $1,054.84 $1,054.84 $1,189.00 $1,189.00 $1,115.00 $1,115.00

$1,369.55 $1,369.55 $1,465.00 $1,465.00 $1,478.06 $1,478.06 $1,499.00 $1,499.00 $1,920.00 $1,920.00

$6,500.00 $6,500.00 $5,885.00 $5,885.00 $6,141.15 $6,141.15 $5,999.00 $5,999.00 $7,800.00 $7,800.00

$466.30 $466.30 $455.00 $455.00 $459.34 $459.34 $429.00 $429.00 $450.00 $450.00

CoreRecon, LLC Laksh Corporation DV Sourcing LLCM&A Technology, Inc SCAN TECHNOLOGY, INC.

2021-229 Addendum 1 - Page 5




