Tk Tactical (Colorado

Brand Bid

Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg
Price Per Case/Pkg

ETA 4-6 Months
.223 REM 64 gr.Power Point
Knurl
Winchester
RA223R2
1,000
$ 535.00

SilencerCo Precision Delta Corporation Sunrise Holdings LLC) GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Line # Description Qry Uuom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Hornady 5.56 NATO 20/BX GMX
89  53grTAP No Bid $ 0.84 $ 840.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 4-6 Months 5.56
mm 64 gr. Ranger Bonded Solid
Base
Brand Bid Winchester
Product Number RA556B
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000
Price Per Case/Pkg S 840.00
Federal .45Auto 50/BX HST HP
91  230gr No Bid $ 038 $ 380.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 4-6 Months 45
Auto 230 gr. Ranger T Series JHP
Brand Bid Winchester
Product Number RA45T
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000
Price Per Case/Pkg S 380.00
Federal 12ga 5/BX Tac 1oz Ball
92 Slug No Bid S 053 $ 530.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 4-6 Months 12
GA 1 OZ Rifled Slug - Low Recoil
Brand Bid Winchester
Product Number RA12RS15
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000
Price Per Case/Pkg S 530.00
.223 CALIBER, 62 GRAIN PR
223R4 223 REM 62 CLUB PS
93  (1000RD/CASE) No Bid $ 054 $ 535.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid




Tk Tactical (Colorado

SilencerCo Precision Delta Corporation Sunrise Holdings LLC) GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Line # Description Qry UoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Hornady TAP .223 Rem-62 Gr-
Barrier (mfgr# 83285)
97  (1000RD/CASE) No Bid $ 0.84 $ 840.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 4-6 Months
5.56 mm 64 gr. Ranger Bonded
Solid Base
Brand Bid Winchester
Product Number RA556B
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000
Price Per Case/Pkg S 840.00
Winchester 40cal / FMJ / 180
99 grain No Bid S 024 $ 240.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 3-4 Months 40
S&W 180 gr. FMJ
Brand Bid Winchester
Product Number Q4238
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000
Price Per Case/Pkg S 240.00
Winchester 45cal / FMJ / 230
100  8rain No Bid S 027 $ 270.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 4-6 Months 45
Cal 230 gr. FMJ
Brand Bid Winchester
Product Number Q4170
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000
Price Per Case/Pkg S 270.00
Winchester Ranger 40cal
/Bonded JHP / 180 grain
101 (RA40B) No Bid $ 038 $ 375.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 2-4 Months 40

Brand Bid

Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg
Price Per Case/Pkg

S&W 180 gr. Ranger Bonded
JHP
Winchester
RA40B
1,000
S 375.00




Tk Tactical (Colorado

SilencerCo Precision Delta Corporation Sunrise Holdings LLC) GALLS, LLC GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Line # Description Qry UoM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
Winchester Ranger 40cal/
Bonded JHP / 165 grain
102  (RA40BA) No Bid $ 038 $ 375.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid
ETA 4-6 Months 40
S&W 165 gr. Ranger Bonded
JHP
Brand Bid Winchester
Product Number RA40BA
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1,000
Price Per Case/Pkg S 375.00
Winchester Ranger 357/ Bonded
103  JHP /125 grain (RA357SB) No Bid $ 053 $ 525.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid

Brand Bid

Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg
Price Per Case/Pkg

ETA 4-6 Months
357 SIG 125 gr. Ranger Bonded
JHP
Winchester
RA357SB
1,000
S 525.00




