

REVISED - IFB 2019-302 Road Materials, Asphaltic Concrete

PRIMARY AWARD  
SECONDARY AWARD

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	RK Hall LLC			Austin Asphalt			TexasBit		
				Original Bid Price	Renewal - No Price Change	Price with Mileage for pickup	Original Bid Price	Renewal with Price Change	Renewal Price with Mileage for pickup	Original Bid Price	Renewal - No Price Change	Price with Mileage for pickup
1	PICKUP West Zones: Type B	400	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$58.50	\$63.13	\$79.37	\$74.00	\$74.00	\$127.36
2	PICKUP West Zones: Type B with RAP and/or RAS	400	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$50.50	\$55.13	\$71.37	\$64.00	\$64.00	\$117.36
3	PICKUP West Zones: Type C	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$61.50	\$66.13	\$82.37	\$79.00	\$79.00	\$132.36
4	PICKUP West Zones: Type C with RAP and/or RAS	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$53.50	\$58.13	\$74.37	\$69.00	\$69.00	\$122.36
5	PICKUP West Zones: Type D	3000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$62.50	\$67.13	\$83.37	\$79.00	\$79.00	\$132.36
6	PICKUP West Zones: Type D with RAP and/or RAS	3000	ton	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$109.08	\$55.00	\$59.63	\$75.87	\$69.00	\$69.00	\$122.36
7	PICKUP West Zones: Warm Mix	400	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$58.50	\$63.13	\$79.37	\$79.00	\$79.00	\$132.36
8	PICKUP West Zones: High Performance Cold Mix	300	ton	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$154.08	\$100.00	\$104.63	\$120.87	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$163.36
9	PICKUP East Zones: Type B	400	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$58.50	\$63.13	\$99.09	\$74.00	\$74.00	\$116.92
10	PICKUP East Zones: Type B with RAP and/or RAS	400	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$50.50	\$55.13	\$91.09	\$64.00	\$64.00	\$106.92
11	PICKUP East Zones: Type C	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$61.50	\$66.13	\$102.09	\$79.00	\$79.00	\$121.92
12	PICKUP East Zones: Type C with RAP and/or RAS	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$53.50	\$58.13	\$94.09	\$69.00	\$69.00	\$111.92
13	PICKUP East Zones: Type D	4000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$62.50	\$67.13	\$103.09	\$79.00	\$79.00	\$121.92
14	PICKUP East Zones: Type D with RAP and/or RAS	4000	ton	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$90.52	\$55.00	\$59.63	\$95.59	\$69.00	\$69.00	\$111.92
15	PICKUP East Zones: Warm Mix	400	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$58.50	\$63.13	\$99.09	\$79.00	\$79.00	\$121.92
16	PICKUP East Zones: High Performance Cold Mix	300	ton	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$135.52	\$100.00	\$104.63	\$140.59	\$110.00	\$110.00	\$152.92
17	DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$64.51	\$69.57		\$86.50	\$86.50	
18	DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$56.51	\$61.57		\$76.50	\$76.50	
19	DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$67.51	\$72.57		\$91.50	\$91.50	
20	DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$59.51	\$64.57		\$81.50	\$81.50	
21	DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE D	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$68.51	\$73.57		\$91.50	\$91.50	
22	DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$61.01	\$66.07		\$81.50	\$81.50	
23	DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$64.51	\$69.57		\$91.50	\$91.50	
24	DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$56.51	\$61.57		\$81.50	\$81.50	
25	DELIVERED Zone 1: High Performance Cold Mix	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$106.01	\$111.07		\$122.50	\$122.50	
26	DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE B	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$64.51	\$69.57		\$87.00	\$87.00	
27	DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$56.51	\$61.57		\$77.00	\$77.00	
28	DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE C	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$67.51	\$72.57		\$92.00	\$92.00	
29	DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	50	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$59.51	\$64.57		\$82.00	\$82.00	
30	DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE D	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$68.51	\$73.57		\$92.00	\$92.00	
31	DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$60.51	\$65.57		\$82.00	\$82.00	
32	DELIVERED Zone 2: Warm Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$64.51	\$69.57		\$92.00	\$92.00	
33	DELIVERED Zone 2: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$56.51	\$61.57		\$82.00	\$82.00	
34	DELIVERED Zone 2: High Performance Cold Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$106.01	\$111.07		\$123.00	\$123.00	
35	DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE B	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$68.76	\$74.13		\$89.00	\$89.00	
36	DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$60.76	\$66.13		\$79.00	\$79.00	
37	DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE C	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$71.76	\$77.13		\$94.00	\$94.00	
38	DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$63.76	\$69.13		\$84.00	\$84.00	
39	DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE D	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$72.76	\$78.13		\$94.00	\$94.00	
40	DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$65.26	\$70.63		\$84.00	\$84.00	
41	DELIVERED Zone 3: Warm Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		\$68.76	\$74.13		\$94.00	\$94.00	

42	DELIVERED Zone 3: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$60.76</u>	<u>\$66.13</u>	\$84.00	\$84.00
43	DELIVERED Zone 3: High Performance Cold Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$110.26</u>	<u>\$115.63</u>	\$125.00	\$125.00
44	DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE B	10	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$66.49</u>	<u>\$71.70</u>	\$84.50	\$84.50
45	DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	10	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$58.49</u>	<u>\$63.70</u>	\$74.50	\$74.50
46	DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE C	10	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$69.49</u>	<u>\$74.70</u>	\$89.50	\$89.50
47	DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	10	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$61.49</u>	<u>\$66.70</u>	\$79.50	\$79.50
48	DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE D	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$70.49</u>	<u>\$75.70</u>	\$89.50	\$89.50
49	DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$62.99</u>	<u>\$68.20</u>	\$79.50	\$79.50
50	DELIVERED Zone 4: Warm Mix	10	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$66.49</u>	<u>\$71.70</u>	\$89.50	\$89.50
51	DELIVERED Zone 4: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	10	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$58.49</u>	<u>\$63.70</u>	\$79.50	\$79.50
52	DELIVERED Zone 4: High Performance Cold Mix	10	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$107.99</u>	<u>\$113.20</u>	\$120.50	\$120.50
53	DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE B	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$68.29</u>	<u>\$73.62</u>	\$87.50	\$87.50
54	DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$60.29</u>	<u>\$65.62</u>	\$77.50	\$77.50
55	DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE C	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$71.29</u>	<u>\$76.62</u>	\$92.50	\$92.50
56	DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$63.29</u>	<u>\$68.62</u>	\$82.50	\$82.50
57	DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE D	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$72.29</u>	<u>\$77.62</u>	\$92.50	\$92.50
58	DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$64.79</u>	<u>\$70.12</u>	\$82.50	\$82.50
59	DELIVERED Zone 5: Warm Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$68.29</u>	<u>\$73.62</u>	\$92.50	\$92.50
60	DELIVERED Zone 5: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$60.29</u>	<u>\$65.62</u>	\$82.50	\$82.50
61	DELIVERED Zone 5: High Performance Cold Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$109.79</u>	<u>\$115.12</u>	\$123.50	\$123.50
62	DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE B	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$72.11</u>	<u>\$77.72</u>	\$89.00	\$89.00
63	DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$64.11</u>	<u>\$69.72</u>	\$79.00	\$79.00
64	DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE C	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$75.11</u>	<u>\$80.72</u>	\$94.00	\$94.00
65	DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$67.11</u>	<u>\$72.72</u>	\$84.00	\$84.00
66	DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE D	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$76.11</u>	<u>\$81.72</u>	\$94.00	\$94.00
67	DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$68.61</u>	<u>\$74.22</u>	\$84.00	\$84.00
68	DELIVERED Zone 6: Warm Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$72.11</u>	<u>\$77.72</u>	\$94.00	\$94.00
69	DELIVERED Zone 6: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$64.11</u>	<u>\$69.72</u>	\$84.00	\$84.00
70	DELIVERED Zone 6: High Performance Cold Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$113.61</u>	<u>\$119.22</u>	\$125.00	\$125.00
71	DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE B	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$69.37</u>	<u>\$74.78</u>	\$86.50	\$86.50
72	DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$61.37</u>	<u>\$66.78</u>	\$76.50	\$76.50
73	DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE C	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$72.37</u>	<u>\$77.78</u>	\$91.50	\$91.50
74	DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$64.37</u>	<u>\$69.78</u>	\$81.50	\$81.50
75	DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE D	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$73.37</u>	<u>\$78.78</u>	\$91.50	\$91.50
76	DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$65.87</u>	<u>\$71.28</u>	\$81.50	\$81.50
77	DELIVERED Zone 7: Warm Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$69.37</u>	<u>\$74.78</u>	\$91.50	\$91.50
78	DELIVERED Zone 7: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$61.37</u>	<u>\$66.78</u>	\$81.50	\$81.50
79	DELIVERED Zone 7: High Performance Cold Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$110.87</u>	<u>\$116.28</u>	\$122.50	\$122.50
80	DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$74.04</u>	<u>\$79.79</u>	\$89.00	\$89.00
81	DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS	500	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$66.04</u>	<u>\$71.79</u>	\$79.00	\$79.00
82	DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$77.04</u>	<u>\$82.79</u>	\$94.00	\$94.00
83	DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$69.04</u>	<u>\$74.79</u>	\$84.00	\$84.00
84	DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE D	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$78.04</u>	<u>\$83.79</u>	\$94.00	\$94.00
85	DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS	1000	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$70.54</u>	<u>\$76.29</u>	\$84.00	\$84.00
86	DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$74.04</u>	<u>\$79.79</u>	\$94.00	\$94.00
87	DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$66.04</u>	<u>\$71.79</u>	\$84.00	\$84.00
88	DELIVERED Zone 8: High Performance Cold Mix	100	ton	No Bid	No Bid		<u>\$115.54</u>	<u>\$121.29</u>	\$125.00	\$125.00

PICKUP - 5651 HWY 224, East Greenville, TX 75401 Approx 76 miles roundtrip for West Zones \$44.08 IRS tax rate and 44 miles roundtrip for East Zones \$25.52 IRS tax rate	PICKUP - 11481 County Rd 53, Celina, TX 75009 Approx 28 miles roundtrip for West Zones \$16.24 IRS tax rate and approx 62 miles roundtrip for East Zones \$35.96 IRS tax rate	PICKUP - 4601 Scyene Rd, Sunnyvale, TX 75182 Approx 92 miles roundtrip for West Zones \$53.36 IRS tax rate and 74 miles roundtrip for East Zones \$42.92 IRS tax rate
---	---	---