COOP 2021-344 Fleet Parts & Supplies: Utilizing TIPS cooperative contract

Not all parts and supplies (brands/sizes) the County purchases are listed. This represents sample pricing only. O'REILLY ADVANCE AUTO AUTOZONE
TIPS #180603 OMNIA #2017000280 OMNIA #R170201

Bulb, Wagner orEikoPart #1157 or Collin County Approved Equal. (BOX OF 10) S 1.76 | $ 440 S 2.09
Bulb, Wagner or EikoPart #3157 or Collin County Approved Equal. (BOX OF 10) S 4.09 | S 6.60 | S 3.09
Bulb, Wagner Part #97 or Collin County Approved Equal. (BOX OF 10) S 2.02|$ 290 | $ 2.09
Headlamp, Wagner Part #194 or Collin County Approved Equal. (BOX OF 10) S 157 | $ 330 S 1.09
Glass Cleaner, 19 oz. aerosol can,Gunk Part #GC1 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 349 | $ 4.59 No Bid
Protectant, 10 oz spray bottle, Armorall Part #11080 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 499 | S 5.50 No Bid
Degreaser/Tar Remover, 16 oz. aerosol can, Quest Specialty ChargePart #2050r Collin County Approved Equal. S 269 | $ 4.59 No Bid

Hand Cleaner, pumice, 7.5 fl. oz., Fast Orange Part #25108 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 359 (S 2.75 No Bid
Windshield Washer Solvent, 1 gallon container, SplashPart #2940 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 299 | $ 3.21 No Bid

Paint, GrayPrimer, Indoor/Outdoor, 12 oz. aerosol can, Krylon Part #9205, Pastikote M18, or Collin County Approved Equal. S 849 | S 6.43 No Bid

Paint, White, Indoor/Outdoor, 12 oz. aerosol can, Krylon Part #1501, Pastikote M4, or Collin County Approved Equal. S 8.49 No Bid No Bid

Paint, Black Gloss, Indoor/Outdoor, 12 oz. aerosol can, Krylon 51601, Pasti-Kote Part #T1, or Collin County Approved Equal. S 849 | S 6.89 No Bid
De-Icer, 100z. aerosolcan, Johnsen Part#3282 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 299 | $ 4.13 No Bid

Carb Spray Cleaner,20 oz. aerosol can with extension attachment, Berryman B12 Part #01200 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 569 (S 5.05 No Bid

Brake Cleaner, 19 oz aerosol can with nozzle extension, Berryman Part #1420, or Collin County Approved Equal. S 599 | $ 2.84 No Bid

Brake Fluid, Dot 3, 12 fl. oz., Johnsen Part #Tec2212 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 224 |S 5.97 No Bid

Power Steering Fluid, 32 fl. oz., Johnsen Part #4610 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 599 | $ 5.05 No Bid

Motor Treatment, 16 fl. oz, Sea Foam Part #SF16 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 8.09 | $ 11.03 No Bid

Oil Filter, Hastings #LF110, Premium Guard #PG4651F, Wix #51372or Collin County Approved Equal. S 430 (S 3.14 | $ 2.79
QOil Filter, Hastings #LF410F, Federated #PG4476F,Wix #51394, Premium Guard #PG44760r Collin County Approved Equal. S 42215S 3.14 | S 2.79
QOil Filter, Hastings Part #LF157 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 10.15 | $ 3.14 | $ 2.79
Oil Filter, Hastings Part #LF558, Wix #573120r Collin County Approved Equal. S 17.50 | $ 13.99 | $ 7.39
Qil Filter, Wix #57502 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 435 (S 3.14 | $ 3.49
Oil Filter, Wix Part #57151 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 14.96 | $ 11.89 | S 4.79
Fuel Filter, Hastings Part #FF1166, Wix #339630r Collin County Approved Equal. S 4232 |S 33.24 (S 27.99
Air Filter, Motorcraft #FA1754, Hastings #AF26131, Wix #46804or Collin County Approved Equal. S 15.94 | $ 1049 | $ 7.99
Air Filter, Cabin, Wix Part #24068 or Collin County approved equal S 6.65 | $ 472 7.79
Air Filter, Wix #46935 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 8.18 | S 6.29 | $ 7.99
Wiper Blade, 22", Trico Part #31-220 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 349 | $ 10.04 | $ 17.69
Wiper Blade, 22",Bosch C2207 or Collin County Approved Equal. Must fit Ford Explorer and Taurus. S 9.59 | $ 18.00 | $ 17.69
BATTERIES: Battery, BCl group 65 top post, 12 volt, 860 CCA @ 32 degrees F; 650 CCA @ 0 degrees F, Super Start 65-PRMor Collin County Approved Equal $ 89.28 | S 116.57 | S 119.69
Battery, BCI group 31, stud post, 12 volt, 1190 CCA @ 32 degrees F; 1000 CCA @ 0 degrees F, Super Start 31-5Tor Collin County Approved Equal. S 92.15 | $ 82.40 | Does not meet spec
Universal Tire Repair Patch,2 1/4" Diameter, 25 per package,Wurth Part #18796218 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 7.72 No Bid No Bid
Universal Tire Repair Patch,3 1/8" Diameter,10 per package,Wurth Part #087963 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 4.00 | S 19.54 No Bid

Plug Patch Cement,8 oz. can,Wurth Part #0893830 or Collin County Approved Equal. S 294 | $ 8.49 No Bid

Tire Mounting Paste,11 pound container,Wurth Part #08901221 or Collin County Approved Equal. No Bid S 24.64 No Bid
P-Series steel wheel weights, .25 oz., package of 100. S 1160 | $ 35.32 No Bid
P-Series steel wheel weights, .5 oz., package of 100. S 17.24 | S 23.78 No Bid
P-Series steel wheel weights,1 oz., package of 100. S 31.00 | S 41.64 No Bid
| SAMPLE TOTAL: $ 481.23 ] $ 558.83 | |
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