IFB 2021-274 HVAC OAU and Heat Exchanger Replacements

Infinity Contractors International,

Denali Construction Services LP

Air Conditioning Innovative

CEC Facilities Group

Ltd. Solutions, Inc.
Total Price $139,172.00 Total Price $152,106.04 Total Price $180,147.26 Total Price $270,883.00
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Location: JJAEP FacilityGrand Total 1 job $90,255.00 $90,255.00 $83,309.04 $83,309.04 $86,664.92 $86,664.92 $215,883.00 $215,883.00
1.1  Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $76,086.12 $69,222.04 $67,979.38 $75,000.00
1.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $14,168.88 $13,787.00 $18,685.54 $140,883.00
1.3 Trade-in Value for three (3) existing McQuayLAH CHW/HW Outside 1 lump sum |No Bid $300.00 No Bid No Bid
2 Location: Collin County Justice Center Facility Grand Total 1 job $48,917.00 $48,917.00 $68,797.00 $68,797.00 $93,482.34 $93,482.34 $55,000.00 $55,000.00
2.1  Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $42,951.87 $50,972.04 $77,936.52 $29,000.00
2.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $5,965.13 $17,324.96 $15,545.82 $26,000.00
2.3 Trade-in value for one (1) existing AHU (AHU-8)specified in section 1 lump sum [No Bid $500.00 No Bid No Bid
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