IFB 2021-233 Road Materials, Emulsified Asphalts

3 Aeeroximate Distance from Mc&nnev TX 75071

100 Asphalt Lane, Shepherd, Texas 77371
260 miles

75455
105 miles

PRIMARY
SECONDARY
LINE 7 AWARD
P Squared Emulsion . Wright Asphalt
Cleveland Asphalt q Plants. LLC Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc. & P
ants,
Products, Inc. ) Products Co. LLC
Total Price| $1,405,550.00] Total Price $1,418,060.00] Total Price| $1,673,280.00] Total Price| $1,727,050.00]
Line # Description QTY Uuom Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 CRS-2TR --- Delivered 15000 gallon [No Bid No Bid No Bid $2.50 $37,500.00]
1 Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons for delivery of this
product. Yes, but LTL loads can be shipped
1 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state that number. 5500
Cost per gallon for Collin County to pick up this product at your plant
location. $2.20
1 Plant Location Address: 1505 Custer Road, Brownwood, TX 76801
1 AEEroximate Distance from Mc_Kir\r\ey TX 75071 171 miles
2 CRS-2 --- Delivered 165000 gallon $2.18 $359,700.00]No Bid $2.37 $391,050.00] $2.45 $404,250.00]
Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons for delivery of this IDeIivered price is based on minimum 5000 No minimum. Freight, however, is based on a
product. gallon load full transport load of 5,500 gallons. Yes, but LTL loads can be shipped
2 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state that number. 5000 A full transport load is 5,500 gallons. 5500
Cost per gallon for Collin County to pick up this product at your plant
location. $ 1.95 o) 2.20 $2.15
) 209 Robert Nance Road, Mount Pleasant, Texas
2 Plant Location Address: 100 Asphalt Lane, Shepherd, Texas 77371 75455 1505 Custer Road, Brownwood, TX 76801
2 Aeeroximate Distance from Mc&nney TX 75071 260 miles 105 miles 171 miles
No Bid - per bid clarification (bid
CRS-2H --- Delivered 400000 gallon $2.18 $872,000.00] alternate item only) $2.37 $948,000.00] $2.45 $980,000.00]
Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons for delivery of this IDeIivered price is based on minimum 5000 No minimum. Freight, however, is based on a
product. gallon load full transport load of 5,500 gallons. Yes, but LTL loads can be shipped
3 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state that number. 5000 A full transport load is 5,500 gallons. 5500
Cost per gallon for Collin County to pick up this product at your plant
location. § 1.95 $ 2.20 $2.15
3 Plant Location Address: 209 Robert Nance Road, Mount Pleasant, Texas

1505 Custer Road, Brownwood, TX 76801
171 miles

No Bid - per bid clarification (bid

CSS-1H --- Delivered 17000 gallon $2.18 $37,060.00] alternate item only) $2.52 $42,840.00] $2.45 $41,650.00]
Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons for delivery of this Delivered price is based on minimum 5000 No minimum. Freight, however, is based on a
product. Igallon load full transport load of 5,500 gallons. Yes, but LTL loads can be shipped
4 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state that number. 5000 A full transport load is 5,500 gallons. 5500
Cost per gallon for Collin County to pick up this product at your plant
location. § 1.95 S 235 $2.15
4 Plant Location Address: 209 Robert Nance Road, Mount Pleasant, Texas
100 Asphalt Lane, Shepherd, Texas 77371 75455 1505 Custer Road, Brownwood, TX 76801
4 Aeeroximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071 260 miles 105 miles 171 miles
Dust Control Qil, CSS-1S or Collin County approved No Bid - per bid clarification (bid No Bid - per bid clarification
equal --- Delivered 105000 gallon $1.03 $108,150.00Q alternate item only) $2.42 $254,100.00]  (bid alternate item only)
Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons for delivery of this Delivered price is based on minimum 5000 No minimum. Freight, however, is based on a
product. Igallon load full transport load of 5,500 gallons.
5 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state that number. 5000 A full transport load is 5,500 gallons.
Cost per gallon for Collin County to pick up this product at your plant
location. § 0.80 S 2.25
5 Plant Location Address: 209 Robert Nance Road, Mount Pleasant, Texas
100 Asphalt Lane, Shepherd, Texas 77371 75455
5 Aeeroximate Distance from Mc&nnev TX 75071 260 miles 105 miles
No Bid - per bid clarification (bid
AE-P --- Delivered 12000 gallon $2.38 $28,560.00] alternate item only) $3.10 $37,200.00fNo Bid
Please state if there is a minimum number of gallons for delivery of this Delivered price is based on minimum 5000 No minimum. Freight, however, is based on a
product. Igallon load full transport load of 5,500 gallons.
6 If there is a minimum number of gallons, please state that number. 5000 A full transport load is 5,500 gallons.
Cost per gallon for Collin County to pick up this product at your plant
location. § 2.15 S 295

DRAFT ONLY UNTIL AWARD




6

Plant Location Address:

6 Aeeroximate Distance from McKinney, TX 75071

100 Asphalt Lane, Shepherd, Texas 77371
260 miles

600 Minton Road, Saginaw, Texas 76179
64 miles

Cost for per hour demurrage charges beyond the three

(3) hours included in the quoted delivery cost 1 hour $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $80.00 $90.00 $90.00 $100.00 $100.00
ALTERNATE BID PRODUCTS
ALT1-3 iP2 CWE-2 (Alternate Product) P Squared Delivered 3000 gallon $2.99 S 8,970.00
ALT2-4 iP2S1 (Alternate Product) P Squared Delivered 3000 gallon $2.69 S 8,070.00
ALT3-5 :lLucky 7 (Alternate Product) P Squared Delivered 3000 gallon $1.45 S 4,350.00
ALT4-5 :TR FOG ( Alternate Product) Wright Asphalt Delivered 5500 gallon $2.51 $  13,805.00
ALT5-6 iP2RTU (Alternate Product) P Squared Delivered 3000 gallon $2.00 S 6,000.00
ALT6-0 iCHFRS-2P (Alternate Product) Ergon Asphalt Delivered 5500 gallon $2.77 $  15,235.00
A notice of 24 hours before 3pm of the
Delivery in Calendar Days from Date of Order: previous day, but 2-3 days is preferred. 2 business days 1 day 1 day - 24 hours

Supplier Notes:

Line 5 - Price is based on a (30% CSS-1 /
70% H20). Diluted material can not be
returned for credit.

Minimum 3000 gallons; Plant location 516
South McLennan Loop, EIm Mott, TX, 120
miles

Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff.
Pump and hose charge is $90.00 per load. For
equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may
charge up to $400.00.

Demurrage only allows two (2) hours.
Minimum pickup at plant is 750 gallons.
Submitted delivered prices are based on full
transport truck loads. Less than transport
trucks can be delivered at CPU price plus
$1800 outgoing freight per load;
Cancellation policy: Monday delivery
cancelled by 11am on prior Sunday, loads
to be delivered during the week cancelled
by 2pm prior workday; Loads cancelled in
transit will be billed at cost; Returned loads
will be billed an additional one-half
outgoing freight (diluted products can not
be returned); Returned loads require
notice; Pump charge $100 per load (If
requested - not provided for hot asphalts);
Diversion fee $75 per additional stop plus
additional miles; Layover charge $650 per
truck per night.
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