

Office of the Purchasing Agent 2300 Bloomdale Road Suite 3160 McKinney, Texas 75071 www.collincountytx.gov

#### COLLIN COUNTY, TEXAS

ADDENDUM No. One (1) IFB No. 2021-239

#### **INVITATION FOR BID**

FOR

### CONSTRUCTION, COLLIN COUNTY ADULT DETENTION FACILITY, PHASE 1 ADDITION

DATE: AUGUST 4, 2021

NOTICE TO ALL PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS:

PLEASE MAKE THE FOLLOWING CHANGES TO THE INVITATION FOR BID:

ADD DOCUMENT: 7/28/2021 PRE-BID CONFERENCE SIGN-IN SHEET

ADD DOCUMENT: 8/4/2021 SITE-WALK SIGN-IN SHEET

ADD ATTRIBUTE: #20-ADDENDUM No. 1 ACKNOWLEDGEMENT

DELETE DOCUMENT: SECTION 004100-BID FORM

REPLACE WITH: SECTION 004100-BID FORM ADDENDUM 1

ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE BID AND SPECIFICATIONS REMAIN THE SAME.

SINCERELY,

MICHELLE CHARNOSKI, NIGP-CPP, CPPB

**PURCHASING AGENT** 

**JDG** 



Project:

Facilitator:

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention

Facility, Phase 1 Addition

J.D. Griffin

**Meeting Date:** 

July 28, 2021

Place/Room:

Adult Detention Facility Training Room

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
MIKE GREEN	NORTHRIDGE	817.520.2300	BIDS @ NORTHRIDGE CG. COM
(ith Young	ActoTech	972 342 9151	chyp neutotech systems & come
Andrew Micklitz	Lee Lewis Construction	214-399-1585	amicklitz colee lewis. com
FLOYD HAMILTON	CML SECURITY	210.240.9375	fhamilton @ cmlsecurity.us
Zach Greene	53	210.317.9479	zgreene@53der.com
Caleb Beets	Tegrity Considers	972.327.5220	calet Otessity-Contractors. Con
DAVE RITZ	Tegrity Consultars	817.831.2245	bids cosedalco.com
John Farrow	Λ	469.739.0040	> Farrow of Copelang-INC, COM
Dick Riski	Heritage On Rating In	214 395 6168	Nick Oheritageour josting.com
Adrienne Brunfield		5 469 661 9005	Adrienne @ Abventuredesigns, com
Durien Likword	1	1116	Adriennes Abventue designs com
MICHAEL SEPULIADO	SHERECES OFFICE	972-547-5299	

CHERSTORMON PERSONCEM COURS COURT SHEMESSORECE 972-549-5216

CPERSONAL CONDONAT TILLES



Project:

Facilitator:

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

Place/Room:

**Meeting Date:** 

July 28, 2021

J.D. Griffin

Adult Detention Facility Training Room

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
SCAN FIXEGAN	STAR Asser Secunt	214-499-7719	SFINEGAN @ Secure Hunking Com
Mike Thist prout	Ster Aset Sound	469.585.7267	Mike TO Sware Husky Com
DAKEN. 1 KATON	CMC	210-440-3100	DKATON@ Consecupity. US
MIKE MORN	CML	210-708-5883	MINORAN @CMLSEURITEUS
Froyd Honocran	CMI		
Jasgn Haralson	5+1	972-753-6342	dfwbids @ satpon.com
Rodany lbrod	Videotex	972-231-9200	hood a Video-texsystan.com
Dake Buck		817 3411 0966	Buck @ Videotex Systems. com
SPIAN HOLDEN	Videotex Systems Sustainable SECURITY SOLUTIONS	817627 7278	SHOWER @ SIDET.COM
Brandon Clayton	Family First veterap Lawn & Landscape DM I technologies	940 282 9/23	Brandon. m. Clayton Q Hotmail. Com
Spencei Throne beix	DM 1 technologies		5 throneber 146 Oml techinc. com
Tracey Wilson	BSW	#3972-960.9970	twilson ebsw-architects.com



**Project:** 

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

Meeting Date:

July 28, 2021

Facilitator:

J.D. Griffin

Place/Room:

Adult Detention Facility Training Room

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
STANUEY MORECHA) Richard Huddleston	Texas State Utilities	214-784-1652	TXBSTTTAATUUGER P. COM
Dhiran Gin	Service FireInc	925-4348727	giri & Service fireInc. (am
2 AUB Alum Z	kmsh secasx	972-571-212m	DAGES S @ Emoly Secretor. Com
Mitch Lea	Knight Security	214-577-4374	MLEQ Knight Security . com
OSCAR ARANDA	Ad It Concrete Services	469 - 285 - 9839	Oscar Qa-hourrefe services.com
TREVOR HARRISON	AdH Concrete Service	903-647-7565	Trevor Qa- h concrete services.com
Travis Walker	JE-Dona	806-239-5959	travis Walker O Jedons. Co
CHAD PERRY	Precision Demolitian	469. 328.6743	CHMD. PERRY Precision DEMolition. com
mess roga	Stonhard	713-8284802	matthew. no gan @ Stonhard. com
John SANDERSON	A FIRE AND SECURITY	817-205-1568	louis @ Afile AND Security, Com
CHARLES GOODHAN	BSW ARCH	44.608.8582	cgoodman@bsw-architects.com



Project:

Facilitator:

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention

Facility, Phase 1 Addition

J.D. Griffin

**Meeting Date:** 

July 28, 2021

Place/Room:

Adult Detention Facility Training Room

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
Loke Steroien	Adolfson + Peterson	214878 1973	Istenoienea-p.com
Chris Perry	Stell Constanters.	972-432-9969	estimating estel fanstrutors. um
BRITTANY FANARA	NATIONS ROOF	214-557-1911	BFANARARNATIONSROOF. COM
Loren Shipman	Carboline/Dudick	972-877-3596	Ishipman @carboline. com
Mike Walls	Mc Grough conds	97277/1241	michael, Wallsome Gough, com
Jessica Swafford	McGough Const.	469-992-5183	Michael, Walls & Mc Gough, Com Jessica. Swefford@mcgough. Com
Brod DENLAR	PPG-PAINT	214-536-7373	brad . Dencevepp6. com
Zta Jorsonglou	PPG - Paint 9	72-482-0640	JORDANDGLOUG ppg.com
Landon Mecker	SR) Construction	817596 96w	Imeeker@jrjinc.com
Clayton Kongable	Imperial Construction	617-341-8886	estimating aimperial construction com
Neha Dugal	Batson Cook	617-593-5755	ndugal @ batson-cook.com
Brad Harris	Collin County	(214) 205-7322	bjharrisé co collin. tx.us
J.D. Griffin	Collin County		



Project:

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

Meeting Date:

August 4, 2021

Facilitator:

J.D. Griffin

Place/Room:

Adult Detention Facility

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
MINE MORAN	CUL SECURITY	210-708-5883	MMORANDEM SUURITY, US
Milhael Dutcher	Purtnevald Ploor Care	^ \	michael@puremeraldfloorcare.com
Javier Vela	Vela B. Pintins Inc		géhnovalabrosgiat. Com
CHARLES GOODHAN	BSW AREH	214-608-8582	cgoodman @ psw-sphiteetr.com
GARM ADRESMAN		ь	gheana
Bill Harris	AFP6	214-797-4017	bill-harris@ afpqusq.us
Clayton Kongable	Imperial	817-341-8886	estimating Cimperial-construction con
Edily Prive	Allied	903-450-7173	bolly price Danser and
Andrew Micklitz	4401	214-399-1585	anicklitaelectenis. com
Ellis Bittner	JCI	469-431-4291	ellis. bittherejci.com
Chock Dail	TOR	903 754-8430	_
Steve Abrilop	ESSENTIAL NEWOFIL	469 867 7838	saguilar a essential network-lan



**Project:** 

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

**Meeting Date:** 

August 4, 2021

Facilitator:

J.D. Griffin

Place/Room:

**Adult Detention Facility** 

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
Mitch Lee	Knight Security	214-577-4374	MLee @ Knight Security. com
Page Bleakley	Climatec	214998 0643	phleakley aclimatecion
Jared Bellamy	Tree New al	817-307-6176	j. bellany @ treenewal . com
NATE PEEL	CASTRO ROOFING	214 701 0475	ESTEMATING @ CASTRO ROOFING, COM
TOM KACHAPPILLY	BATSON COOK CONSTR	682 283 5758	tkachappilhebdson-cost.com
Jim Rimoz	Briditectural System	469-712.8238	Jim @ Anditectural Systems org
Jim Rimoz Neha Dugal	Batson Cook	6175935755	ndugal @ batson - cook. com
Kelly Smith	All Tech Bectric	214-842-6104	KSmith@alltechllc.com
Amon Mc Council	Velex SI	703-946-1954	anon. Monnel Q velex si. com
Barely Bolz	Double Bronze Stor	913-206-6193	ranely @ double bronze star, com
DAVERITZ	SEPALCO	817-831-2248	bids c sedal co- com
Decemy Hainell	Sedalco	817-996-1070	bids@Sedalco.com

THE DEMO CONJAN 469 879 9467

COLIN @ THEDEMO CONTANT. COM



Project:

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

**Meeting Date:** 

August 4, 2021

Facilitator:

J.D. Griffin

Place/Room:

**Adult Detention Facility** 

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
Gliase Doken	Literary Demo	714-733-1343	chasealiberty denotition .com
Athy Olm	Jugaessive	214-399-9098	Anthon, Olver ( Deogressive
RICK SERRASNO	St TERRYZZO	972-824-9494	rserrance serranofunkterrazza
CHRIS DAXIS	AZTECA ENTERPRISES	(214) 905-0612	CDAXIS @ AZTECA OMEGA, COM
Jewel Burleson	Polk Mechanical	A697504-8827	jewel. burleson @ polk mechanical.co
Try Gilbert	Tida Refay	214 602 5732	tigo Hu docha - Tr. com
taskin Con	JIC	214-791-220	tino C 6686@ Jecloud. con
J Sidra	عاد	214-549-0329	JIC Concrete Olive, Com 14C Concrete AL D. Com
Ryan Clark	557	214.769-66591	dfwbiols@setpon.com
BRIAN HALE	A DOLFSON E. PETERSON	214-662-4065	txestimating@a-p.com
Christian Lamb	Adolfron + Peterson	972-421 5517	TXEstimating @ a-p.com
August Mones	AGE QUALITY FINEAU	903-243.8421	MA MUNITA @ ACCOUNTING FOREME.
Thip White	JEBCO ENAUTY FRENCHE	903-243-8421	Chip P Selshidingsisa-im com



Project:

Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

**Meeting Date:** 

August 4, 2021

Facilitator:

J.D. Griffin

Place/Room:

**Adult Detention Facility** 

Name	Company	Phone	E-Mail
Hasan Mustofa	Air 819	469-583-5008	hasan@air817.com
Nelsa trugal	Batson Cook	6175935755	ndugal @ batson - cook com
matt morgan	Stonhard	713-828-4802	Matthew. morgana Stonhard, can
Grag Rice	Imperial Fin	817-993-6427	gra @ Imperial Ep. com
The			
JIM PAMOZ	Architetural Systems	469-712-8238	Sine Architectural Systems. org
13.11 13010	cc	772-547-5340	Wharkee co. collinity. US
Charson Poneral	Co. N Cours Snowees Offee	972-547-5216	C 8c26122WDC20027178.C.
Brad Harris	Collin County	(972)547-5492	bjharrise co, collis, txus
J. D. Griffin	Collin County		J

## Section 004100-Bid Form Addendum 1



## 2021-239 Addendum 1

# Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

Issue Date: 7/13/2021

Questions Deadline: 8/20/2021 12:00 PM (CT) Response Deadline: 8/26/2021 02:00 PM (CT)

Collin County Purchasing

## **Contact Information**

Contact: JD Griffin, CPPB Senior Buyer

Address: Purchasing

Admin. Building

Ste. 3160

2300 Bloomdale Rd.

Ste. 3160

McKinney, TX 75071

Phone: (972) 548-4116 Fax: (972) 548-4694

Email: jgriffin@co.collin.tx.us

## **Event Information**

Number: 2021-239 Addendum 1

Title: Construction, Collin County Adult Detention Facility, Phase 1 Addition

Type: Invitation for Bid - Construction

Issue Date: 7/13/2021

Question Deadline: 8/20/2021 12:00 PM (CT) Response Deadline: 8/26/2021 02:00 PM (CT)

Notes: SCOPE OF WORK INCLUDES all materials, labor, equipment and services to

produce or be incorporated in such construction. Contract will be a general contract for an addition of approximately 97,000 square feet to an existing adult detention facility which includes a new vehicular sallyport, book-in and inmate processing, a 180 bed orientation housing unit, connection corridor to the existing building, and

associated renovations in the existing facility; and related sitework.

Log in to view bid documents.

## **Ship To Information**

Address: Adult Detention Facility

4300 Community Ave. McKinney, TX 75071

## **Billing Information**

Address: Auditor

Admin. Building Ste. 3100

2300 Bloomdale Rd.

Ste. 3100

McKinney, TX 75071

### **Bid Activities**

#### Pre-Bid Conference and Site-Walk

7/28/2021 10:00:00 AM (CT)

A PRE-BID CONFERENCE and SITE-WALK will be held by Collin County on Wednesday, July 28, 2021 at 10:00 AM at Collin County Adult Detention Facility Training Room (meet in lobby), 4300 Community Ave., McKinney, TX 75071 in order for bidders to ask questions regarding the proposed work and view the jobsite. It is the bidder's responsibility to review the site and documents to gain a full understanding of the requirements of the bid.

Site-Walk 8/4/2021 10:00:00 AM (CT)

A SITE-WALK will be held by Collin County on Wednesday, August 4, 2021 at 10:00 AM at Collin County Adult Detention Facility (meet under the archway between buildings), 4300 Community Ave., McKinney, TX 75071 in order for bidders to view the jobsite.

## **Bid Attachments**

Addendum 1 2021-239.pdf

**View Online** 

Addendum 1

7-28-21\_Pre-Bid Conference Sign-In Sheet.pdf

**View Online** 

7-28-21 Pre-Bid Conference Sign-In Sheet

8-4-21\_Site-Walk Sign-In Sheet.pdf

**View Online** 

8-4-21 Site-Walk Sign-In Sheet

LEGAL\_NOTICE\_IFB\_2021-239.doc

Download

Legal Notice

PROJECT MANUAL\_2021-239.pdf **View Online Project Manual CVR - COVER SHEET.pdf View Online Drawing Cover Sheet View Online** 02 Civil-Landscape Drawings.pdf Civil-Landscape Drawings 03 Structural Drawings.pdf **View Online** Structural Drawings 04 Architecture Drawings.pdf **View Online Architecture Drawings View Online** 05 Detention Drawings.pdf **Detention Drawings View Online** 06 Plumbing Drawings.pdf **Plumbing Drawings** 07 Fire Protection Drawings.pdf **View Online** Fire Protection Drawings 08 Mechanical Drawings.pdf **View Online** Mechanical Drawings 09 Electrical Drawings.pdf **View Online Electrical Drawings** 09 Tech Drawings.pdf **View Online Tech Drawings** 10 Security Drawings.pdf **View Online Security Drawings** 201254 - 2018 IECC - Lighting COMCheck - Bid Set.pdf **View Online** Lighting COMCheck 201254 - 2018 IECC - Mechanical COMCheck - Signed 2021.04.09.pdf **View Online** Mechanical COMCheck 201254 - Drawing Sheet List Bid Set.pdf **View Online Drawing Sheet List** 

Requested Attachments

**Conflict of Interest Questionnaire** 

W-9

(Attachment required)

#### **Bid Bond**

(Attachment required)

BID SECURITY: All Bidders must submit, prior to the bid opening time, a Certified Check, Cashier's Check or acceptable Bid Bond payable without recourse to Collin County in the amount of not less than five percent (5%) of the total bid plus alternates as submitted.

- 1. Bid Bond, certified check or Cashier's Check may be mailed or delivered to the Office of the Collin County Purchasing Agent, Collin County Administration Building, 2300 Bloomdale Road, Ste 3160, McKinney, TX 75071 and shall be delivered in an envelope, marked plainly on the outside with the Bid Name and Number.
- 2. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountytx.ionwave.net

Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid opening time to be considered. Failure to submit a copy of bid security prior to bid opening shall be cause for rejection of bid.

The original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later than close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be cause for rejection of bid.

## **Bid Attributes**

1	eBid Notice  Collin County exclusively uses IonWave Technologies, Inc. (Collin County eBid) for the notification and dissemination of all solicitations. The receipt of solicitations through any other means may result in your receipt of incomplete specifications and/or addendums which could ultimately render your bid/proposal non-compliant. Collin County accepts no responsibility for the receipt and/or notification of solicitations through any other means. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
2	Contact Information
	List the contact name, email address and phone number of the main person(s) Collin County should contact in reference to this solicitation. Contact(s) shall be duly authorized by the company, corporation, firm, partnership or individual to respond to any questions, clarification, and or offers in response to this solicitation.  (Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
3	Calendar Days Bid
	Please state the consecutive calendar days bid from notice to proceed through completion of project.  (Required: Numbers only)
4	Exceptions
	Do you take exception to the specifications? If so, by separate attachment, please state your exceptions.  Yes No (Required: Check only one)

5	Bonding Requirement Acknowledgement  I understand that the bonding requirements of this solicitation are required and are included in the submitted pricing. A bond certificate (payment, performance, and/or maintenance) as stated in the specification document shall be submitted to the Purchasing department if I am awarded all or a portion of the resulting contract. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
6	Incurrence Askraculadecement Construction/Dublic Monte
6	Insurance Acknowledgement – Construction/Public Works  I understand that the insurance requirements of this solicitation are required and are included in the submitted pricing. The Contractor shall furnish certificates of insurance for both the Contractor and any subcontractor to the Purchasing department if awarded all or a portion of the resulting contract. Please initial.
	(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
	· · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · · ·
7	State the business name of all subcontractors and the type of work they will be performing under this contract. If you are fully qualified to self-perform the entire contract, please respond with "Not Applicable-Self Perform".
	(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
8	Reference No. 1  List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as stated herein, have been provided. Texas references preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact, Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail.
	(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

9	Reference No. 2
	List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as stated herein, have been provided. Texas references preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact, Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail.
	(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
1 0	Reference No. 3  List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as stated herein, have been provided. Texas references preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact, Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail.
	(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
1	Preferential Treatment
1	The County of Collin, as a governmental agency of the State of Texas, may not award a contract to a nonresident bidder unless the nonresident's bid is lower than the lowest bid submitted by a responsible Texas resident bidder by the same amount that a Texas resident bidder would be required to underbid a nonresident bidder to obtain a comparable contract in the state in which the nonresident's principal place of business is located (Government Code, Title 10, V.T.C.A., Chapter 2252, Subchapter A).
	<ol> <li>Is your principal place of business in the State of Texas?</li> <li>If your principal place of business is not in Texas, in which State is your principal place of business?</li> <li>If your principal place of business is not in Texas, does your state favor resident bidders (bidders in your state) by some dollar increment or percentage?</li> <li>If your state favors resident bidders, state by what dollar amount or percentage.</li> </ol>
	(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
4	
1 2	Debarment Certification  I certify that neither my company nor an owner or principal of my company has been debarred, suspended or otherwise made ineligible for participation in Federal Assistance programs under Executive Order 12549, "Debarment and Suspension," as described in the Federal Register and Rules and Regulations. Please initial.
	(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1 3	I declare and affirm that my company is in compliance with the Immigration and Reform Act of 1986 and all employees are legally eligible to work in the United States of America. I further understand and acknowledge that any non-compliance with the Immigration and Reform Act of 1986 at any time during the term of this contract will render the contract voidable by Collin County. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
14	Disclosure of Certain Relationships  Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code requires that any vendor considering doing business with a local government entity disclose the vendor's affiliation or business relationship that might cause a conflict of interest with a local government entity. Subchapter 6 of the code requires a vendor to file a conflict of interest questionnaire (CIQ) if a conflict exists. By law this questionnaire must be filed with the records administrator of Collin County no later than the 7th business day after the date the vendor becomes aware of an event that requires the statement to be filed. A vendor commits an offense if the vendor knowingly violates the code. An offense under this section is a misdemeanor. By submitting a response to this request, the vendor represents that it is in compliance with the requirements of Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code. Please send completed forms to the Collin County County Clerk's Office located at 2300 Bloomdale Rd., Suite 2104, McKinney, TX 75071. Please initial.
	(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
1 5	Anti-Collusion Statement  Bidder certifies that its Bid/Proposal is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any corporation, firm, or person submitting a Bid/Proposal for the same materials, services, supplies, or equipment and
	is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation, return of materials or discontinuation of services and the possible removal from bidders list. Please initial.
	is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation,
166	is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation, return of materials or discontinuation of services and the possible removal from bidders list. Please initial.
166	is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation, return of materials or discontinuation of services and the possible removal from bidders list. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Disclosure of Interested Parties  Section 2252.908 of the Texas Government Code requires a business entity entering into certain contracts with a governmental entity to file with the governmental entity a disclosure of interested parties at the time the business entity submits the signed contract to the governmental entity. Section 2252.908 requires the disclosure form (Form 1295) to be signed by the authorized agent of the contracting business entity, acknowledging that the disclosure is made under oath and under penalty of perjury. Section 2252.908 applies only to a contract that requires an action or vote by the governing body of the governmental entity before the contract may be signed or has a value of at least \$1 million. Section 2252.908 provides definitions of certain terms occurring in the section. Section 2252.908
16	is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation, return of materials or discontinuation of services and the possible removal from bidders list. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Disclosure of Interested Parties  Section 2252.908 of the Texas Government Code requires a business entity entering into certain contracts with a governmental entity to file with the governmental entity a disclosure of interested parties at the time the business entity submits the signed contract to the governmental entity. Section 2252.908 requires the disclosure form (Form 1295) to be signed by the authorized agent of the contracting business entity, acknowledging that the disclosure is made under oath and under penalty of perjury. Section 2252.908 applies only to a contract that requires an action or vote by the governing body of the governmental entity before the contract may be signed or has a value of at least \$1 million. Section 2252.908 provides definitions of certain terms occurring in the section. Section 2252.908
16	is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation, return of materials or discontinuation of services and the possible removal from bidders list. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Disclosure of Interested Parties  Section 2252.908 of the Texas Government Code requires a business entity entering into certain contracts with a governmental entity to file with the governmental entity a disclosure of interested parties at the time the business entity submits the signed contract to the governmental entity. Section 2252.908 requires the disclosure form (Form 1295) to be signed by the authorized agent of the contracting business entity, acknowledging that the disclosure is made under oath and under penalty of perjury. Section 2252.908 applies only to a contract that requires an action or vote by the governing body of the governmental entity before the contract may be signed or has a value of at least \$1 million. Section 2252.908 provides definitions of certain terms occurring in the section. Section 2252.908

We appreciate your time and effort expended to submit your bid. Should you have any questions or require moinformation please call (972) 548-4165. How did you receive notice of this request?    Plano Star Courier   Plan Room   Collin County eBid Notification   Collin County Website   Other (Required: Check only one)    Bid Bond Acknowledgement   Lunderstand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, cashier's check or Bid Bond in the amount of five percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountytx.ionwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid opening time to be considered.    Lunderstand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later the close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.    Required: Maximum 4000 cheracters allowed		
In order to better serve our ornefores, the Colin County Purchasing Department is conducting the following surve We appreciate your time and effort expended to submit your bid. Should you have any questions or require mo information please call (972) 548-4165. How did you receive notice of this request?    Plano Star Courier   Plan Room   Collin County eBid Notification   Collin County Website	1	Notification Survey
Plano Star Courier Plan Room Collin County eBid Notification Collin County Website Other (Required: Check only one)  Bid Bond Acknowledgement I understand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, cashier's check or Bid Bond in the amount of five percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountytx.ionwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bi opening time to be considered. I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later the close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.    Construction Acknowledgement	7	In order to better serve our offerors, the Collin County Purchasing Department is conducting the following survey. We appreciate your time and effort expended to submit your bid. Should you have any questions or require more information please call (972) 548-4165. How did you receive notice of this request?
Bid Bond Acknowledgement  I understand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, cashier's check or Bid Bond in the amount of five percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountytx.ionwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid opening time to be considered.  I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later the close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.    (Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)		
Bid Bond Acknowledgement  I understand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, cashier's check or Bid Bond in the amount of five percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountyx.iomwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bi opening time to be considered.  I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later it close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 4000 cheracters allowed)  Construction Acknowledgement  Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the I prices contained in this bid have been creed and to substantially complete the		•
I understand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, cashier's check or Bid Bond in the amount of five percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountykt.cinowave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid opening time to be considered.  I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later to close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.    Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed		
Inderstand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, easher's check or Bid Bond in the amount of five percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountytx.ionwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid opening time to be considered.  I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later to close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)  Construction Acknowledgement  Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of the structure of the proposed work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of the proposed by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of the	1	Bid Bond Acknowledgement
Construction Acknowledgement  Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the I prices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)	8	percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at https://collincountytx.ionwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid opening time to be considered.  I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later than close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be
Construction Acknowledgement  Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the I prices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)		
Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the laprices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement		
Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the laprices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement		
Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the W covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the laprices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement		
Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the Work examined to the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the Work existence of the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the I prices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement		(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machine tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the Work covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar of after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the I prices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.  (Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)  Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement	1	Construction Acknowledgement
2 Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement	9	Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his/her bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement, Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machinery, tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the Work covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar days after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the bid prices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a
2 Addendum No. 1 Acknowledgement		
<b>     </b>		(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.		
		Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)		(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
Bid Lines	Ric	I I ines

1	Package F	leader		
	Base Bid Gran	d Total		
	Quantity: 1	UOM: lump sum	Total:	\$
	Item Notes:	Total Material Cost (Line 1.1) and Total Laup to the Base Bid Grand Total	abor Cost (Line 1.2) must add	No bid
	Supplier Notes:			Alternate specification (Attach separate sheet)
				Additional notes (Attach separate sheet)
	Package Iten	ns		
	<b>1.1</b> Total Mate (Response red	rials Cost Incorporated in Project		
	Quantity: _	1 UOM: lump sum P	Price: \$	Total: \$
	Supplier No	otes:		No bid
				Additional notes (Attach separate sheet)
	1.2 Total Labo (Response red	r Cost Incorporated in Project		
	Quantity: _	1 UOM: lump sum P	Price: \$	Total: \$
	Supplier No	otes:		No bid
				Additional notes (Attach separate sheet)
2				
	Quantity: 1	UOM: lump sum P	Price: \$	Total: \$
	Item Notes:	Refer to Section 01 03 00-Alternates. Alternate bid amount shall not include the	base bid amount.	No bid
	Supplier Notes:			Alternate specification (Attach separate sheet)
				Additional notes
				(Attach separate sheet)

3	fence enclosure along the south side of the property connecting to the existing Shell camera/ intercom pedestals and all associated conduit and wiring. Proposed alternate parking on the south of the building. Refer to the architectural, civil, electrical and set and details.  (Response required)  Quantity:1 UOM: lump sum Price: \$  Item Notes: Refer to Section 01 03 00-Alternates.  Alternate bid amount shall not include the base bid amount.	riff's Office, access gates, ate includes 11 spaces of curity electronics site plans  Total:  No bid  Alternate specification
		(Attach separate sheet) Additional notes (Attach separate sheet)
4	KW; including related modifications to panelboards, wire size, and transfer switch.  (Response required)  Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: \$	erator from 900KW to 1250  Total:
	Item Notes: Refer to Section 01 03 00-Alternates. Alternate bid amount shall not include the base bid amount.  Supplier Notes:	No bid  Alternate specification (Attach separate sheet)  Additional notes (Attach separate sheet)
5	Alternate # 4 – Showers: State the cost, in its entirety to modify the epoxy floor show to field applied epoxy terrazzo shower base in shower and drying area.  (Response required)  Quantity:1 UOM:  ump sum   Price: \$  Item Notes: Refer to Section 01 03 00-Alternates.  Alternate bid amount shall not include the base bid amount.  Supplier Notes:	rers and epoxy drying areas  Total:  No bid Alternate specification (Attach separate sheet) Additional notes (Attach separate sheet)
6	Alternate # 5 – Violent Cells: State the cost in its entirety to modify cell 1119 in Booki from holding cells to padded (violent) cells as detailed. Refer to Section 11 79 05, Ce (Response required)  Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: \$  Item Notes: Refer to Section 01 03 00-Alternates. Alternate bid amount shall not include the base bid amount.  Supplier Notes:	

7	Unit Prices	
	(Line excluded from response total)	
	Item Notes: Refer to Section 01 22 00-Unit Prices Supplier Notes:	Additional notes (Attach separate sheet)
	Item Attributes	
	1. State Unit Price for Type P1 Piers (Add-Each Foot)  \$ (Required: Numbers only)  2. State Unit Price for Type P1 Piers (Reduced-Each Foot)	
	\$ (Required: Numbers only)  3. State Unit Price for Type P2 Piers (Add-Each Foot)  \$ (Required: Numbers only)	
	4. State Unit Price for Type P2 Piers (Reduced-Each Foot)  \$ (Required: Numbers only)	
	<ul> <li>5. State Unit Price for Type P4 Piers (Add-Each Foot)</li> <li>\$ (Required: Numbers only)</li> <li>6. State Unit Price for Type P4 Piers (Reduced-Each Foot)</li> </ul>	
	\$ (Required: Numbers only)	

<b>Supplier Info</b>	mation
Company Name:	
Contact Name:	
Address:	
Phone:	
Fax:	
Email:	
Supplier Note	es
the duly authorized Bidder affirms that individual has not p line of business; ar	ereby certifies the foregoing bid submitted by the company listed below hereinafter called "bidder" is agent of said company and the person signing said bid has been duly authorized to execute same. They are duly authorized to execute this contract; this company; corporation, firm, partnership or repared this bid in collusion with any other bidder or other person or persons engaged in the same d that the contents of this bid as to prices, terms and conditions of said bid have not been the undersigned nor by any employee or agent to any other person engaged in this type of business opening of this bid.
Print Name	Signature
	org.nataro