Quote
Quote Q35947
Date 9/13/2021

Customer ID 2185
Bill To: Ship To:
Collin County Purchasing Collin County Purchasing
Christie Sifuentes Christie Sifuentes

Phone: 972-548-4171

Terms Rep Shipping Method
Due on receipt taylor@botach.com
Qty Iltem Number Contract Number Item Description Unit Price | Ext. Price
3 BattleSteel-605-04 Battle Steel Level lllA Ballistic Shields w/Viewport $499.98 $1.499.94
Subtotal $1,499.94
Sales Tax $0.00
Freight $150.00
Total $1,649.94

BOTACH INC.

GSA Contract # 47QSHA18D003Y (End Date: Jun 9, 2024)
DUNS: 965068661

CAGE Code: 1JFW6

Taylor Haag - Botach Inc.
Taylor@botach.com

Marine Corps Veteran

Special Government Sales Team
Direct: 725-231-0732

Phone # Fax # E-mail Web Site

1 (786) 282-8680 | 1 (323) 545-6551 chushim@botach.com http://www.botach.com/




2020-186 Safety Wear

Sanset Survhot & Firit Mavich lic Nardis Public Safety AARDVARK Municipel Emenpency GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Ald, Inc. Services, Inc

Total Price | § 863.76 | Total Price | 6,150.00 | Total Price | § 9,068.00 | TotalPrice | § 13,140.00 | TotalPrice | § 73,868.70 | TotalPrice | $ 175415.08 | TotalPrice | § 211,265.00
Unit Unit Extended Unit Unit Extended Unit Unit Unit

[Line #  Deseription Migr Migno QryY_UOM [Estimated

Silynx or
36 Collin County
approved
Clarus Systems Headset Kit equal CLAR-T-N-002 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 89500 S 3,580.00

Sitynx or

37 Collin County
approved

Motorola APX Cable Adaptor equal CA0117-03 4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 15600 $ 624.00

Silynx or
EL Collin County
approved
Dual Comms Splitter equal CA0175-01 a4 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid -3 225.00 S 900,00

Silynx or

39 Collin County
approved

Micro Wireless PTT equal MWPTT-K-004-01 4  each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 25000 § 1,000.00

Silynx or
40 Collin County
approved
Clarus XPR equal CXPRQH-D-002 8 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 65000 S 5,200,00

H

41 or Collin

Ear Piece Molds equal 12 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid H 54.00

41 ALTL  TACTICAL EAR GADGETS GHOST EAR EARPHONE
MOLDAPS43 ‘CONNECTION EP-EMRL 12  each $ 450

Safariland or

a2 Collin County
Antenna Relocation Kit x 2 for Dual Comms  approved

TCIMAST. equal 16 each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 839 S 1,343.36 | No Bid

Point Blank
Enterprises or
Collin County
approved
Ballistic Blanket - 32°-72" lIIA equal 1 each No Bid No Bid $ 199900 § 1,999.00 | No Bid $ 212657 $ 2,126.57 | No Bid $ 240000 S 2,400.00

Point Blank
Enterprises or
Collin County
approved
Ballistic Shield Phalanx Level Il1A+ equal No Bid No Bid § 368900 S 3,689.00 | No Bid S 416122 S 4,161.22 | No Bid S 430000 5 4,300.00

a4

No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 60971 5 3048550| S 67900 S 3395000| § 64500 S  32,250.00
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Line items #: 1, 9, 12, 33 will not be awarded Awarded



AED-SHERIFF OFFICE-FORFEITURE FUNDS

Automatic Lifeline AED

APPLIED 100 LLC/AED
SUPERSTORE GRAINGER STERLING MEDICAL MCKESSON
Coop YES YES YES
Contract Number 192163 BUY BOARD 061417-MML
Contract Name OMNIA PARTNER 610-20 SOURCEWELL
AED $1,197.00 $995.00 $1,173.91
HeartSine 350P AED,

Part #: 350-STR-US-10
includes: 8 Year
Manufacturer's AED
Device Warranty
- Pair of Adult
Electrode Pads
- Lithium Battery (4
year warranty)

- Owners Manual
- AED Inspection Decal
AED Rugged Carry
Case- FREE WITH AED
CPR Rescue Kit
includes: CPR Mask,
Protective

with Rx, AHA Gloves, Emergency |DEFIBRILLATOR, AED +
Compliant Scissors, Prep Razor, ECG ON AED LID
DEFIBTECH DCF- Disinfect (FRESENIUS)
A120RXEN Wipes- FREE ZOLL MEDICAL
SHIPPING $0.00 $15.00 $0.00
Amount $1,197.00 $1,010.00 $1,173.91
Quote Date 9/13/2021 9/10/2021 9/14/2021
Quote No. QTE1899231590 25183 114085509
Non-stock item,
special order from
OUT OF STOCK, DUE TO supplier. Approximate
NOTES BE IN STOCK 10/21 delivery is 2-4 weeks
IN STOCK AND READY
LEAD TIME DUE TO SHIP 10/2021 TO SHIP 2-4 WEEKS
FINAL AWARD 9/14/2021



