

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Empire Paper	Infinity Supply & Service, Inc	Mat & Nuri	Interboro
Infinity Supply							
2	Scrub Pad green general purpose or Collin County approved equal.	40	box	Unit Price (each) \$ 0.30 Brand Bid Affex Product Number AFX96MS20 Quantity per Case/Pkg 20 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 6.00	\$ 0.28 60 \$ 16.88		
5	Grill Screen 4 in. x 5.5 in. or Collin County approved equal.	20	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 0.45 Brand Bid 3M Product Number MMM20507 Quantity per Case/Pkg 200 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 90.00	\$ 0.02 2000 \$ 32.70		
14	Napkin white 1/4 fold 17 in. x 17 in. or Collin County approved equal.	5	case	Unit Price (each) 3.95 pk Brand Bid Empress Product Number RJSELDN141717 Quantity per Case/Pkg 16/250 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 63.20	\$ 0.01 3000 \$ 31.41		
15	Forks heavy plastic white or Collin County approved equal.	35	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 0.03 Brand Bid Empress Product Number RJSE181001 Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 32.65	\$ 0.02 1000 \$ 24.10		
16	Spoons heavy plastic white or Collin County approved equal.	35	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 0.03 Brand Bid Empress Product Number RJSE181002 Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 32.65	\$ 0.02 1000 \$ 24.10		
23	Cup clear plastic 16 oz. capacity crystal hard or Collin County approved equal.	5	case	Unit Price (each) No Bid Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	\$ 0.14 500 \$ 70.04		
24	Hinged Container foam 9 in. x 9 in. x 3 in. 3-compartment or Collin County approved equal.	1000	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 0.22 Brand Bid Dart Product Number DCC90HT3R Quantity per Case/Pkg 200 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 44.00	\$ 0.15 200 \$ 29.61		
26	Plastic Wrap 18 in. x 2000 ft. roll or Collin County approved equal.	40	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 20.35 Brand Bid Empress Product Number RJSEFF182 Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 20.35	\$ 17.79 1 \$ 17.79		
27	Pan Liner ovenable parchment paper 16 in. x 24 in. sheets or Collin County approved equal.	25	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 0.04 Brand Bid Nova Product Number NOVN491 Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 41.00	\$ 0.04 1000 \$ 39.01		
28	Roll Towels Enmotion 800 ft. roll or Collin County approved equal.	75	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 9.61 Brand Bid Georgia Pacific Product Number GPC89460 Quantity per Case/Pkg 6 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 57.66	\$ 7.59 6 \$ 45.56		
29	Aluminum Foil heavy weight 18 in. x 500 ft. roll or Collin County approved equal.	12	case	Unit Price (each) \$ 34.20 Brand Bid Empress Product Number RJSE185H Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 34.20	\$ 23.97 4 \$ 95.89		

Edward Don			
17	Bowls 16 oz. squat style styrofoam or Collin County approved equal.	15 case	Unit Price (each) \$ 0.16 Brand Bid Dart Product Number DCC16MJ32 Quantity per Case/Pkg 500 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 80.00
19	Plate white undivided heavy plastic 9 in. or Collin County approved equal.	3 case	Unit Price (each) No Bid Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg
Mat and Nuri			
9	Oven Cleaner aerosol spray or Collin County approved equal.	20 case	Unit Price (each) \$ 3.84 Brand Bid Spartan Product Number SPA628000 Quantity per Case/Pkg 12 Price Per Case/Pkg \$ 46.08
32	Plate heavy clear plastic; 9 in 20/12 ct Finelie Setting or Collin County approved equal.	5 case	Unit Price (each) No Bid Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg
Interboro			
6	Hairnets or Collin County approved equal.	320 box	Unit Price (each) No Bid Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg

\$ 0.09
Wincup
F16
500
\$ 45.94
\$ 0.17
Chinet
81209
500
\$ 87.06
\$ 6.56
Reckitt
3110634
6
\$ 39.38
\$ 0.74
WNA
CW9180
180
\$ 133.75
\$ 0.15
Royal
RPH144LTBK
100
\$ 15.02

\$ 5.83
\$ 69.99
\$ 0.22
VISIONS WAVE
347RP9CLSS
180
\$ 40.00
\$ 0.08
VISIONS WAVE
347RP9CLSS
2,880
\$ 239.60

\$ 0.08
VISIONS WAVE
347RP9CLSS
2,880
\$ 239.60