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Total Price| $757,322.56] Total Price | $822,825.00| Total Price | $919,707.41| Total Price | $920,093.58| Total Price | $965,580.00| Total Price | $18,102.08| Total Price | $60,000.00] Total Price| $111,188.00] Total Price | $872,971.20| Total Price | $911,859.10] Total Price | $935,667.00| Total Price | $950,945.71| Total Price[ $976,308.22
[Line# Description Mfgr Mfgno Qry__uom Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended Unit Extended Unit | Extended Unit | Extended
1 Desktop PC (Optiplex 3080 Micro Form Factc 11 EA $938.94 $104,22234|  $980.00 $108,780.00( $1,10261 $122,389.71| $1,12061 $124,387.71| $1,226.00 $136,086.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid S$1,113.60 $123,609.60| $1,109.90 $123,198.90| $1,135.00 $125,985.00( $1,133.78 $125,849.58| $1,163.48 $129,146.28]
1.1  Optiplex 3080 Micro Form Factor XCTO Dell 210-AVPN 1 EA $875.79 $920.00 $1,028.16 $1,046.73 $1,127.00 No Bid $1,037.42 $1,043.90 $1,065.00 $1,033.79 $1,078.74
12 Micro AIO Stand MFS CUS KIT Dell 4s2:8cQC 1 EA $63.15 $60.00 $74.45 $73.88 $99.00 No Bid $76.18 $66.00 $70.00 $99.99 $84.74
2 Dell Latitude 7420 XCTO Dell 210-AYBC 214 EA $2,075.82 $444,225.48| $2,310.00 $494,340.00| $2,595.71 $555,481.94| $2,642.59 $565,514.26| $2,807.00 $600,698.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,390.22 $511,507.08| $2,541.00 $543,774.00| $2,640.00 $564,960.00| $2,495.45 $534,026.30| $2,723.40 $582,807.60
3 Dell Latitude 7320 2-in-1XCTO Dell 210AYBN 1 EA $2,031.84  $2,031.84| $2,230.00 $2,230.00| $2533.54  $2,533.54| $2,556.40  $2,556.40|No Bid NoBid NoBid No Bid $2,51739  $2,517.39| $2,453.00  $2,453.00| $2,455.00  $2,455.00( $2,571.06  $2,571.06| $2,617.66  $2,617.66
4 DellLatitude 5420 Rugged, CTO (w/ GOBI)  Dell 210-AQPT 5 EA $2,617.79 $13,088.95| $2,860.00 $14,300.00| $2,965.20 $14,826.00| $3,111.88 $15559.40| $3,137.00 $15,685.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid $2,991.89 $14,950.45| $3,146.00 $15730.00| $3,230.00 $16,150.00| $3230.72 $16,153.60| $2,978.24 $14,891.20
5 Dell Latitude 5420 Rugged, CTO (w/0 GOBI) ~Dell 210AQPT 5 EA $2,447.79  $12,238.95| $2,684.00 $13,420.00| $2,766.64 $13,833.20| $2,910.82 $14,554.10| $3,137.00 $15,685.00|No Bid NoBid NoBid $2,79153 $13,957.65| $2,95240 $14,762.00| $2,935.00 $14,675.00| $3230.72 $16,153.60| $3,186.57 $15932.85
6 Rugged CTO Acessories 10 EA $972.99  $9,729.90|  $901.00  $9,010.00| $920.35  $9,203.50| $1,013.82 $10,138.20 No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,149.45 $11,494.50|  $992.20  $9,922.00| $1,042.00 $10,420.00| $1,996.21 $19,962.10| $1,442.13 $14,421.30
61 Dock - Vehicle Dock for Dell Latitude 5420  Havis DS-DELL-402 1 EA $636.05 $620.00 $718.76 NoBid $784.92 $683.10 $700.00 $1,466.23 $846.14
6.2 Dock - Rugged 5420 Notebook Desk Dock  Dell 452-8C6Q 1 EA $261.31 $217.00 $279.06 $295.06 No Bid $280.36 $238.70 $265.00 $379.99 $486.00
63 3 Cell 51Whr ExpressCharge Capable Battery Dell 451-BCHS 1 EA $75.63 $64.00 $80.77 NoBid NoBid $84.17 $70.40 $77.00 $149.99 $109.99
7 Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media Keyboard Eng Dell 580-ADIC 214 EA $16.41  $351174|  $17.00  $3,638.00|  $19.08  $4,083.12|  $19.10  $4,087.40|  $22.00  $4,708.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid $19.97  $4273.58|  $1870  $4,001.80|  $18.00  $3,85200  $22.99  $4919.86|  $2210  $4,729.40
8 Dell M5116 Wired Mouse, Black Dell 275-8BBW 214 EA $13.88  $2,97032|  $1500 $3,21000|  $16.15 $3,456.10|  $16.48  $3,52672|  $18.00  $3,852.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid $16.90 $3616.60  $1650 $3531.00  $15.00 $3210.00(  $19.99  $4277.86|  $1862  $3,984.68
9 Active Pen PNS57W Dell 750-AATY 200  EA $41.00  $8,200.00 $37.00  $7,400.00, $59.66  $11,932.00 $48.52  $9,704.00 $55.00  $11,000.00 $44.80  $8,960.00 [No Bid No Bid $49.93  $9,986.00 $40.70  $8,140.00 $45.00  $9,000.00 $55.99  $11,198.00 $54.71  $10,942.00
10 Dock - WD195 with 130W Adapter Dell 210A86 214 EA $21675 $46384.50| $205.00 $43,870.00| $222.66 $47,649.24| $21590 $46,202.60| $229.00 $49,006.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid $21819 $46602.66 $26620 $56,966.80| $240.00 $512360.00( $267.99 $57,349.86| $248.29 $53,134.06
11 24" Monitors Dell E2420H 532 EA $180.00 $95,760.00|  $170.00 $90,440.00| $201.03 $106,947.96 $198.33 $105511.56| $198.00 $105,336.00|No Bid No Bid $209.00 $111,188.00|  $196.97 $104,788.04| $187.00 $99,484.00  $205.00 $109,060.00  $229.99 $122,354.68| $217.79 $115,864.28
12 4port USB hubs 3.0 Hub with Individual Pow. EA No Bid $33.00 $742500  $13.00 $2,925.00|  $39.10 $8797.50|  $35.00  $7,875.00(NoBid $259.00 $58,275.00(No Bid $1659  $3732.75|  $27.26  $6133.50|  $4500 $10,12500|  $35.99  $8097.75  $17.59  $3957.75
12 ALT1 {4-port StarTech.com 4-Port USB 3.0 Hub - 4x StarTech.com H EA $33.00
6x Slim Portable USB 3.0 Bd/DVD/CD Burner_Pioneer. BDR-XDOS5S EA No Bid $152.23  $15223.00(  $149.00  $14,900.00 |No Bid 33.00  $3,300.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid $115.00 $11,500.00  $139.08  $13,908.00| $35.00  $3,500.00 $89.00  $8,900.00 $42.42  $4,242.00]
16 EA 33.00
13 ALT1 {BDR-XDO7B PIONEER 6X SLIM PORTABLE USE Pioneer. B EA $149.00
- Disk drive - BDXL - 16x Buffalo Techn: Bl EA $152.23
13ALTL Pioneer BDR-XDO75 EA
14 6’ Display Port to Display Port Cable EA $1013  $1,013.00  $1583  $1,583.00 $7.00  $700.00|  $1072  $1,07200(  $17.00  $1,700.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid $1554  $1,554.00  $1263 $1,26300| $1500 $1500.00(  $1499 $1,499.00|  $1238  $1,238.00
14 ALT1 {DisplayPort Cable - DP to DP Adapter (Male-t VisionTek 901291 EA $15.83
14ALTL STARTECH  DP. EA
15 Urban Backpack 15 Dell 460-BBYL 214 EA 2841  $6079.74|  $29.00  $6206.00|  $33.65 $7,20110|  $3232 $691648|  $41.00  $8,774.00|  $4272 $9,142.08|NoBid No Bid $3335  $7,136.90|  $3190 $6,82660|  $35.00 $70490.00|  $44.99 $9,627.86|  $38.09  $8,151.26
16 Targus Rolling Laptop Case Targus TBROO3US 25  EA No Bid $70.00  $1,75000(  $65.80 $1,645.00|  $62.61 $156525|  $75.00  $1,875.00|No Bid $69.00  $1,725.00|No Bid $6580  $1,64500  $7058 $1,764.50|  $77.00 $192500(  $79.99  $1,999.75  $7041  $1,752.75
17 Cradlepoint 5 €A $1573.16  $7,865.80(No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,200.97  $6,004.85 $1,699.03  $8,495.15
171 Integrated category 18 modem and FirstNet CradlePoint ~MAS-0900120 1 €A $1,003.21 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,059.00 $1,426.01
17.2 5in 1shark fin antenna CradlePoint  CP-1002-1-PAI 1 EA $226.83 No Bid No Bid No Bid $141.97 $273.02
173 _installation 1 EA $343.12 NoBid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
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