
IFB 2021-243 Addendum 2 (Generators and Air Conditioning for Radio Tower Shelters) Bid Tabulation

Total Price $312,443.78 Total Price $397,589.00 Total Price $403,021.00 Total Price $416,268.96
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
Location Total: Air Conditioning Replacement at Copeville 
Radio Tower 1 job $19,890.27 $19,890.27 $15,147.00 $15,147.00 $28,940.00 $28,940.00 $31,333.27 $31,333.27

1.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $19,520.98 $6,150.00 $21,083.00 $25,333.27
1.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $369.29 $8,997.00 $7,857.00 $6,000.00

2
Location Total: Air Conditioning Replacementat Verona Radio 
Tower 1 job $19,890.27 $19,890.27 $15,147.00 $15,147.00 $28,940.00 $28,940.00 $31,333.27 $31,333.27

2.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $19,520.98 $6,150.00 $21,083.00 $25,333.27
2.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $369.29 $8,997.00 $7,857.00 $6,000.00

3
Location Total: Air Conditioning Replacementat Celina Radio 
Tower 1 job $19,890.27 $19,890.27 $15,034.00 $15,034.00 $28,940.00 $28,940.00 $31,333.27 $31,333.27

3.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $19,520.98 $6,150.00 $21,083.00 $25,333.27
3.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $369.29 $8,884.00 $7,857.00 $6,000.00

4
Location Total: Air Conditioning Replacementat Wilmeth Road 
Radio Tower 1 job $19,890.27 $19,890.27 $14,815.00 $14,815.00 $28,940.00 $28,940.00 $31,333.27 $31,333.27

4.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $19,520.98 $6,150.00 $21,083.00 $25,333.27
4.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $369.29 $8,665.00 $7,857.00 $6,000.00

5
Location Total: Generator Replacement atCopevilleRadio 
Tower 1 job $53,956.26 $53,956.26 $85,939.00 $85,939.00 $70,032.00 $70,032.00 $72,733.97 $72,733.97

5.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $49,468.58 $49,289.00 $58,346.00 $63,110.97
5.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $7,287.68 $36,650.00 $12,186.00 $10,000.00

5.3
Trade-in Value for one (1) existing 2006, 50KW,Generac 
Generator Model No. SD050 1 lump sum -$2,800.00 No Bid -$500.00 -$377.00

6
Location Total:Generator Replacementat Verona Radio Tower 1 job $53,956.26 $53,956.26 $85,939.00 $85,939.00 $70,032.00 $70,032.00 $72,733.97 $72,733.97

6.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $49,468.58 $49,289.00 $58,346.00 $63,110.97
6.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $7,287.68 $36,650.00 $12,186.00 $10,000.00

6.3
Trade-in Value for one (1) existing 2006, 50KW, Generac 
Generator Model No. SD050 1 lump sum -$2,800.00 No Bid -$500.00 -$377.00

7
Location Total: Generator Replacement at Celina Radio Tower 1 job $53,956.26 $53,956.26 $85,939.00 $85,939.00 $70,032.00 $70,032.00 $72,733.97 $72,733.97

7.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $49,468.58 $49,289.00 $58,346.00 $63,110.97
7.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $7,287.68 $36,650.00 $12,186.00 $10,000.00

7.3
Trade-in Value for one (1) existing 2006, 50KW, Generac 
Generator Model No. SD050 1 lump sum -$2,800.00 No Bid -$500.00 -$377.00

8
Location Total: Generator Replacement at Wilmeth Road Radio 
Tower 1 job $71,013.92 $71,013.92 $79,629.00 $79,629.00 $77,165.00 $77,165.00 $72,733.97 $72,733.97

8.1 Total Material Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $66,900.02 $45,502.00 $64,957.00 $63,110.97
8.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project 1 lump sum $8,313.90 $34,127.00 $12,708.00 $10,000.00

8.3
Trade-in Value for one (1) existing 2006, 50KW, Generac 
Generator Model No. SD080 1 lump sum -$4,200.00 No Bid -$500.00 -$377.00
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