IFB 2021-327, Construction: Animal Shelter Visitation Area Improvements Bid Tabulation

				Quality Fence Company		308 Construction, LLC		Construction Solutions USA LLC		Mart, Inc.		Tegrity Contractors Inc.	
				Total Price	\$37,846.00	Total Price	\$85,341.20	Total Price	\$96,709.95	Total Price	\$115,300.00	Total Price	\$116,554.04
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Total Cost for Chain Link Fence	1	job	\$37,846.00	\$37,846.00	\$45,600.00	\$45,600.00	<u>\$37,677.56</u>	\$37,677.56	\$50,943.00	\$50,943.00	\$43,000.00	\$43,000.00
1.1	Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum	\$27,816.00		\$24,000.00		<u>\$23,918.89</u>		\$30,566.00		\$25,000.00	
1.2	Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum	<u>\$10,030.00</u>		\$21,600.00		\$13,758.67		\$20,377.00		\$18,000.00	
2	Total Cost for Sidewalks	1	job	No Bid		<u>\$8,611.20</u>	\$8,611.20	\$15,800.20	\$15,800.20	\$20,861.00	\$20,861.00	\$17,777.00	\$17,777.00
2.1	Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum			<u>\$6,360.00</u>		\$9,716.20		\$9,078.00		\$10,666.20	
2.2	Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum			<u>\$2,251.20</u>		\$6,084.00		\$11,783.00		\$7,110.80	
3	Total Cost for Shade Structures	1	job	No Bid		<u>\$25,880.00</u>	\$25,880.00	\$38,028.64	\$38,028.64	\$39,013.00	\$39,013.00	\$33,466.20	\$33,466.20
3.1	Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum	No Bid		\$23,000.00		\$22,999.14		\$28,264.00		<u>\$20,079.72</u>	
3.2	Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum			<u>\$2,880.00</u>		\$15,029.50		\$10,749.00		\$13,386.48	
4	Total Cost for Park Benches	1	job	No Bid		\$5,250.00	\$5,250.00	\$5,203.55	\$5,203.55	\$4,483.00	\$4,483.00	\$22,310.84	\$22,310.84
4.1	Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum			\$3,900.00		\$3,638.19		<u>\$3,049.00</u>		\$13,386.48	
4.2	Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project	1	lump sum			<u>\$1,350.00</u>		\$1,565.36		\$1,434.00		\$8,924.36	

Notes:

Mart Inc. declined a partial award.

Quality Fence Company cannot honor bid due to material availability.

Construction Solutions USA was awarded line items 1, 1.1, 1.2, 4, 4.1 & 4.2, but declined to accept award due to supply -chain and workforce concerns.

12/02/2021 Draft until award