CLINICAL PATHOLOGY
LABORATORIES, INC

Quest Diagnostics Clinical
Laboratories, Inc

Arubah Wellness Group LLC

Total Price $30,417.20| Total Price $85,044.48| Total Price $215,810.00
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno QTY UOM Estimated Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 Employee Health 1 EA $19,840.70 $19,840.70| $21,258.62 $21,258.62| $133,682.00 $133,682.00
1.1 Lipid Panel 244  EA $3.50 $6.00 $63.00
12 CBC 300 EA $4.00 $3.25 $57.00
1.3 PT/INR 20 EA $5.50 $8.50 No Bid

1.4  UA w/microscopy 72 EA $5.00 $3.24 $71.00
1.5 Amylase 4 EA $7.00 $14.00 $35.00
1.6 Lipase 4 EA 7.00 $17.00 $35.00
1.7  Uric Acid 8 EA $5.50 $4.42 $171.00
1.8  PSA, Total 4 EA $8.00 $9.00 $35.00
1.9 Hemoglobin A1C 238 EA $9.00 $6.75 $64.00
1.10 TSH 74 EA $6.50 $4.50 $71.00
1.11  TSH+Free T4 Profile 30 EA $26.50 $13.29 $80.00
1.12 FreeT3 4 EA $19.00 $11.72 $128.00
1.13  Microalbumin, random 20 EA $9.50 $15.00 No Bid
1.14 Vitamin D, 250H 100 EA $35.00 $30.57 $35.00
1.15  Culture, Urine/Sensitivity on all 20 EA $8.00 $9.00 $71.00
1.16  Occult Bld, Fecal, Immunoassay 2 EA $40.00 $45.00 No Bid
1.17  HPV High Risk 16 EA $45.00 $40.00 No Bid
1.18 PAP Test, Surepath 20 EA 28.00 $30.00 No Bid
1.19 Hepatic Function Panel 24 EA $4.00 $3.07 $28.00
1.20 Complete Metabolic Panel 458 EA $4.75 $4.01 $100.00
1.21  Acute Hepatitis Profile 8 EA $26.00 $82.29 $214.00
1.22  Ferritin 4 EA $14.00 8.08 $114.00
1.23  Hepatitis B AB Quant 24 EA $9.05 $15.00 $142.00
1.24 Mumps IgG 4 EA $24.00 15.00 $42.00
1.25 Rabies Antibody 8 EA $84.50 $113.00 No Bid
1.26  Rubeola IgG 4 EA $12.00 $30.00 No Bid
1.27 RubellalgG 4 EA $15.00 $11.00 $142.00
1.28 Varicella Zoster 4 EA $22.00 $20.00 $157.00
1.29 COVID-19 Testing 68 EA $70.00 $100.00 $185.00

2 Federal and Non-Federal Drug Screens 1 EA $2,320.00 $2,320.00 $9,326.00 $9,326.00( $21,400.00 $21,400.00
2.1  Employee drug screen 116 EA $20.00 $46.63 $107.00
2.2

3 STD 1 EA $8,256.50 $8,256.50| $54,459.86 $54,459.86 $60,728.00 $60,728.00
3.1 Lipid Panel 60 EA $3.50 $6.00 $63.00
3.2 CBC 74 EA $4.00 $3.25 $57.00
3.3  UA w/microscopy 18 EA $5.00 3.24 $71.00
3.4  Hemoglobin A1C 60 EA $9.00 $6.75 $64.00
3.5 TSH 18 EA $6.50 4.50 $71.00
3.6  TSH+Free T4 Profile 8 EA $26.50 $13.29 $80.00
3.7 FreeT3 2 EA $19.00 $11.72 $128.00
3.8  Microalbumin, random 4 EA $9.50 $15.00 No Bid
3.9 Vitamin D, 250H 26 EA $35.00 $30.57 $35.00
3.10 Occult Bld, Fecal, Immunoassay 2 EA $40.00 $45.00 No Bid
3.11 HPV High Risk with Genotype 4 EA $45.00 $40.00 No Bid
3.12  Pap Smear Surepath 4 EA 28.00 $30.00 No Bid
3.13  Hepatic Function Panel 6 EA $4.00 $3.07 $28.00
3.14 Complete Metabolic Panel 114 EA $4.75 $4.01 $100.00
3.15 HIV 36 EA $12.00 $200.00 $50.00
3.16 GC/CT 58 EA $30.00 $19.27 No Bid
3.17 HIV 1/2 AB AG reflex Conf 120 EA $12.00 $324.27 $185.00
3.18 HSV 8 EA $40.00 $161.55 $157.00
3.19 Acute Hepatitis Profile 36 EA 26.00 $82.29 $214.00

Line 2.2 No Award
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