IFB 2021-366 Dell PowerStore 3000
Bid Tabulation

Xerox Business Solutions

Unique Digital Inc. Hypertec USA, Inc vPrime Tech Inc Southwest (Dahill Office Diltex Inc Summus Industries, Inc. Sunflower Lab LLC Avenues International Inc
Technology Corporation)
Total Price]  $119,000.00( Total Price]  $120,699.51| Total Price]  $125,355.00] Total Price]  $125,877.78| Total Price]  $127,697.47] Total Price]  $128,714.76| _Total Price] _ $129,388.58] Total Price]  $133,114.43
[tine# D Mfgr _Mfgno Qry__uom Unit | unit | Unit Unit unit | Unit Unit unit |
1 Dell EMC PowerStore 3000 Dell G4WI1EBP 1 EA $22,500.00 $22,500.00 $120,699.50 $120,699.50| 178.50 $4,178.50| $22,854.55 $22,854.55  $23,201.10 $23,201.10[  $23,385.92 $23,385.92| $24,371.81 $24,371.81| $133,085.43 $133,085.43|
2 Memory Capacity Dell  G3IMLWS 1 EA $10,500.00 $10,500.00(No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $10,924.24 $10,924.24|  $11,090.36 $11,090.36| $11,178.71 $11,178.71|  $11,649.97 $11,649.97 $1.00 $1.00]
3 DRR (Used for Internal Data Tracking) Dell  GCUT7NJ 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00| $1.00 $1.00|
4 Drives Dell  GOWBTYA 6 EA $3,200.00 $19,200.00(No Bid $4,178.50 $25,071.00 $3,279.80 $19,678.80 $3,329.44 $19,976.64| $3,355.97 $20,135.82 $3,497.44 $20,984.64 $1.00 $6.00]
5] Operating Environment Dell  G8RY53G 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.00 $1.00
6 4 Port Mezz Cards Dell  GP59Q)Z 1 EA $950.00 $950.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $973.74 $973.74] $988.18 $988.18, $996.04 $996.04/ $1,038.04 $1,038.04, $1.00 $1.00]
7 Optional Appliance 10 Module (includes
SFPs) Dell  GSCX3RP 1 EA $3,500.00 $3,500.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50|  $3,564.65 $3,564.65|  $3,618.98 $3,618.98|  $3,647.81 $3,647.81|  $3,801.59 $3,801.59 $1.00 $1.00|
8 Power Supply Dell  GU8ZYW6 1 EA $850.00 $850.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $895.96 $895.96 $909.50 $909.50 $916.74 $916.74 $955.39 $955.39) 1.00 $1.00]
9 Install Kits Dell  GVH934G 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.00 $1.00
10 Info ? DellStar DOMS Orders Only Dell  GK3W7RV 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $1.00 $1.00
11 Dell Services:Hardware Support Dell G5DNU97 1 EA $10,300.00 $10,300.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $10,423.23 $10,423.23| $10,580.89 $10,580.89| $10,665.17 $10,665.17| $11,114.79 $11,114.79 $1.00 $1.00|
1 Dell Services: Support for Drive Capacity
Addon Dell  GWKIA6Z 6 EA $1,100.00 $6,600.00(No Bid $4,178.50 $25,071.00 $1,121.21 $6,727.26 $1,137.87 $6,827.22] $1,146.94 $6,881.64| $1,195.29 $7,171.74, $1.00 $6.00]
13 Anytime Upgrade Dell  GIA7LVN 1 EA $39,400.00 $39,400.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50|  $40,084.85 $40,084.85|  $40,607.32 $40,607.32|  $40,930.79 $40,930.79|  $42,656.35 $42,656.35 $1.00 $1.00|
14  Storage Configuration Dell  GLOAGF) 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $1.00 $1.00
15 Dell Services:Deployment Services Dell  GA10IPT 1 EA $2,900.00 $2,900.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50|  $7,408.08 $7,408.08|  $7,519.79 $7,519.79|  $7,579.69 $7,579.69|  $3,146.80 $3,146.80 1.00 $1.00
16 Education Services Dell  G90Q3VT 1 EA $2,300.00 $2,300.00(No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50 $2,342.42 $2,342.42 $2,377.49 $2,377.49] $2,396.43 $2,396.43 $2,497.46 $2,497.46 $1.00 $1.00]
17  AppSync for PowerStore Dell  GILOHXD 1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.01 $0.01 $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.00 $1.00
18  AppSync Software Dell  GQ70RAI 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50| $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00] $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00] $1.00 $1.00
19  AppSync Software Support (Legacy) Dell G2BT8RV 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50 $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00| $0.00 $0.00| $1.00 $1.00|
20 AppSync Software Support, Contract
(Legacy) Dell GMRPOCL 1 EA $0.00 $0.00|No Bid $4,178.50 $4,178.50 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00) $0.00 $0.00 $1.00 $1.00)
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