	Quote No. 2021-013 Addendum 2: Vehicle Marking			Image360 North Dallas		Coopers Copies & Printing (Stissing Mountain Corporation)	
				Total Price	\$4,321.85	Total Price	\$10,019.83
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	Ford Police Interceptor Explorer - Patrol	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$720.00	\$720.00
2	Ford Police Interceptor Explorer - K9	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$720.00	\$720.00
3	Ford Police Interceptor Explorer - Citizens on Patrol	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$720.00	\$720.00
4	Ford Police Interceptor - Taurus	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$720.00	\$720.00
5	Ford Police Interceptor - Other	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$720.00	\$720.00
6	Ford Expedition	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$1,120.00	\$1,120.00
7	Chevrolet 12- Passenger Van	1	each	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$806.40	\$806.40
8	Chevrolet 12- Passenger Extended Van	1	each	\$500.00	\$500.00	\$967.68	\$967.68
9	Ford Police Interceptor - Taurus	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$720.00	\$720.00
10	Ford F150 Crew Cab Truck	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$1,120.00	\$1,120.00
11	Ford Expedition	1	each	\$300.00	\$300.00	\$1,120.00	\$1,120.00
12	New Decal Design Fabrication	1	square foot	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$18.00	\$18.00
13	New Decal Design Fabrication	1	square foot	\$10.00	\$10.00	\$12.00	\$12.00
14	Collin County Logo Decals 4"	1	each	\$33.77	\$33.77	\$4.50	\$4.50
15	Collin County Logo Decals 12"	1	each	\$44.04	\$44,04	\$12.50	\$12.50
16	CSCD Logo Decals	1	each	\$44.04	\$44.04	\$15.25	\$15.25
17	Decal Design or Modification	1	hour	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$45.00	\$45.00
18	Decal Repair	1	hour	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$65.00	\$65.00
19	Decal Application	1	hour	\$150.00	\$150.00	\$65.00	\$65.00
20	Decal Removal	1	hour	\$200.00	\$200.00	\$65.00	\$65.00
21	Vehicle Top Markings, Numbers Only, F-150 & Ford utility, Fabricate and Install	1	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$121.00	\$121.00
22	Vehicle Top Markings, Numbers and Agency ID, F-150 & Ford utility, Fabricate and Install	1	each	No Bid	No Bid	\$142.50	\$142.50

\*Note: Image360 North Dallas withdrew their quote. Line items 21 and 22 were added later.

\$65.00 \$65.00 \$121.00 \$121.00 X 22 \$142.50 \$142.50 Sed For Land 1066 FOX