

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
1	BEDDING AND TOWELS: TOWELS: BATH TURKISH, WHITE, 20" X 40" Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.91 VSI BTWH2040 12 \$10.92	No Bid	No Bid
2	BEDDING AND TOWELS: WASH CLOTHS: WHITE, 12" x 12" Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.16 VSI WCWHECO 12 \$1.92	Only sold per dozen \$0.22	No Bid
3	BEDDING AND TOWELS: PILLOW CASES: WHITE STANDARD SIZE, POLYESTER COTTON BLEND Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.95 VSI PCWH4234 12 \$11.41	\$0.77 Only sold per dozen	No Bid
4	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS COVER:PILLOW CASE STYLE 25"x75"x4", WHITE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.75	No Bid
5	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS, SEALED SEAM, VINYL COVER, POLYESTER SCRIM 25"x75"x4" Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$66.46 VSI MASV42575 1 \$66.46	\$63.46	No Bid
6	BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED 62" x 80" WHITE OR GRAY Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.84 VSI BLW628070 20 \$156.80	No Bid	No Bid
7	BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED, 66" x 90" WHITE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	BEDDING AND TOWELS: SUICIDE BLANKET:54" X 80" Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$69.87 VSI SPBL 1 \$69.87	No Bid	No Bid

Deleted duplicated line 126

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
9	INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT:ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 34"-52" CHEST SIZE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$62.00	No Bid
10	INMATE CLOTHING: SUICIDE SUIT:ADJUSTABLE SMOCK, 44"-56" CHEST SIZE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$67.87 VSI SPSM 1 \$67.87	No Bid	No Bid
11	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.47 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$15.47	No Bid	No Bid
12	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.47 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$15.47	No Bid	No Bid
13	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$15.47 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$15.47	No Bid	No Bid
14	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 4XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.73 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$16.73	No Bid	No Bid
15	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 5XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$16.73 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$16.73	No Bid	No Bid
16	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 6XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.19 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$17.19	No Bid	No Bid
17	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 7XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.83 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$17.83	No Bid	No Bid
18	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:GREEN, ORANGE, RED, or WHITE SHORT SLEEVE, 8XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.98 VSI UNJS(color)-(SZ) 1 \$18.98	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
19	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.86	No Bid
20	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.86	No Bid
21	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.86	No Bid
22	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 4XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$12.86	No Bid
23	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 5XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.53	No Bid
24	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 6XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.53	No Bid
25	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 7XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.53	No Bid
26	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION JUMPSUIT:ORANGE STRIPED SHORT SLEEVE, 8XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$14.53	No Bid
27	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.34	\$7.16	No Bid
28	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.34	\$7.46	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
29	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.64 VSI UNTR(color)-(SIZE) 1 \$6.64	\$7.76	No Bid
30	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE OR YELLOW ELASTIC WAIST, 4XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.84 VSI UNTR(color)-(SIZE) 1 \$6.84	\$7.76	No Bid
31	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 5-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.24 VSI UNSH(color)-(SIZE) 1 \$6.24	No Bid	No Bid
32	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.24 VSI UNSH(color)-2XL 1 \$6.24	No Bid	No Bid
33	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.44 VSI UNSH(color)-3XL 1 \$6.44	No Bid	No Bid
34	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 4XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.74 VSI UNSH(color)-4XL 1 \$6.74	No Bid	No Bid
35	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 5XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.77 VSI UNSH(color)-5XL 1 \$6.77	No Bid	No Bid
36	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 6XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.11 VSI UNSH(color)-6XL 1 \$7.11	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
37	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE OR YELLOW V-NECK, 7XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.11 VSI UNSH(color)-7XL 1 \$7.11	No Bid	No Bid
38	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.34 VSI UNTRBLW-(SIZE) 1 \$6.34	No Bid	No Bid
39	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUESTRIPE ELASTIC WAIST, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.34 VSI UNTRBLW-2XL 1 \$6.34	No Bid	No Bid
40	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.64 VSI UNTRBLW-3XL 1 \$6.64	No Bid	No Bid
41	INMATE CLOTHING: SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 4XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.84 VSI UNTRBLW-4XL 1 \$6.84	No Bid	No Bid
42	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 5X Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.97 VSI UNTRBLW-5XL 1 \$6.97	No Bid	No Bid
43	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT:BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 6X Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.24 VSI UNTRBLW-6XL 1 \$7.24	No Bid	No Bid
44	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT PANT: BLUE STRIPED ELASTIC WAIST, 7X Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.44 VSI UNTRBLW-7XL 1 \$7.44	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
45	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.24 VSI UNSHBLW-(SIZE) 1 \$6.24	No Bid	No Bid
46	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.24 VSI UNSHBLW-2XL 1 \$6.24	No Bid	No Bid
47	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED V-NECK, 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.44 VSI UNSHBLW-3XL 1 \$6.44	No Bid	No Bid
48	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 4XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.74 VSI UNSHBLW-4XL 1 \$6.74	No Bid	No Bid
49	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 5XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.77 VSI UNSHBLW-5XL 1 \$6.77	No Bid	No Bid
50	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 6XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.11 VSI UNSHBLW-6XL 1 \$7.11	No Bid	No Bid
51	INMATE CLOTHING: DETENTION SUIT SHIRT:BLUE STRIPED, V-NECK, 7XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.11 VSI UNSHBLW-7XL 1 \$7.11	No Bid	No Bid
52	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE , S - XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.24 VSI TSHIRTWHT-(SZ) 12 \$26.88	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
53	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE , 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.06 VSI TSHIRTWHT-2XL 12 \$36.72	No Bid	No Bid
54	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON T-SHIRTS, WHITE , 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.06 VSI TSHIRTWHT-3XL 12 \$36.72	No Bid	No Bid
55	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE, S (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling) Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.61 VSI SSOR-S 12 \$91.32	No Bid	No Bid
56	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,M (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling) Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.61 VSI SSOR-M 12 \$91.32	No Bid	No Bid
57	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,L (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling) Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.61 VSI SSOR-L 12 \$91.32	No Bid	No Bid
58	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,XL (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling) Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.61 VSI SSOR-XL 12 \$91.32	No Bid	No Bid
59	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,2XL (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling) Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.64 VSI SSOR-2XL 12 \$103.68	No Bid	No Bid
60	INMATE CLOTHING: SWEATSHIRT:ORANGE, LONG SLEEVE,3XL (Price should include screening and/ or stenciling) Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.64 VSI SSOR-3XL 12 \$103.68	No Bid	No Bid
61	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.88 VSI BRWH-(S2) 12 \$10.56	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
62	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.99 VSI BRWH-2XL 12 \$11.88	No Bid	No Bid
63	INMATE CLOTHING: MEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.99 VSI BRWH-3XL 12 \$11.88	No Bid	No Bid
64	INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.88 VSI BRWHB-(SZ) 12 \$10.56	No Bid	No Bid
65	INMATE CLOTHING: BOY'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.88 VSI BRWHB-2XL 12 \$10.56	No Bid	No Bid
66	INMATE CLOTHING: GIRL'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.91	No Bid
67	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 5-7 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.73 VSI PNTYWH-(SZ) 12 \$8.76	No Bid	No Bid
68	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 8-10 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.80 VSI PNTYWHEC-(SZ) 12 \$9.60	No Bid	No Bid
69	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 11-12 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.80 VSI PNTYWHEC-(SZ) 12 \$9.60	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
70	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S COTTON BRIEFS, WHITE, 13-14 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.84 VSI PNTYWHEC-(SZ) 12 \$10.08	No Bid	No Bid
71	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, A CUP Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.58	No Bid
72	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, B CUP Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.58	No Bid
73	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, C CUP Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.58	No Bid
74	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, D CUP Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.58	No Bid
75	INMATE CLOTHING: WOMEN'S BRA: WHITE, 34-44, E CUP Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.79 VSI NBWH-(SZ) 12 24.00	No Bid	No Bid
76	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY; SIZE32-38 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.71 VSI SBGY-(SZ) 12 18.36	No Bid	No Bid
77	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - GRAY; SIZE40-48 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.91 VSI SBGY-(SZ) 12 19.44	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
78	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - GRAY; SIZE 50-54 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.91 VSI SBGY-(SZ) 12 19.44	No Bid	No Bid
79	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTS BRA - WHITE; SIZE32-38 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.62 VSI SBWH-SZ 12 15.72	No Bid	No Bid
80	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE; SIZE40-48 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.75 VSI SBWH-SZ 12 16.32	No Bid	No Bid
81	INMATE CLOTHING: SPORTSBRA - WHITE; SIZE50-54 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.75 VSI SBWH-SZ 12 16.92	No Bid	No Bid
82	INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS:CREW, CALF LENGTH STYLE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.50 VSI SKCRWH 12 4.62	No Bid	No Bid
83	INMATE CLOTHING: SOCKS: SPORT, WHITE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.48 VSI NBWH-(SZ) 12 \$21.48	No Bid	No Bid
84	INMATE CLOTHING: CAPS, BASEBALL: 3/4 OPEN MESH Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.39	No Bid
85	INMATE CLOTHING: CANVAS TENNIS SHOES: LOW TOP, HEAVY DUTY, BLACK OR WHITE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.09 VSI SHCVLT(B/W)-(SZ) 1 \$6.09	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
86	INMATE CLOTHING: LEATHER TENNIS SHOES, BLACK Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$18.17	No Bid
87	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE S - L Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
88	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
89	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE 2XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
90	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE 3XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
91	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES- EVA SLIDES, ORANGE, S-XL Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.53	No Bid
92	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: INDIGENT HYGIENE KIT Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.17 KITCOLLIN 50 \$58.50	Non-res as left blank	No Bid
93	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: COMB: 5" PLASTIC, NON BREAKABLE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.02 VSI/DUKAL SUC5 \$2,160.00 \$47.58	\$0.03	No Bid

Deleted duplicated line 129

Deleted duplicated line 130

Deleted duplicated line 131

Deleted duplicated line 132

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
94	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DEODORANT - Maximum Security .5 oz Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.26 VSI SUSD05 576 \$149.76	No Bid	No Bid
95	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DEODORANT - .5 oz Degree Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$1.26 VSI/DEGREE SUDEDECR5 - Men's Cool Rush 36 \$45.38	\$1.14	No Bid
96	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SOAP: WRAPPED, ANTIBACTERIAL DEODERANT SOAP .5 OZ Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.05	No Bid
97	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: LIQUID TWO-IN-ONE SHAMPOO ANDCONDITIONER, GALLON Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$13.46 VSI SUSC128 4 \$53.84	No Bid	No Bid
98	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: DIAL ALL-IN-ONE SHAMPOO, GALLON Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.58 VSI/DIAL SUSBD128 4 \$70.33	\$18.84	No Bid
99	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SHAMPOO:LICE TREATMENT KIT Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	NO BID	No Bid
101	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SHORTY TOOTHBRUSHES, WRAPPED Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.05 VSI SUTB20I 144 \$7.20	No Bid	No Bid

Department approved delete

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
102	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: SANITARY NAPKINS: SUPER, BELTLESS, ADHESIVE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	VSI SUMTSM 288 42.624	\$0.09 BBC SN12-C 576 29.99	\$0.05 No Bid
104	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: NET LAUNDRY BAG: 24" X 36" Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	VSI LB2436DC-WH 12	\$3.41 No Bid \$40.92	No Bid
105	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: ID BANDS:CLINCHER, IV PHOTO WHITE, METAL FASTENER Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.35	No Bid
107	Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Bedding and TowelsNot Listed Herein	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.15	No Bid	No Bid
108	Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Inmate ClothingNot Listed Herein	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.15	No Bid	No Bid
109	Percentage Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Personal Hygiene Products Not Listed Herein	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.15	No Bid	No Bid
110	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS: REGULAR, WRAPPED Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	VSI SUMTMPR 500 58.44	\$0.13 BBC TPX500 500 45.98	\$0.09 No Bid
111	MISCELLANEOUS ITEMS: TAMPONS: SUPER, WRAPPED Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	VSI SUMTMPS 500 58.44	\$0.13 BBC SBTPX500 500 47.98	\$0.15 No Bid
112	Juvenile Pillow #L03PC GREEN POLY-FILL PILLOW 17 X 25 or Collin County Approved Equal Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	White in Color VSI PL2026	\$7.17 No Bid	No Bid
113	Juvenile Mattress 420 068 ITEM# 420-68-44004-1, JAIL MATTRESS COTTON, SIZE: 25 X 72 X 4, ANALYSIS #11175 Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$70.85	No Bid
114	Suave ITEM# S73796-CS 2IN1 SHAM 12.6 OZ SUAVE SHAMPOO + CONDITIONER, 12.6 OZ 6 PER CASE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$4.32	No Bid
115	Sanitary Napkins SANITARY NAPKINS:REGULAR, BELTLESS, ADHESIVE Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.06	No Bid
116	Degree deodorant Deodorant: .5 oz. Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	VSI/DEGREE SUDEDE5 - Womens Shower Clean	\$1.26 \$36.00 \$45.38	\$1.14 No Bid
117	Cotton Gray T-shirts XS – XL Men's 100% cotton T-shirts, 1st quality, full cut, heavy weight fabric, double stitched reinforced seams, crew neck, pre-shrunk, NO SECONDS OR IRREGULARS COLOR.	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$2.44	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
	Brand Bid					
	Product Number					
	Quantity per Case/Pkg					
	Price Per Case/Pkg					
118	Black Basketball Shorts XS – XL ITEM NO. 659BK-S SHORTS, ATHELETIC	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$3.66	No Bid
	Brand Bid					
	Product Number					
	Quantity per Case/Pkg					
	Price Per Case/Pkg					
119	Spit Sock Hood Product # SS100	No Bid	No Bid	VSI SPHOOD \$4.25	\$3.14	No Bid
	Brand Bid					
	Product Number					
	Quantity per Case/Pkg					
	Price Per Case/Pkg					
				\$1.00	\$50.00	
				\$4.25	\$156.98	
120	Chicago Model A600 72" Restraint Chain	No Bid	No Bid	\$23.99		No Bid
	Brand Bid					
	Product Number					
	Quantity per Case/Pkg					
	Price Per Case/Pkg					
				\$1.00		
				\$23.99		
121	Chicago Model 2200 Leg Irons	No Bid	No Bid	\$33.97		No Bid
	Brand Bid					
	Product Number					
	Quantity per Case/Pkg					
	Price Per Case/Pkg					
				\$1.00		
				\$33.97		
122	Chicago Model 1000 Nickel Finish Handcuffs	No Bid	No Bid	\$22.44		No Bid
	Brand Bid					
	Product Number					
	Quantity per Case/Pkg					
	Price Per Case/Pkg					
				\$1.00		
				\$22.44		
123	Humane Restraint Model NCS-900 Nylon Control Strap (Squad Car Restraint)	No Bid	No Bid	\$51.38	NO BID	No Bid
	Brand Bid					
	Product Number					
	Quantity per Case/Pkg					
	Price Per Case/Pkg					
				\$51.38		
124	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS COVER:PILLOW CASE STYLE 35"x73"x4", WHITE	No Bid	No Bid	\$8.67	No Bid	No Bid
	BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS COVER: PILLOWCASE STYLE 25"x72"x4"; OFF WHITE	No Bid	No Bid	\$7.44	No Bid	No Bid
125	TWILL FABRIC	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.74	No Bid	No Bid
	BEDDING AND TOWELS Thermal Blanket; SKU: EGTB Economy White Cotton Thermal Blanket, White, 126 66 in x 90 in	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.74	No Bid	No Bid
	LifeLine Jumpsuit-Suicide Smock SKU: BBJ Lifeline Jumpsuit, 127 Green, Fits: S – XL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$105.48	No Bid
	LifeLine Jumpsuit-Suicide Smock SKU: BBJX Lifeline Jumpsuit, 128 Green, Fits: 2XL - 4XL	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$119.48	No Bid
	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE S - L	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.17	No Bid	No Bid
129	SHEVDSO-(SZ) INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE XL	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.17	No Bid	No Bid
130	SHEVDSO-XL	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.17	No Bid	No Bid

Line #	Description	Tabb Textiles Co., Inc.	JAB TRADING INDUSTRIES	Victory Supply	Bob Barker Company Inc	ICS JAIL SUPPLIES INC
		Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit	Unit
131	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE 2XL SHEVDSO-2XL	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.17	No Bid	No Bid
132	INMATE CLOTHING: SHOES - EVA SNEAKER, ONE PIECE CONSTRUCTION -ORANGE, SIZE 3XL SHEVDSO-3XL	No Bid	No Bid	\$5.17	No Bid	No Bid
133	Suave® Shampoo & Conditioner, 12.6 oz SKU 573796 or Collin County approved equal Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$6.32	No Bid	No Bid
134	Individually Wrapped Antibacterial Deodorant Soap #0.5 SKU 62101-C or Collin County approved equal Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.07	No Bid	No Bid
135	Pillow, Poly Fiber, 15x25, Anti-Bacterial, Flame Resistant SKU 18K1AB or Collin County approved equal Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
137	Microfiber cleaning towel 35g SKU M915107 or Collin County approved equal Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.77	No Bid	No Bid
138	Dial® Total Body Shampoo, 1 Gal. SKU 3986 or Collin County approved equal Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$17.58	NO BID	No Bid
139	CREST TOOTHPASTE 0.85 OZ (240/CASE) SKU 9782 or Collin County approved equal Brand Bid Product Number Quantity per Case/Pkg Price Per Case/Pkg	No Bid	No Bid	\$0.41	No Bid	No Bid
				\$240.00 \$98.02		

Deleted duplicated line 112