

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	SilencerCo Unit Price	Precision Delta Corporation Unit Price	Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise Holdings LLC) Unit Price	GALLS, LLC Unit Price	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC Unit Price
1	9MM with night sights, 3-17 round magazines	Glock or Collin County approved equal	Model 17, Generation 5	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 409.00
2	Simulator Handgun, Fixed Sights, 5lb	Glock or Collin County approved equal	17T	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 454.00
4	Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor Includes 5 8x24 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount	Silencerco or Collin County approved equal		\$ 754.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
5	Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor, includes 1/2x28 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount	Silencerco or Collin County approved equal		\$ 754.80	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
6	Silencer, Omega 36M Suppressor	Silencerco or Collin County approved equal		\$ 807.16	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
8	Super SCAR Trigger, FN SCAR 16/17, Two Stage Matte	Geissele or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 285.00	No Bid	\$ 295.46
9	Viking Tactics Padded Vickers Combat Sling, Black	Blue Force Gear or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 34.06
10	AR-15/M16 Vickers Combat Sling	Blue Force Gear or Collin County approved equal	VCAS125OABK	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 40.59
11	1" HK Style Sling Snap Hook	Brownell's or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 6.46
12	DS-SR07-IT Dual Pressure Switch	SureFire or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 151.14
13	ALS Holster, Glock 17, Basketweave	Safariland or Collin County approved equal	6360	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
13 ALT1	GOULD AND GOODRICH K FORCE HOLSTERLP653 BRH G17	Gould & Goodrich	K391-G17W	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 104.44
14	Ammunition, 9mm Luger +P 134 gr Flexlock Duty	Hornady or Collin County approved equal	90225	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
14 ALT1	9MM 147gr Ranger Bonded ONE JHPSee attachments for product specification sheet	WINCHESTER	RA9B1	No Bid	\$ 509.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
15	Ammunition, LE Only Brass Case 9mm 135 gr	Hornady or Collin County approved equal	90238	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 316.59
15 ALT1	9MM 124gr Full Metal JacketSee attachments for product specification sheet	WINCHESTER	USA9MM	No Bid	\$ 225.00	No Bid	No Bid	
18	Optics, Weapon Sight	Eotech or Collin County approved equal	XPS3-0	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 569.64
19	AR-15 Flip-Up Adjustable Rear Sight	Troy Industries or Collin County approved equal	SSIGFBSROBT00	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 101.39	No Bid	No Bid
21	AR-15 ACE ARFX-E Skeleton Stock	Double Star or Collin County approved equal	A110B	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 107.31
28	Magazines, AR-15 PMAG-D-60 223/5.56 60RD Polymer, Black	Magpul or Collin County approved equal	MAG576	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 98.56

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	SilencerCo	Precision Delta Corporation	Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise Holdings LLC)	GALLS, LLC	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC
				Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
29	Magazines, AR-15 PMAG GEN M3 223/5.56 30RD Polymer, Black	Magpul or Collin County approved equal	MAG557	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 10.92
30	Magazines, PMAG 17GL9, 3 Pack (Glock 17)	Magpul or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 32.77
31	Ammunition, Training: 9mm Yellow	Precision Gun Specialities or Collin County approved equal	ST9YELLOW	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 37.50
35	HD XR Night Sight Set, Glock 17, 19, 22, 26, 32, 37 orange frnt	Trijicon or approved equal	GL601C600836	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 108.79
36	Pistol LightX300-U	Surefire or Collin County approved equal	X300-U	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 225.21
39	7395 7TSALSHOLSTER/W/WEAPON LIGHT	Safariland or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 91.57
42	Urban Sniper Bag	5-11 or approved equal	56224	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45	Scope Mount, Quick Detach 34MM	LaRue Tactical or Collin County approved equal	LT111-34	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
45 ALT1	Steiner cantilever mount	Steiner	5972	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 274.00	No Bid	No Bid
49	Tri-Fold Disposable Restaints, 6-pack	ASP, Inc or Collin County approved equal	56192	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 18.10
50	Mag Pouch, 79 Open Top 2x	Safariland or Collin County approved equal	775	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 23.58
51	Indirect Fire Munitions	Defense Technology or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 20.92
52	LMT 40MM Light Weight Single Shot Launcher	Defense Technology or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 974.76
53	Chemical Munitions	Defense Technology or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.33
54	Chemical Ferret Rounds	Defense Technology or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.32
55	Pyrotechnic Penetrating Rounds	Defense Technology or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	\$ 25.32
60	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 8 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
61	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 9 and 10 for items Not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
62	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 11 for item Not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	15%	No Bid
63	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 12 and 36 for items Not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5%
64	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 13, 39 and 50 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25%

Deleted Per department

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	SilencerCo Unit Price	Precision Delta Corporation Unit Price	Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise Holdings LLC) Unit Price	GALLS, LLC Unit Price	GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC Unit Price
65	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 14, 15, 16 and 17 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	40%
66	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 18 and 37 for items Not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
67	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 19 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
69	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 21 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	1%
72	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 28, 29 and 30 for items Not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
73	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 31 and 32 for items Not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
76	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 35 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
80	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 42 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	25%
85	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 48 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5%
86	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 49 for items not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	10%
87	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer for lines 51, 52, 53, 54 and 55 for items Not Listed Herein			No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	5%
88	L4 G24 Mount	Wilcox or Collin County approved equal		No Bid	No Bid	\$ 393.00	No Bid	No Bid
89	Hornady 5.56 NATO 20/BX GMX 53gr TAP			No Bid	\$ 990.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
91	Federal .45Auto 50/BX HST HP 230gr			No Bid	\$ 435.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
92	Federal 12ga 5/BX Tac 1oz Ball Slug			No Bid	\$ 610.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
93	.223 CALIBER, 62 GRAIN PR 223R4 223 REM 62 CLUB PS (1000RD/CASE)			No Bid	\$ 599.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
97	Hornady TAP .223 Rem-62 Gr-Barrier (mfgr# 83285) (1000RD/CASE)			No Bid	\$ 990.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
99	Winchester 40cal / FMJ / 180 grain			No Bid	\$ 278.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
100	Winchester 45cal / FMJ / 230 grain			No Bid	\$ 315.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
101	Winchester Ranger 40cal /Bonded JHP / 180 grain (RA40B)			No Bid	\$ 435.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
102	Winchester Ranger 40cal/ Bonded JHP / 165 grain (RA40BA)			No Bid	\$ 430.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
103	Winchester Ranger 357/ Bonded JHP / 125 grain (RA357SB)			No Bid	\$ 580.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid