

IFB 2020-125 Firearms, Ammunition, and Accessories

Awarded vendor: GT Distributors, Inc.

Line #	Description	Current Price	New Price	Percentage Change
1	9MM with night sights, 3-17 round magazines	\$ 409.00	\$409.00	0.00%
2	Simulator Handgun, Fixed Sights, 5lb	\$ 454.00	\$454.00	0.00%
9	Viking Tactics Padded Vickers Combat Sling, Black	\$ 34.06	\$34.06	0.00%
10	AR-15/M16 Vickers Combat Sling	\$ 39.12	\$40.59	3.76%
11	1" HK Style Sling Snap Hook	\$ 6.46	\$6.46	0.00%
12	DS-SR07-IT Dual Pressure Switch	\$ 151.14	\$151.14	0.00%
18	Optics, Weapon Sight	\$ 534.78	\$569.64	6.52%
28	Magazines, AR-15 PMAG-D-60 223/5.56 60RD Polymer, Black	\$ 94.91	\$98.56	3.85%
29	Magazines, AR-15 PMAG GEN M3 223/5.56 30RD Polymer, Black	\$ 10.92	\$10.92	0.00%
30	Magazines, PMAG 17GL9, 3 Pack (Glock 17)	\$ 28.39	\$32.77	15.43%
31	Ammunition, Training: 9mm Yellow	\$ 37.50	\$37.50	0.00%
35	HD XR Night Sight Set, Glock 17, 19, 22, 26, 32, 37 orange frnt	\$ 108.79	\$108.79	0.00%
36	Pistol LightX300-U	\$ 225.21	\$225.21	0.00%
39	7395 7TSALSHOLSTER/W/WEAPON LIGHT	\$ 88.76	\$91.57	3.17%
49	Tri-Fold Disposable Restaints, 6-pack	\$ 18.10	\$18.10	0.00%
50	Mag Pouch, 79 Open Top 2x	\$ 22.44	\$23.58	5.08%
51	Indirect Fire Munitions	\$ 20.30	\$20.92	3.05%
52	LMT 40MM Light Weight Single Shot Launcher	\$ 860.34	\$974.76	13.30%
53	Chemical Munitions	\$ 23.01	\$25.33	10.08%
54	Chemical Ferret Rounds	\$ 23.00	\$25.32	10.09%
55	Pyrotechnic Penetrating Rounds	\$ 23.00	\$25.32	10.09%
60	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 8 for items not Listed Herein (Geissele)	10%	10%	0.00%
61	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 9 and 10 for items Not Listed Herein (Blue Force Gear)	10%	10%	0.00%
63	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 12 and 36 for items Not Listed Herein (SureFire)	5%	5%	0.00%
64	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 13, 39 and 50 for items not Listed Herein (Safariland)	25%	25%	0.00%
66	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 18 and 37 for items Not Listed Herein (Eotech)	10%	10%	0.00%
67	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 19 for items not Listed Herein (Troy Industries)	10%	10%	0.00%
72	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 28, 29 and 30 for items Not Listed Herein (Magpul)	10%	10%	0.00%
73	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on lines 31 and 32 for items Not Listed Herein (Precision Gun Specialities)	10%	10%	0.00%
76	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 35 for items not Listed Herein (Trijicon)	10%	10%	0.00%
80	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 42 for items not Listed Herein (5.11)	25%	25%	0.00%
85	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 48 for items not Listed Herein (Steiner)	5%	5%	0.00%

Awarded vendor: GT Distributors, Inc.

Line #	Description	Current Price	New Price	Percentage Change
86	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer bid on line 49 for items not Listed Herein (ASP, Inc)	10%	<u>10%</u>	0.00%
87	Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for manufacturer for lines 51, 52, 53, 54 and 55 for items Not Listed Herein (Defense Technology)	5%	<u>5%</u>	0.00%
Average Perce				2.48%

Add lines to contract on Change Order #2

Line #	Description	Mfgr	Mfgno	GT Distributors, Inc.	Galls	TK Tactical	SilencerCo	Precision
				Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price
13 ALT1	GOULD AND GOODRICH K FORCE HOLSTERLP653 BRH G17	Gould & Goodrich	K391-G17W	\$ <u>104.44</u>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
21	AR-15 ACE ARFX-E Skeleton Stock	Double Star or Collin County approved equal	A110B	\$ <u>107.31</u>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
65	Catalog Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for all Hornady items, except for the Hornady items already list in original bid, the discount percentage can be from 0%-100%.			<u>40%</u>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
69	Catalog Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for Double Star items, except for the Double Star items already list in original bid, the discount percentage can be from 0%-100%.			<u>1%</u>	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid