2020-186 Safety Wear

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Line #

Description

Mfgr Mfgno

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit |

10

11

Helmet Hut, Black

PROTECH FAST ATTACK VEST - ADVANCED

WEBLESS SYSTEM, Black

COMBAT APPLICATION TOURNIQUET (C-A-

T

FM53 Gas Mask Specialist Responder Kit

Gas Mask Drop Leg/Pouch

Standard Issue Ballistic M Frame Alpha

SUPPRESSOR SENSOR GLOVES

First Spear or
Collin County
approved

equal

BlueForee-
Gearor-Collin-
County-
approved- BT-TFKN-Filed-003-
egual Bk
Safariland or
Collin County
approved

equal

BlueForce-

approved-

egual
North

American
Rescue or
Collin County
approved
equal

Avon
Protection
Systems or
Collin County
approved
equal

TYR Tactical
or Collin
County
approved
equal

Oakley or
Collin County
approved
equal
Outdoor
Research or
Collin County
approved

TYR-OD730-CAN

266840

equal

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 177.38 No Bid

No Bid S

No Bid

63
No-Bid

No Bid

No Bid $

64

22.22 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid

No Bid § 1,155.00

$ 42.64

$ 130.00

$ 57.20

General Notes

Discontinued replaced by line

Discontinued replaced by line



2020-186 Sa

fety Wear

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Line #

Description

Mfgr

Mfgno

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit

13

14

15

16

Cobra Cuffs

FLXIIIA-1 w/2 Hi Lite Carriers and Soft
Trauma Insert

Ballistic Vest with Revolution Carrier / Level
Il

Ballistic Vest with Revolution Carrier / Level
1l

Cobra Cuffs
or Collin
County
approved
equal

Point Blank or
Collin County
approved
equal

Armor
Express or
Collin County
approved
equal

Armor
Express or
Collin County
approved
equal

MS24D-250-6-BK

16 ALT2 :

POINT BLANK BC3A WITH HILITE CARRER

POINT BLANK

HILITE BC3A

17

18

19

20

21

22

PROTECH FAST ATTACK VEST - Hardwire 68
Level llIA, Black

PROTECH Collar - Hardwire 68 Level llIA,
Black

PROTECH Throat - Hardwire 68 Level llIA,
Black

PROTECH Structured Upper Arms -
Hardwire 68 Level IlIA, Black

PROTECH Lower AB/Spine Protector -
Hardwire 68 Level IlIA, Black

PROTECH Enhanced Groin AWS - Hardwire
68 Level llIA, Black

Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal

PTA-FAV-HW68-
3A

PTA-CLR-HW68-
3A

PTA-THR-HW68-
3A

PTA-SBCP-HW68-
3A

PTA-SPN-HW68-
3A

PTA-ERGN-AWS-
HW68-3A

No Bid

$ 749.00

$ 521.00

No Bid
$ 562.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,213.89

$ 290.38

$ 246.18

$ 637.83

$ 277.60

$ 453.20

$ 16.38

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

General Notes



2020-186 Safety Wear

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Line #

Description

Mfgr

Mfgno

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit

23

24

26

27

28

29

30

31

32

34

PROTECH Large ID Panel 8.5"x3", Black

PROTECH Small ID Panel 6"x2", Black

PROTECH X CAL DTC1 Type Il ICW 10X12
Multi-Curve, Black

PROTECH X CAL DTC1 Type Il ICW 10X12
Multi-Curve, Black

XPRT Tactical Pant, Green

XPRT Rapid Shirt, Green

XPRT Waterproof Jacket, Black

XPRT Waterproof Pant, Black

Quest 4D GTX Forces Boots, Black

P7 Integrated Helmet System

Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal
Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal

5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal

5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal

5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal

5.11 or Collin
County
approved
equal
Salomon or
Collin County
approved
equal
ARRADVARK
or Collin
County
approved
equal

PTA-I-POL-LG

PTA-I-POL-SM

PTA-1345363

PTA-1345363

74068

72090

48332

48333

373478

ATHQP7IHS-LT-XX-
00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,095.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 128.33

$ 108.59

$ 301.09

$ 246.79

No Bid

$ 7.14

$ 7.14

$ 279.07

$ 279.07

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 88.40

General Notes

discontinued replaced by line
62



2020-186 Safety Wear

Nardis Public Safety

AARDVARK

Municipal Emergency
Services, Inc

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC

GALLS, LLC

Line #

Description

Mfgr

Mfgno

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit

Unit

36

37

38

39

40

41

41 ALT1

42

43

44

Clarus Systems Headset Kit

Motorola APX Cable Adaptor

Dual Comms Splitter

Micro Wireless PTT

Clarus XPR

Ear Piece Molds

Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal

Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal

Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal

Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal

Silynx or
Collin County
approved
equal

Superior
Sound

Technology or

Collin County
approved
equal

CLAR-T-N-002

CA0117-03

CA0175-01

MWPTT-K-004-01

CXPRQH-D-002

TACTICAL EAR GADGETS GHOST EAR
MOLDAP943

EARPHONE

CONNECTION EP-EMRL

Antenna Relocation Kit x 2 for Dual Comms
TCIM.AS.T.

Ballistic Blanket - 32"-72" IlIA

Ballistic Shield Phalanx Level [l1A+

Safariland or
Collin County
approved
equal

Point Blank

Enterprises or

Collin County
approved
equal

Point Blank

Enterprises or

Collin County
approved
equal

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 1,999.00

$ 3,689.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 930.80

$ 162.24

$ 234.00

$ 260.00

$ 676.00

No Bid

$ 4.68

$ 95.15 No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

General Notes



2020-186 Safety Wear

Municipal Emergency

Nardis Public Safety | AARDVARK | GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Services, Inc
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
Avon
Protection
Systems or
= Collin County
approved 70501-555, 70501+
Avon C50 First Responder Kit equal 556 & 70501-557 | No Bid No Bid $ 609.71 | No Bid No Bid
Avon
Protection
Systems or
47 Collin County
approved
CTCF50Riot Agent Filter 4 Pack equal AVON-72606-3 No Bid No Bid $ 151.53 | No Bid No Bid
United Shield
or Collin
48 County
United Shield Riot Face Shield with Rail approved
Adapter equal SOD-RFS-RAIL No Bid No Bid $ 112.80 No Bid No Bid
Safariland or
Collin County
49 approved
Ballistic Panel SX Level llIA, A7 equal No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 1,042.10 | No Bid
Safariland or
Collin County
51 approved
2.0 Soft Trauma Plate 5x 8 equal No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 35.64 | No Bid
Safariland or
= Collin County
Model X CAL DTC1 Type Il ICW 10X12 Multi approved
Curve Plate equal 1166518 No Bid No Bid No Bid S 133.33 | No Bid
Safariland or
Collin County
53 approved
PROTECH 2.0 Oregon City Carrier equal DN6566 No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 201.08 | No Bid
54  Ballistic Vest $ 769.83 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
POINT BLANK AX3A LEVEL3A WITH HILITE
CARRIER, BLACK
55 Ballistic Vest No Bid No Bid $ 115.44 | No Bid No Bid
POINT BLANK SPEED PLATE, 8 X 10 MULTI
CURVE SHOOTER'S CUT
56  Ballistic Vest $ 604.38 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
POINT BLANK BCIIIA (LEVEL 3A) w/(2) Hilite
Carriers
57  Ballistic Vest $ 662.58 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid

POINT BLANK BCIIIA (LEVEL 3A) w/(2) HILITE

CARRIERS, SOFT TRAUMA PLATE AND
ARMORVENT

General Notes



2020-186 Safety Wear

Nardis Public Safety | AARDVARK | unicipal Emergency | b o eIBUTORS, INC GALLS, LLC
Services, Inc
Line#  Description Mfgr Mfgno Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
58  Helmet $ 526.00 | No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
POINT BLANK HELMET LEVEL 3A, HIGH, MID
OR LOW CUT WITH STANDARD HARNESS
SIDE RAILS & FRONT MOUNT
SAFARILAND BODY ARMOR U1 FRONT
59 OPENING UNIFORM ITEM# SBA-U1-FRNT-
DN6701 COLOR: DARK NAVY No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 259.17 No Bid
60 SBA M2 CARRIER No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 111.91 No Bid
BOTHELL PD CARRIER W/ PEN POCKETS
61 AND NAPOLEON POCKETS No Bid No Bid No Bid $ 259.17 No Bid
CamelBak or
Collin County
62 approved
Mil Spec Crux™ 1.5L Reservoir equal CB-2053001015 No Bid No Bid S 3758 | $ 32.54 | No Bid
Micro Trauma Kit Blue Force
NOW! - MOLLE Gear or Collin
63 Helium Whisper - County
Advanced Supplies - approved
Black equal No Bid $  211.95 [NoBid No Bid $ 169.95
Blue Force
Gear or Collin
64 County
M-TQH-TNS-RG Tourniquet NOW! Strap approved
Tourniquet Holder - Ranger Green equal M-TQH-TNS-RG No Bid $ 14.55 | No Bid No Bid $ 16.92

General Notes



