
2022-121
DRAFT ONLY UNTIL AWARD

IFB 2022-121 Signs, Sign Materials, and Hardware

Total Price $53,500.80 Total Price $318,298.16
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended

1
SECTION 1 - REFLECTIVE COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN FACES: Collin County Road Sign 
Face 9 in. x 30 in. 600 each No Bid $6.37 $3,822.00

2
SECTION 1 - REFLECTIVE COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN FACES: Collin County Road Sign 
Face 9 in. x 36 in. 50 each No Bid $7.63 $381.50

3
SECTION 1 - REFLECTIVE COLLIN COUNTY ROAD SIGN FACES: Percentage off 
catalog/pricelist on any similar items required by Collin County not specifically 1 No Bid 0.0%

4 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: Octagonal 30 in. x 30 in. 200 each No Bid $32.00 $6,400.00
5 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: S.D.H.P.T., 24 in. x 48 in. 200 each No Bid $43.84 $8,768.00
6 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: S.D.H.P.T., 30 in. x 24 in. 200 each No Bid $27.40 $5,480.00
7 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: S.D.H.P.T., 36 in. x 36 in. 50 each No Bid $49.32 $2,466.00
8 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: S.D.H.P.T., 12 in. x 18 in. 50 each No Bid $9.61 $480.50
9 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 18 in. 100 each No Bid $14.51 $1,451.00

10
SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: S.D.H.P.T., 12 in. x 12 in. HANDICAPPED SYMBOL 1 each No Bid $6.75 $6.75

11 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: BUSES ONLY, 18 in. x 24 in. 1 each No Bid $16.44 $16.44
12 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: ENTRANCE ONLY, 24 in. x 24 in. 1 each No Bid $21.92 $21.92

13 SECTION 2 - PREFABRICATED SIGNS: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar 
items required by Collin County not specifically addressed in SECTION 2. 1 No Bid 0.0%

14
SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: NO DUMPING - BY ORDER OF COMMISSIONERS COURT, 
18 in. x 24 in. 50 each $28.00 $1,400.00 $22.56 $1,128.00

15
SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: COLLIN COUNTY MAINTENANCE SIGNS - 30 in. x 24 in. 1 each $48.00 $48.00 $37.60 $37.60

16 SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: HANDICAPPED PARKING SIGNS, 12 in. x 18 in. 1 each $15.80 $15.80 $11.49 $11.49
17 SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: HANDICAPPED PARKING SIGNS, 18 in. x 24 in. 1 each $28.00 $28.00 $22.56 $22.56

18
SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: Temporary Roll-Up Sign, 36" with vinyl pockets, DAYBrite 
Orange, Velcro straps 100 each $143.25 $14,325.00 $68.98 $6,898.00

19
SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: Custom Legend Temporary Roll-Up Sign, 36" with vinyl 
pockets, DAYBrite Orange, Velcro straps 100 each $143.75 $14,375.00 $68.98 $6,898.00

20 SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: Mesh Sign Ribs, 36", fiberglass 100 each $13.98 $1,398.00 $13.95 $1,395.00

21
SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: Sign Stand, galvanized steel, folding, telescoping legs - 
Length - 71 in, Width - 30 x 44 in, Weight 23 lb 100 each $219.11 $21,911.00 $39.95 $3,995.00

22
SECTION 3 - SPECIAL SIGNS: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically addressed in SECTION 3. 1 10.0% 0.0%
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23 SECTION 4 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 30 in. x 30 in. 200 each No Bid $21.19 $4,238.00
24 SECTION 4 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 24 in. x 48 in. 50 each No Bid $27.12 $1,356.00
25 SECTION 4 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 24 in. 50 each No Bid $10.17 $508.50
26 SECTION 4 - SIGN FACES: S.D.H.P.T., 18 in. x 18 in. 50 each No Bid $7.63 $381.50
27 SECTION 4 - SIGN FACES: Black border, 30 in. x 30 in. (Blank Face) 50 each No Bid $21.19 $1,059.50

28
SECTION 4 - SIGN FACES: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically addressed in SECTION 4. 1 No Bid 0.0%

29 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 6 in. x 12 in. 200 each No Bid $2.81 $562.00
30 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 12 in. x 18 in. 100 each No Bid $5.68 $568.00
31 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 18 in. x 18 in. 100 each No Bid $8.51 $851.00
32 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 30 in. x 30 in. 300 each No Bid $23.72 $7,116.00
33 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 18 in. x 24 in. 200 each No Bid $11.29 $2,258.00
34 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 24 in. x 30 in. 200 each No Bid $18.98 $3,796.00
35 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 24 in. x 48 in. 200 each No Bid $30.43 $6,086.00
36 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: 36 in. x 36 in. 50 each No Bid $34.38 $1,719.00
37 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: Extruded blanks, 9 in. x 30 in. 400 each No Bid $13.82 $5,528.00
38 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: Extruded blanks, 9 in. x 36 in. 50 each No Bid $15.81 $790.50

39 SECTION 5 - ANODIZED ALUMINUM BLANKS: Percentage off catalog/priceliston any 
similar items required by Collin County not specifically addressed in SECTION 5 1 No Bid 0.0%

40
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M High Intensity Prismatic Reflective Sheeting Series 
3930 - 36" x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $607.50 $12,150.00

41
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M High Intensity Prismatic Reflective Sheeting Series 
3930 - 48" x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $810.00 $16,200.00

42
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Advanced Engineer Grade Prismatic Sheeting Series 
7930 - 36" x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $405.00 $8,100.00

43
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Advanced Engineer Grade Prismatic Sheeting Series 
7930 - 48" x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $540.00 $10,800.00

44
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Diamond Grade VIP Fluorescent Reflective Sheeting 
Series 3980 - 36" x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $1,102.50 $22,050.00

45
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Diamond Grade VIP Fluorescent Reflective Sheeting 
Series 3980 - 48" x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $1,470.00 $29,400.00

46
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M ElectroCut Graphic Film Series 7725 - 36" x 50 yards 
(various colors) 20 roll No Bid $652.50 $13,050.00

47
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M ElectroCut Graphic Film Series 7725 - 48" x 50 yards 
(various colors) 20 roll No Bid $870.00 $17,400.00

48
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M ElectroCut Film Series 1170C - 36" x 50 yards (various 
colors) 20 roll No Bid $472.52 $9,450.40
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49
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M ElectroCut Film Series 1170C - 48" x 50 yards (various 
colors) 20 roll No Bid $630.00 $12,600.00

50
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Engineer Grade Reflective Sheeting Series 3200 - 36" 
x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $405.00 $8,100.00

51
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Engineer Grade Reflective Sheeting Series 3200 - 48" 
x 50 yards (various colors) 20 roll No Bid $540.00 $10,800.00

52
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Scotchlite Reflective Graphic Film Series 680 - 36" x 
50 yards (various colors) 10 roll No Bid $2,425.50 $24,255.00

53
SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Scotchlite Reflective Graphic Film Series 680 - 6" x 50 
yards (various colors) 10 roll No Bid $404.25 $4,042.50

54 SECTION 6 - SIGN SHEETING: 3M Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically addressed in SECTION 6. 1 No Bid 0.0%

55 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Hex HED flanged bolts, 5/16 Diameter x 1 3/4 3200 each No Bid No Bid
56 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: I.D. hex head flanged nuts, 5/16 Diameter 6400 each No Bid $0.15 $960.00
57 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: I.D. Tufbolt, 5/16" x 3" 2000 each No Bid $0.55 $1,100.00
58 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: 10 foot 2# galvanized post, tapered, punch full length 400 each No Bid $31.40 $12,560.00
59 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE:3 1/2 foot 3# galvanized post, tapered, punch full length 400 each No Bid $16.17 $6,468.00
60 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Sign Post with Base Post 200 each No Bid $47.60 $9,520.00
61 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Sign Brackets 200 each No Bid No Bid
62 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Opposite Slot Brackets 200 each No Bid No Bid
63 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Sign Cross Brackets 200 each No Bid No Bid
64 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: 5 1/2 inch extruded blade cap for 3 inch round post 50 each No Bid $9.50 $475.00
65 SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Carsonite sign posts or Collin County approved equal 500 each No Bid No Bid

66
SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: 2-sided Carsonite sign posts or Collin County approved 
equal 500 each No Bid No Bid

67
SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Long, white delineator posts, 3 in. wide x 48 in. long 50 each No Bid $39.24 $1,962.00

68
SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Lap splice assembly (gold) U-Channel breakaway accessory 
for 3# and 4# post 50 each No Bid $7.15 $357.50

69
SECTION 7 - HARDWARE: Percentage off catalog/pricelist on any similar items 
required by Collin County not specifically addressed in SECTION 7. 1 No Bid 0.0%

DELIVERY:

LINE ITEM NOTES:
1 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

2 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

Faces NO Metal

Faces NO Metal

30-45 Days for Signs, Faces, Hardware - 
180 for Uchannel Posts

Delivery times will vary depending on 
the individual line items, third party 
constraints and line item availability.  
We anticipate most, if not all of the 

line items we have bid, should deliver 
within 14 business days from date of 

order.
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14 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

15 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

16 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

17 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

21 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

56 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

57 Vulcan Inc., dba Vulcan Signs, Vulcan Aluminum (Vulcan Inc.)

Vulcan Brand Signs Stand Item#002970 Galvanized Tripod Sign Stand 14 gauge

Vulcan Part #002736 5/16" Hex Nut Aluminum

Vulcan Part# 021882

.080 metal HIP Digital Print

.080 metal HIP Digital Print

.080 metal HIP Digital Print

.080 metal HIP Digital Print
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