IFB 2022-239 Liquid Asphalt

PRIMARY
SECONDARY
LINE 13 AWARD

P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC dba P2

Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.

Wright Asphalt Products Company LLC dba

Emulsions Wright Asphalt Products Company
Total Price $1,492.57| Total Price $28,721.50| Total Price $32,115.50
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
DELIVERED
. X . No Bid (per bid clarification bid alternate item
1 CRS-1 --- Delivered 500 |gallon No Bid No Bid
only)
1ALT1 [CWE-2 (mfgr P Squared) 500 |[gallon $2.99 S 1,495.00
1 ALT2 [CRS-2 (mfgr Wright Asphalt) 500 |[gallon $3.50 $1,750.00]
2 CRS-1P --- Delivered 300 |gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
3 CRS-2P --- Delivered 300 |[gallon No Bid $7.15 $2,145.00] $3.90 $1,170.00|
4 CSS-1 --- Delivered 8000 |[gallon No Bid $3.31 $26,480.00|No Bid
4 ALT1 |P2S1 (mfgr P Squared) 8000 |[gallon $2.69 S  21,520.00
5 MC-250 --- Delivered 2000 |gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
6 MC-30 --- Delivered 1000 |gallon No Bid No Bid $4.58 $4,580.00]
7 MC-3000 --- Delivered 1000 [gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
8 MC-800 --- Delivered 500 |gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
9 RC-250 --- Delivered 5000 |[gallon No Bid No Bid $4.90 $24,500.00]
10 |RC-3000 --- Delivered 1000 [gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
11 RC-800 --- Delivered 500 |gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
12 ROC (Road Over Coat) --- Delivered 500 |gallon $2.82 $1,410.00fNo Bid No Bid
Plizzse SR e cosit o 220 ol No Bid (per bid clarification bid alternate item
13 [demurrage charges beyond the three (3) only)
hours included in the quoted delivery cost.
Please reference Section 4.8. 1 hour $80.00 $80.00] $90.00 $90.00]
2 FREE HOURS UNLOADING THEN $100 PER
et HOUR 1 hour $100.00 $100.00
Price with Price with Price with
PICKED UP Mileage Mileage Mileage
14 No Bid (per bid clarificationbid alternate item
CRS-1 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid only)
14 ALT1 |CWE-2 (mfgr P Squared) 1 gallon $2.99 $150.49 150.49]
14 ALT2 |CRS-2 (mfgr Wright Asphalt) 1 gallon $3.15 $240.68 240.68|
15 CRS-1P --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
16 CRS-2P --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid $3.40 $137.15 $137.15 $3.55 $241.05 $241.05
17 CSS-1 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid $3.10 $136.85 $136.85]No Bid
17 ALT1 |P2S1 (mfgr P Squared) 1 gallon $2.44 $149.94 149.94
18 MC-250 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
19 MC-30 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid $4.25 $241.75 $241.75
20 MC-3000 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
21 MC-800 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
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22 |RC-250 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid $4.55 $242.05 $242.05
23 RC-3000 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
24 RC-800 --- Pick-Up 1 gallon No Bid No Bid No Bid
25 [ROC (Road Over Coat)--- Pick-Up 1 gallon $2.57 $150.07 $150.07]No Bid No Bid

Delivery in Calendar Days from Date of Order:
Supplier Notes:

2 business days

1 day

1 day - 24 hours

Minimum 3000 gallons;
Plant location 516 South McLennan Loop, Elm Mott, TX
Approx 236 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate 62.5 = $147.50

Lines 3 and 4: Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff.

Pump and hose charge is $90.00 per load. For equipment
ordered, but not used, carrier may charge up to $400.00.
No minimum, however full transport load is 5500 gallons;
Plant location is 209 Robert Nance Road, Mount Pleasant,
Texas 75455104 miles

Approx 214 miles roundtrip with IRS tax rate 62.5 = $133.75

Minimum 5500 gallons;
Plant location 1505 Custer Road, Brownwood, TX 76801
Approx 380 miles roudtrip with IRS tax rate 62.5 = $237.50

2022-239

DRAFT ONLY UNTIL AWARD



	Lines

