IFB 2020-294 Firearms, Conducted Electrical Weapons and Accessories

Tk Tactical (Colorado Sunrise
Holdings LLC)

Municipal Emergency Services,
Inc

Axon Enterprise, Inc.

Total Price] $0.00]  Total Price] $3,105.00

Total Price] __ $86,975.00]

Line#  Description

QTY uom

2 Axon Enterprise or Collin
TASER Handle: X26P CEW, Black with 4 Year Warranty County approved equal 11002 25 each

4 Axon Enterprise or Collin

TASER Battery:Tactical Performance Power Magazine (TPPM) County approved equal 22012 25 each

6 Axon Enterprise or Collin
TASER Holster: X26P Blackhawk, Left Hand County approved equal 11504 25 each

8 Axon Enterprise or Collin
TASER Cartridge:X26 - 25 ft Extra Penetration Live Cartridges County approved equal 44203 25 each

10 Axon Enterprise or Collin
TASER Cartridge:X2 - 25 ft Live Smart Cartridges County approved equal 22151 25 each

12 Axon Enterprise or Collin
TASER Holster: X2, Blackhawk, Left Hand County approved equal 22504 25 each

Estimated

Extended

$10,979.00

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

Extended

No Bid

No Bid

$37.26

$37.26 $776.25!

No Bid

No Bid

$37.26

$37.26 $776.25!

Extended

1,396.00 $34,900.00

65.00 $1,625.00
$64.00 $1,600.00|
$29.00

33.00 $825.00|

36.00

38.00 $950.00|
$78.00 $1,950.00|
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