IFB 2020-368 Supplies: Jail Kitchen Non-Food

Interboro Packaging Corp. Infinity Supply & Service, Inc Empire Paper
Line # Description Unit Unit Unit
1 Scouring Pad purple pots and pans abrasive
or Collin County approved equal. No Bid No Bid $ 21.34]
Brand Bid 3M
Product Number 59033
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24 CS
Scrub Pad green general purpose or Collin
2 County approved equal. No Bid $ 16.88 No Bid
Brand Bid
Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Griddle Pad 4 in. x 5.5 in. or Collin County
approved equal.

Brand Bid

Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Hairnets or Collin County approved equal.
Brand Bid

Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

$11.98 No Bid
MPR-70424/305-FH20
MPR-70424/305-FH20
Count: 144/Box
Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

3 Toothpicks round or Collin County approved
equal. No Bid No Bid $ 142.26|
Brand Bid ROYAL PAPER
Product Number RPPR820
Quantity per Case/Pkg 24/800 CS
Oven Cleaner aerosol spray or Collin County

9  approved equal. No Bid No Bid ¢ 51.91
Brand Bid SPARTAN
Product Number 628000
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12/Cs

9 ALTlEOven Cleaner aerosol spray 180z Lead time

:may take up to 2 weeks No Bid No Bid|No Bid
Brand Bid
Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg
Griddle Cleaner liquid Scotch Brite type or

10 Collin County approved equal. No Bid No Bid $ 64.92
Brand Bid 3M
Product Number 29603

3.2 0Z PACKS / 40

Quantity per Case/Pkg PER CASE

a Paper Bags #12 lunch sized or Collin County
approved equal. No Bid $ 23.33 No Bid
Brand Bid
Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg
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IFB 2020-368 Supplies: Jail Kitchen Non-Food

Interboro Packaging Corp.

Infinity Supply & Service, Inc

Empire Paper

Quantity per Case/Pkg

14 Napkin white 1/4 fold 17 in. x 17 in. or Collin
County approved equal.
Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg
Forks heavy plastic white or Collin County

15 approved equal.

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg
Spoons heavy plastic white or Collin County

16 approved equal.

Brand Bid
Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg
Bowls 16 oz. squat style styrofoam or Collin

17 County approved equal.
Brand Bid
Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg

Plate white undivided heavy plastic 9 in. or
Collin County approved equal.

Brand Bid
Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$ 63.84 No Bid
4000/cs

$ 24.10 No Bid
$ 24.10 No Bid
$ 57.29 No Bid
Wincup

F16

500

103.24 No Bid

Line # Description Unit Unit Unit
Snack Plates 6 in. styrofoam white or Collin
12 County approved equal. No Bid $ 36.47 No Bid
Brand Bid
Product Number

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Delete off contract,
approved by Department
as vendor's new proposed
price can not be justified
and Department barely
order this item for the past
years.

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price
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IFB 2020-368 Supplies: Jail Kitchen Non-Food

Interboro Packaging Corp. Infinity Supply & Service, Inc Empire Paper
Line # Description Unit Unit Unit
Cup clear plastic 16 oz. capacity crystal hard
23 or Collin County approved equal. No Bid $ 79.03 No Bid
Brand Bid Karat
Product Number C-KC16
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000
Hinged Container foam 9in. x 9in. x 3 in. 3-
24 compartment or Collin County approved
equal. No Bid $ 32.57 No Bid
Brand Bid Dart
Product Number 90HT3R
Quantity per Case/Pkg 200
on Sandwich Bags fold top 6 1/2 in. x 7 1/2 in.
or Collin County approved equal. No Bid No Bid $ 10.61
Brand Bid ELKAY
Product Number DP657
Quantity per Case/Pkg 2000/CS
% Plastic Wrap 18 in. x 2000 ft. roll or Collin
County approved equal. No Bid $ 19.48 No Bid
Brand Bid HiValu
Product Number 73000009
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1 roll 18"x2000'
Pan Liner ovenable parchment paper 16 in.
57 X 24in. sheets or Collin County approved
equal. No Bid $ 41.74 No Bid
Brand Bid Prime Source
Product Number 75003991
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1000
Roll Towels Enmotion 800 ft. roll or Collin
28 County approved equal. No Bid $ 45.56 No Bid
Brand Bid Morcon
Product Number VT106
Quantity per Case/Pkg 6

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Delete off contract as no
bids due to vendor can not
hold price

Plate heavy clear plastic; 9 in 180 ct Finelie
Setting or Collin County approved equal. No Bid 144.85 No Bid

Brand Bid
Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg 180
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