

IFB 2022-316 Road Materials, Emulsified Asphalts

PRIMARY
SECONDARY
ALL LINE 7 AWARD

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	P Squared Emulsion Plants, LLC dba P2 Emulsions		Wright Asphalt Products Company, LLC dba Wright Asphalt Products Company		Ergon Asphalt & Emulsions, Inc.	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
1	DELIVERED - CRS-2TR	15000	gallon	No Bid		\$3.60	\$54,000.00	No Bid	
2	DELIVERED - CRS-2	735000	gallon	No Bid		\$3.60	\$2,646,000.00	\$2.91	\$2,138,850.00
3	DELIVERED - CRS-2H	450000	gallon	No Bid		No Bid		\$2.91	\$1,309,500.00
4	DELIVERED - CSS-1H	37000	gallon	No Bid		\$3.60	\$133,200.00	\$2.91	\$107,670.00
5	DELIVERED - Dust Control Oil, CSS-1S or Collir	105000	gallon	No Bid		No Bid - per bid clarification (bid alternate item only)		\$2.96	\$310,800.00
6	DELILVERED - AE-P	22000	gallon	No Bid		No Bid		\$3.96	\$87,120.00
7	Please state the cost for per hour demurrage charges beyond the three (3) hours included in the quoted delivery cost. Please reference Section 4.8.	1	hour	\$80.00		\$100.00	Demurrage charges start beyond two (2) hours	\$90.00	

				Price/gal with mileage		Price/gal with mileage		Price/gal with mileage	
8	PICKED UP - CRS-2TR	1	gallon	No Bid		\$3.25	\$260.75	No Bid	
9	PICKED UP - CRS-2	1	gallon	No Bid		\$3.25	\$260.75	\$2.70	\$131.45
10	PICKED UP - CRS-2H	1	gallon	No Bid		No Bid		\$2.70	\$131.45
11	PICKED UP - CSS-1H	1	gallon	No Bid		\$3.25	\$260.75	\$2.70	\$131.45
12	PICKED UP - Dust Control Oil, CSS-1S or Collin	1	gallon	No Bid		No Bid - per bid clarification (bid alternate item only)		\$2.75	\$131.50
13	PICKED UP - AE-P	1	gallon	No Bid		No Bid		\$3.75	\$132.50

ALTERNATE BID PRODUCTS				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended
2ALT-D	DELIVERED - CWE-2	735000	gallon	\$3.05	\$ 2,241,750.00				
4ALT-D	DELIVERED - P2S1	37000	gallon	\$2.82	\$ 104,340.00				
5ALT-1D	DELIVERED - Lucky 7	105000	gallon	\$1.60	\$ 168,000.00				
5ALT-2D	DELIVERED - TR Fog	105000	gallon			\$3.36	\$ 352,800.00		
6 ALT-D	DELIVERED - P2 RTU	22000	gallon	\$2.11	\$ 46,420.00				

				Price/gal with mileage		Price/gal with mileage		Price/gal with mileage	
2ALT-P	PICKED UP - CWE-2	1	gallon	\$2.80	\$156.55				
4ALT-P	PICKED UP - P2S1	1	gallon	\$2.43	\$156.18				
5ALT-1P	PICKED UP - Lucky 7	1	gallon	\$1.32	\$155.07				
5ALT-2P	PICKED UP - TR Fog	1	gallon			\$3.00	\$260.50		

6 ALT-P	PICKED UP - P2 RTU	1	gallon	\$1.68	\$155.43
---------	--------------------	---	--------	--------	----------

Address for PICKED UP evaluation: 4361 North Central Expressway, McKinney, TX 75071 (GIS coordinates 33.244353, -96.627211)	516 S. McLennan Loop, Elm Mott, TX 76640 246 miles roundtrip x .625 = \$153.75	1505 Custer Rd., Brownwood, TX 76801 412 miles roundtrip x .625 = \$257.50	209 Robert Nance Rd, Mt. Pleasant, TX 75455 206 miles roundtrip x .625 = \$128.75
---	---	---	--

**Delivery in Calendar Days from Date of Order:**

**Supplier Notes:**

2 business days	1 day - 24 hours	1 day
Minimum 3000 gallons for delivered.	Demurrage only allows two (2) hours. Minimum pickup at plant is 750 gallons. Submitted delivered prices are based on full transport truck loads of 5500 gallons. Less than transport trucks can be delivered at CPU price plus \$2500 outgoing freight per load; Cancellation policy: Monday delivery cancelled by 11am on prior Sunday, loads to be delivered during the week cancelled by 2pm prior workday; Loads cancelled in transit will be billed at cost; Returned loads will be billed an additional one-half outgoing freight \$1250 (diluted products can not be returned); Returned loads require notice; Pump charge \$100 per load (If requested - not provided for hot asphalts); Diversion fee \$75 per additional stop plus additional miles; Layover charge \$650 per truck per night.	Full transport load is 5500 gallons. No minimum on pickup at plant. Return freight is one-half of the outgoing tariff. Pump and hose charge is \$90.00 per load. For equipment ordered, but not used, carrier may charge up to \$400.00. - Call 903-572-9839 to order