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IFB 2022-283 Road Materials, Asphaltic Concrete

PRIMARY AWARD
SECONDARY AWARD

Total Price Total Price Total Price Total Price
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
WEST ZONES - PICK UP with mileage calculated in bid price
4361 North Central Expressway, McKinney, TX 75071

1 PICKUP West Zones: Type B 400 ton No Bid No Bid $85.00 $120.00 $48,000.00 $79.00 $97.75 $39,100.00
2 PICKUP West Zones: Type B with RAP and/or RAS 400 ton No Bid $85.00 $131.25 $52,500.00 $70.00 $105.00 $42,000.00 $71.00 $89.75 $35,900.00
3 PICKUP West Zones: Type C 50 ton No Bid No Bid $90.00 $125.00 $6,250.00 $85.75 $104.50 $5,225.00
4 PICKUP West Zones: Type C with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton No Bid $85.00 $131.25 $6,562.50 $75.00 $110.00 $5,500.00 $77.75 $96.50 $4,825.00
5 PICKUP West Zones: Type D 3000 ton $22.00 $64.50 $193,500.00 No Bid $91.75 $126.75 $380,250.00 $85.75 $104.50 $313,500.00
6 PICKUP West Zones: Type D with RAP and/or RAS 3000 ton $31.74 $74.24 $222,720.00 $85.00 $131.25 $393,750.00 $76.75 $111.75 $335,250.00 $77.75 $96.50 $289,500.00
7 PICKUP West Zones: Warm Mix 400 ton No Bid No Bid $93.00 $128.00 $51,200.00 $77.75 $96.50 $38,600.00
8 PICKUP West Zones: High Performance Cold Mix 300 ton No Bid $127.00 $173.25 $51,975.00 No Bid $125.00 $167.50 $50,250.00

EAST ZONES - PICK UP with mileage calculated in bid price
1069 North SH 78, Farmersville, TX 75442

9 PICKUP East Zones: Type B 400 ton No Bid No Bid $85.00 $136.25 $54,500.00 $90.25 $95.25 $38,100.00
10 PICKUP East Zones: Type B with RAP and/or RAS 400 ton No Bid $85.00 $111.25 $44,500.00 $70.00 $121.25 $48,500.00 $82.50 $87.50 $35,000.00
11 PICKUP East Zones: Type C 50 ton No Bid No Bid $90.00 $141.25 $7,062.50 $98.25 $103.25 $5,162.50
12 PICKUP East Zones: Type C with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton No Bid $85.00 $111.25 $5,562.50 $75.00 $126.25 $6,312.50 $90.25 $95.25 $4,762.50
13 PICKUP East Zones: Type D 4000 ton $22.00 $80.75 $323,000.00 No Bid $91.75 $143.00 $572,000.00 $102.00 $107.00 $428,000.00
14 PICKUP East Zones: Type D with RAP and/or RAS 4000 ton $31.74 $90.49 $361,960.00 $85.00 $111.25 $445,000.00 $76.75 $128.00 $512,000.00 $94.00 $99.00 $396,000.00
15 PICKUP East Zones: Warm Mix 400 ton No Bid No Bid $93.00 $144.25 $57,700.00 $94.00 $99.00 $39,600.00
16 PICKUP East Zones: High Performance Cold Mix 300 ton No Bid $120.00 $146.25 $43,875.00 No Bid $125.00 $183.75 $55,125.00

Plant Location Address for Pick-Up (IRS tax rate 62.5 cents per 
mile)
West Zone evaluation is from 4361 North Central Expressway, 
McKinney, TX 75071 (GIS coordinates 33.244353, -96.627211). 
East Zone evaluation is from 1069 North SH 78, Farmersville, 
TX 75442.

DELIVERY BY ZONE
Zone 1

17 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B 50 ton No Bid No Bid $99.75 $4,987.50 $90.00 $4,500.00
18 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton No Bid $105.00 $5,250.00 $84.75 $4,237.50 $82.00 $4,100.00
19 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C 50 ton No Bid No Bid $104.75 $5,237.50 $96.75 $4,837.50
20 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton No Bid $105.00 $5,250.00 $89.75 $4,487.50 $88.75 $4,437.50
21 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE D 1000 ton $34.38 $34,380.00 No Bid $106.50 $106,500.00 $96.75 $96,750.00
22 DELIVERED Zone 1: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton $42.74 $42,740.00 $105.00 $105,000.00 $91.50 $91,500.00 $88.75 $88,750.00
23 DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix 50 ton No Bid No Bid $107.75 $5,387.50 $96.75 $4,837.50
24 DELIVERED Zone 1: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton No Bid No Bid $92.75 $4,637.50 $88.75 $4,437.50
25 DELIVERED Zone 1: High Performance Cold Mix 50 ton No Bid $147.00 $7,350.00 No Bid $136.00 $6,800.00

Zone 2
26 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE B 50 ton No Bid No Bid $105.00 $5,250.00 $90.00 $4,500.00
27 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton No Bid $98.69 $4,934.50 $90.00 $4,500.00 $82.00 $4,100.00
28 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE C 50 ton No Bid No Bid $110.00 $5,500.00 $96.75 $4,837.50
29 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 50 ton No Bid $98.69 $4,934.50 $95.00 $4,750.00 $88.75 $4,437.50
30 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE D 1000 ton $34.38 $34,380.00 No Bid $111.75 $111,750.00 $96.75 $96,750.00

West Zones: Lines 1 - 7 - 11481 County Rd 53, 
Celina, TX 75009  - 30 miles roundtrip x .625 = 
$18.75
Line 8  - 11143 Goodnight Lane, Dallas, TX 
75229 - 68 miles roundtrip x .625 = $42.50
East Zones: Lines 9-15 - 2315 East Audie 
Murphy Parkway Farmersville, Texas 75442 - 8 
miles roundtrip x .625 = $5
Line 16 - 11143 Goodnight Lane Dallas, Tx 
75229- 94 miles roundtrip x .625 = $58.75

Green Dream International LLC RK Hall LLC Reynolds Asphalt & Construction Company Austin Asphalt, Inc.

West Zones - 11143 Goodnight Lane, Dallas, TX 
75229 - 68 miles roundtrip x .625 = $42.50
East Zones - 11143 Goodnight Lane Dallas, Tx 
75229 - 94 miles roundtrip x .625 = $58.75

West Zones - 5651 Hwy 224 East Greenville, TX 
75401 - 74 miles roundtrip x .625 = $46.25
East Zones - 5651 Hwy 224 East Greenville, TX 
75401 - 42 miles roundtrip x .625 = $26.25

(Can also use plant location 6630 W. FM 120, 
Denison, TX 75020 - not used in calculations) 

West Zones - 617 East College Street, 
Lewisville, TX- 56 miles roundtrip x .625 = $35
East Zones - 617 East College Street, Lewsiville, 
TX - 82 miles roundtrip x .625 = $51.25

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage

Price with 
Mileage
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31 DELIVERED Zone 2: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton $42.74 $42,740.00 $98.69 $98,690.00 $96.75 $96,750.00 $88.75 $88,750.00
32 DELIVERED Zone 2: Warm Mix 100 ton No Bid No Bid $113.00 $11,300.00 $96.75 $9,675.00
33 DELIVERED Zone 2: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid No Bid $98.00 $9,800.00 $88.75 $8,875.00
34 DELIVERED Zone 2: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton No Bid $140.69 $14,069.00 No Bid $136.00 $13,600.00

Zone 3
35 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE B 500 ton No Bid No Bid $107.50 $53,750.00 $99.50 $49,750.00
36 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 500 ton No Bid $99.06 $49,530.00 $92.50 $46,250.00 $91.50 $45,750.00
37 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE C 100 ton No Bid No Bid $112.50 $11,250.00 $107.25 $10,725.00
38 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid $99.06 $9,906.00 $97.50 $9,750.00 $99.25 $9,925.00
39 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE D 1000 ton $34.38 $34,380.00 No Bid $114.25 $114,250.00 $111.00 $111,000.00
40 DELIVERED Zone 3: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton $42.74 $42,740.00 $99.06 $99,060.00 $99.25 $99,250.00 $103.00 $103,000.00
41 DELIVERED Zone 3: Warm Mix 100 ton No Bid No Bid $115.50 $11,550.00 $111.00 $11,100.00
42 DELIVERED Zone 3: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid No Bid $100.50 $10,050.00 $103.00 $10,300.00
43 DELIVERED Zone 3: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton No Bid $141.06 $14,106.00 No Bid $134.00 $13,400.00

Zone 4
44 DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE B 10 ton No Bid No Bid $102.00 $1,020.00 $90.00 $900.00
45 DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 10 ton No Bid $106.83 $1,068.30 $87.00 $870.00 $82.00 $820.00
46 DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE C 10 ton No Bid No Bid $107.00 $1,070.00 $96.75 $967.50
47 DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 10 ton No Bid $106.83 $1,068.30 $92.00 $920.00 $88.75 $887.50
48 DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE D 500 ton $34.38 $17,190.00 No Bid $108.75 $54,375.00 $96.75 $48,375.00
49 DELIVERED Zone 4: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 500 ton $42.74 $21,370.00 $106.83 $53,415.00 $93.75 $46,875.00 $88.75 $44,375.00
50 DELIVERED Zone 4: Warm Mix 10 ton No Bid No Bid $110.00 $1,100.00 $96.75 $967.50
51 DELIVERED Zone 4: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 10 ton No Bid No Bid $95.00 $950.00 $88.75 $887.50
52 DELIVERED Zone 4: High Performance Cold Mix 10 ton No Bid $148.83 $1,488.30 No Bid $136.00 $1,360.00

Zone 5
53 DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE B 500 ton No Bid No Bid $105.25 $52,625.00 $99.50 $49,750.00
54 DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 500 ton No Bid $97.21 $48,605.00 $90.25 $45,125.00 $91.50 $45,750.00
55 DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE C 100 ton No Bid No Bid $110.50 $11,050.00 $107.25 $10,725.00
56 DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid $97.21 $9,721.00 $95.25 $9,525.00 $99.25 $9,925.00
57 DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE D 1000 ton $34.38 $34,380.00 No Bid $112.00 $112,000.00 $111.00 $111,000.00
58 DELIVERED Zone 5: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton $42.74 $42,740.00 $97.21 $97,210.00 $97.00 $97,000.00 $103.00 $103,000.00
59 DELIVERED Zone 5: Warm Mix 100 ton No Bid No Bid $113.25 $11,325.00 $111.00 $11,100.00
60 DELIVERED Zone 5: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid No Bid $98.25 $9,825.00 $103.00 $10,300.00
61 DELIVERED Zone 5: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton No Bid $132.21 $13,221.00 No Bid $134.00 $13,400.00

Zone 6
62 DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE B 500 ton No Bid No Bid $107.50 $53,750.00 $99.25 $49,625.00
63 DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 500 ton No Bid $93.88 $46,940.00 $92.50 $46,250.00 $91.50 $45,750.00
64 DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE C 100 ton No Bid No Bid $112.50 $11,250.00 $107.25 $10,725.00
65 DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid $93.88 $9,388.00 $97.50 $9,750.00 $99.25 $9,925.00
66 DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE D 1000 ton $34.38 $34,380.00 No Bid $114.25 $114,250.00 $111.00 $111,000.00
67 DELIVERED Zone 6: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton $42.74 $42,740.00 $93.88 $93,880.00 $99.25 $99,250.00 $103.00 $103,000.00
68 DELIVERED Zone 6: Warm Mix 100 ton No Bid No Bid $115.50 $11,550.00 $111.00 $11,100.00
69 DELIVERED Zone 6: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid No Bid $100.50 $10,050.00 $103.00 $10,300.00
70 DELIVERED Zone 6: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton No Bid $128.88 $12,888.00 No Bid $139.00 $13,900.00

Zone 7
71 DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE B 500 ton No Bid No Bid $104.00 $52,000.00 $90.00 $45,000.00
72 DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 500 ton No Bid $99.80 $49,900.00 $89.00 $44,500.00 $82.00 $41,000.00
73 DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE C 100 ton No Bid No Bid $109.00 $10,900.00 $96.75 $9,675.00
74 DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid $99.80 $9,980.00 $94.00 $9,400.00 $88.75 $8,875.00
75 DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE D 1000 ton $34.38 $34,380.00 No Bid $110.75 $110,750.00 $96.75 $96,750.00
76 DELIVERED Zone 7: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton $42.74 $42,740.00 $99.80 $99,800.00 $95.75 $95,750.00 $88.75 $88,750.00
77 DELIVERED Zone 7: Warm Mix 100 ton No Bid No Bid $112.00 $11,200.00 $96.75 $9,675.00
78 DELIVERED Zone 7: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid No Bid $97.00 $9,700.00 $88.75 $8,875.00
79 DELIVERED Zone 7: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton No Bid $134.80 $13,480.00 No Bid $136.00 $13,600.00

Zone 8
80 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B 500 ton No Bid No Bid $108.50 $54,250.00 $99.50 $49,750.00
81 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE B with RAP and/or RAS 500 ton No Bid $95.00 $47,500.00 $93.50 $46,750.00 $91.50 $45,750.00
82 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C 100 ton No Bid No Bid $113.50 $11,350.00 $107.25 $10,725.00
83 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE C with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid $95.00 $9,500.00 $98.50 $9,850.00 $99.25 $9,925.00
84 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE D 1000 ton $34.38 $34,380.00 No Bid $115.25 $115,250.00 $111.00 $111,000.00
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85 DELIVERED Zone 8: TYPE D with RAP and/or RAS 1000 ton $42.74 $42,740.00 $95.00 $95,000.00 $100.25 $100,250.00 $103.00 $103,000.00
86 DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix 100 ton No Bid No Bid $116.50 $11,650.00 $111.00 $11,100.00
87 DELIVERED Zone 8: Warm Mix with RAP and/or RAS 100 ton No Bid No Bid $101.50 $10,150.00 $103.00 $10,300.00
88 DELIVERED Zone 8: High Performance Cold Mix 100 ton No Bid $130.00 $13,000.00 No Bid $134.00 $13,400.00

89 State (if any) minimum number of Tons for Pickup of product in 
West and East Zones 100 ton No minimum No minimum

90 State (if any) minimum number of Tons for Delivery of product 
for all zones. 100 ton 22 tons 20 tons 22 tons

Delivery in calendar days from date of order: 2-5 days 24 hours 2 calendar days

Additional Line Item Notes:
7 Austin Asphalt, LP

15 Austin Asphalt, LP
23 Austin Asphalt, LP
24 Austin Asphalt, LP
26 Austin Asphalt, LP
32 Austin Asphalt, LP
33 Austin Asphalt, LP
41 Austin Asphalt, LP
42 Austin Asphalt, LP
50 Austin Asphalt, LP
51 Austin Asphalt, LP
59 Austin Asphalt, LP
68 Austin Asphalt, LP
69 Austin Asphalt, LP
77 Austin Asphalt, LP
78 Austin Asphalt, LP
86 Austin Asphalt, LP
87 Austin Asphalt, LP

TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS

TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS

1 ton
Minimum of one ton for any type of mix picked 
up at our plants

Minimum of 12 tons for any delivered type of 
mix - This includes all line items 17-88

TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX

TY-B SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS

Allow one (1) business day to process order for 
delivery.

TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS
Ty-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS

TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 VIRGIN MIX
TY-D SAC-B PG64-22 RAP/RAS
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