IFB 2019-315 Bid Tabulation

1066 50001.0056.64.30.0000.62653

	DC+ 2022 Sept 20			(Wheelz Up Texas,	Enterprise Holdings	
Line #	escription	QTY	ÚOM	Unit	Unit	
1	Sedan, Full Size, Four (4) Door	1	month	No Bid	\$836.00	12
2	Sports Utility Vehicle, Mid Size, Two (2) Door	1	month	No Bid	\$1,232.00	
3	Sports Utility Vehicle, Mid Size, Four (4) Door	1	month	No Bid	\$1,232.00	
4	Sports Utility Vehicle, Full Size, Four (4) Door	1	month	No Bid	\$1,845.00	
5	Truck, Mid-Size, Standard Cab	1	month	No Bid	\$1,210.00	
6	Truck Mid-Size, Extended Cab	1	month	No Bid	\$1,210.00	
7	Truck, Full Size, Regular Cab	1	month	No Bid	\$1,210.00	
8	Truck, Full Size Extended Cab/Crew Cab	1	month	No Bid	\$1,210.00	
9	Mini Van	1	month	\$1,500.00	\$1,076.00	
10	State price per Mile over 2500 mile allowance per month	1	mile	\$0.50	\$0.40	
11	State Price for Truck Bed Mat	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	
12	State Price for Each Lockable Truck Tool Box	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	
13	State Price for Additional Set of Keys for Vehicle	1	each	No Bid	No Bid	
13 ALT1	With remote locking device	1	each	\$100.00		

Herc Rentals Inc. is non-responsive.