Bid Tabulation

Star Asset Security, LLC Am.erican Fire Convergint Technologies
Protection Group, Inc. LLC
Line # Description QTY (UOM Unit Unit Unit

1 FIRE SPRINKLER INSPECTIONS, TESTING,
MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS 1 EA
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

2 Central Plant 1 lump sum No Bid $225.00 $938.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

3 Justice Center 1 lump sum No Bid $2,750.00 $16,250.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

4 Juvenile Detention 1 lump sum No Bid $400.00 $2,500.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

> JJAEP 1 lump sum No Bid $400.00 $938.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

6 Minimum Security 1 lump sum No Bid $700.00 $1,875.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

/ Animal Shelter 1 lump sum No Bid $225.00 $375.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

8 Administration Building 1 lump sum No Bid $450.00 $1,250.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

9 Courthouse 1 lump sum No Bid $3,000.00 $6,875.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

10 Medical Examiner 1 lump sum No Bid $225.00 $775.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing:

11 Health Care Annex 1 lump sum No Bid $900.00 $650.00

1 Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing: Plano
900 Building 1 lump sum No Bid $325.00 $650.00

13 Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing: Plano
920 Building 1 lump sum No Bid $325.00 $650.00

1 Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing: Frisco
Sub-Courthouse 1 lump sum No Bid $325.00 $775.00
Fire Sprinkler Inspections and Testing: Lavon

15 Sub-Courthouse (NO AWARD) 1 lump sum No Bid $275.00 $375.00

Draft document until award.
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Bid Tabulation

Star Asset Security, LLC Am.erican Fire Convergint Technologies
Protection Group, Inc. LLC

Fire Sprinkler Maintenance and Repairs:

16 State Hourly Rate for Certified Licensed
Repair Technician-During Business Hours 1 hour No Bid $110.00 $179.00
Fire Sprinkler Maintenance and Repairs:

17 State Hourly Rate for Helper-During
Business Hours 1 hour No Bid $110.00 $179.00
Fire Sprinkler Maintenance and Repairs:

18 State Hourly Rate for Certified Licensed
Repair Technician-After Business Hours 1 hour No Bid $165.00 $268.50
Fire Sprinkler Maintenance and Repairs:

19 State Hourly Rate for Helper-After Business
Hours 1 hour No Bid $142.50 $268.50
Fire Sprinkler Maintenance and Repairs:

20 [State Hourly Rate for Certified Licensed
Repair Technician-Weekends and Holidays |1 hour No Bid $220.00 $268.50
Fire Sprinkler Maintenance and Repairs:

21 State Hourly Rate for Helper-Weekends and
Holidays 1 hour No Bid $110.00 $268.50
Fire Sprinkler Maintenance and Repairs:

22 Percentage Mark-up on Parts 1 percent No Bid 35.0% 50.0%
Fire Suppression Water Backflow Valve

23 Inspection (price per valve) 1 each No Bid $75.00 $132.00
Five (5) Year Sprinkler System Inspection

24 (price per building). 1 lump sum No Bid $950.00 $675.00

TOTAL FOR FIRE SPRINKLER SECTION No Bid $12,132.50 $36,740.00

Draft document until award.
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Bid Tabulation

Star Asset Security, LLC Am-erican Fire Convergint Technologies
Protection Group, Inc. LLC

FIRE ALARM INSPECTIONS, TESTING,

25 MAINTENANCE AND REPAIRS EA
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Central

26 Plant lump sum $533.00 $675.00 $600.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Justice

27 Center lump sum $13,480.00 $17,600.00 $9,625.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Juvenile

28 Detention lump sum $1,423.00 $7,550.00 $2,110.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing:

29 JJAEP lump sum $1,240.00 $1,800.00 $1,400.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing:

30 Minimum Security lump sum $1,477.00 $3,550.00 $2,150.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Animal

31 Shelter lump sum $813.00 $850.00 $450.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing:

32 Administration Building lump sum $2,953.00 $4,800.00 $5,600.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing:

33 Courthouse lump sum $3,123.00 $10,800.00 $5,550.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Public

34 Works lump sum $347.00 $450.00 $400.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Medical

3 Examiner lump sum $370.00 $275.00 $400.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Health

36 Care Annex lump sum $977.00 $850.00 $2,080.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Myers

37 Park lump sum $327.00 $450.00 $350.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Plano

38 900 Building lump sum $873.00 $850.00 $1,425.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Plano

39 920 Building lump sum $697.00 $650.00 $725.00
Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Frisco

40 Sub-Courthouse lump sum $470.00 $275.00 $400.00

Draft document until award.
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Bid Tabulation

Star Asset Security, LLC Am.erican Fire Convergint Technologies
Protection Group, Inc. LLC

Fire Alarm Inspections and Testing: Lavon

41 Sub-Courthouse 1 lump sum $397.00 $325.00 $350.00
Fire Alarm Maintenance and Repairs: State

42 Hourly Rate for Certified Licensed Repair
Technician-During Business Hours 1 hour $125.00 $110.00 $132.00
Fire Alarm Maintenance and Repairs: State

43 Hourly Rate for Helper-During Business
Hours 1 hour $110.00 $95.00 $132.00
Fire Alarm Maintenance and Repairs: State

44 Hourly Rate for Certified Licensed Repair
Technician-After Business Hours 1 hour $187.50 $165.00 $198.00

45 Fire Alarm Maintenance and Repairs: State
Hourly Rate for Helper-After Business Hours |1 hour $165.00 $142.50 $198.00
Fire Alarm Maintenance and Repairs: State

46 Hourly Rate for Certified Licensed Repair
Technician-Weekends and Holidays 1 hour $187.50 $165.00 $198.00
Fire Alarm Maintenance and Repairs: State

47 Hourly Rate for Helper-Weekends and
Holidays 1 hour $165.00 $142.50 $198.00
Fire Alarm Maintenance and Repairs:

48 Percentage Mark-up on Parts 1 percent 30.0% 35.0% 50.0%

TOTAL FOR FIRE ALARM SECTION $30,440.00 $52,570.00 $34,671.00

Draft document until award.
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