
2022-333 
DRAFT ONLY UNTIL AWARD

IFB 2022-333 Road Materials, Aggregate for Surface Treatment and Rip Rap

PRIMARY
SECONDARY

TERTIARY

Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended

1 State cost of Type B, Grade 3, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney 
Stockpile 16000 ton No Bid $68.50 $1,096,000.00 $74.00 $1,184,000.00

1 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton 74.15$  81.00$  
1 Delivered to Anna 1 ton 71.25$  79.00$  
1 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton 74.15$  83.25$  

2 State cost of Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney 
Stockpile 13000 ton $53.39 $694,070.00 $72.50 $942,500.00 $74.00 $962,000.00

2 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton 56.00$  76.15$  81.00$  
2 Delivered to Anna 1 ton 55.54$  73.25$  79.00$  
2 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton 54.76$  76.15$  83.25$  

3 State cost of Type B, Grade 5, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney 
Stockpile 1000 ton No Bid $72.50 $72,500.00 $74.00 $74,000.00

3 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton 78.15$  81.00$  
3 Delivered to Anna 1 ton 75.25$  79.00$  
3 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton 78.15$  83.25$  

PICK UP Price/ton with Mileage Price/ton with Mileage Price/ton with Mileage

4 Type B, Grade 3 Aggregate ---- State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your 
plant site by Collin County trucks. 1 ton No Bid $28.00 $220.50 $40.00 $130.00

5 Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate ---- State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at 
your plant site by Collin County trucks. 1 ton $31.25 $172.50 $30.00 $222.50 $40.00 $130.00

6
Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate --- State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your 
plant site by Collin County trucks 1 ton No Bid $32.00 $224.50 $40.00 $130.00

89980 I-20, Santo, TX 76472 32.386121439099774, -98.74703520784682 1795 TX-101, Bridgeport, TX 76426
226 miles roundtrip x .625 = $141.25 308 miles roundtrip x .625 = $192.50 144 miles roundtrip x .625 = $90.00

Minimum Delivery: Minimum order of 250 tons /Full loads @ 23 tons

NO AWARD

7 State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 3" x 7" to McKinney 
Stockpile 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

8 State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 8" x 12" to 
McKinney Stockpile 600 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

9 State Cost per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 12" x 18" to 
McKinney Stockpile 400 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

10 State cost Per Ton for Delivery of Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 18" x 24" to 
McKinney Stockpile 50 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

11
Stone Rip Rap: Rip Rap 3" x 7" ---- State cost for Collin County to pick up at 
your plant site by Collin County trucks. 1 ton No Bid No Bid No Bid

Address for PICKED UP evaluation: 4361 North Central Expressway, McKinney, TX 75071 (GIS coordinates 
33.244353, -96.627211

24 tons24 tons

Vulcan Construction Materials LLC dba 
Vulcan Materials Company

Nobles Materials LLC Martin Marietta Materials, Inc.
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