

IFB 2019-303 Equipment, Lease: Road Construction and Right of Way Maintenance Equipment

PRIMARY AWARD

SECONDARY AWARD

Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Herc Rentals Inc.		Star Tractor Ltd.		RDO Equipment Co.		Holt Texas, LTD		
				Total Price	\$35,107.00	Total Price	\$36,700.00	Total Price	\$36,822.50	Total Price	\$54,195.00	
				Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	Unit	Extended	
1	Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000lbs; 68" State Make/Model/Year State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided State Maximum Use Per Month State Additional Costs over Max Hours	1	month	No Bid		\$3,900.00	\$3,900.00	No Bid		<u>\$3,810.00</u>	\$3,810.00	
						Case PT240 2015 172 hours per month 172 hours per month \$22.67 per hour over limit				Caterpillar, CW16, 2016 3000 160 See below		
2	Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000lbs; 82" State Make/Model/Year State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided State Maximum Use Per Month State Additional Costs over Max Hours	1	month	No Bid		<u>\$4,200.00</u>	\$4,200.00	\$5,397.50	\$5,397.50	\$5,490.00	\$5,490.00	
						Dynapac CP271 2006 172 hours per month 172 hours per month \$24.42 per hour over limit		Sakai / GW751 / 2019-2022 3000 176 \$43.66 per hour		Caterpillar, CW34, 2016 3000 160 See below		
3	Smooth Drum Vibratory Compactor, 23,000 lb State Make/Model/Year State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided State Maximum Use Per Month State Additional Costs over Max Hours	1	month		\$4,060.00	\$4,060.00	\$3,900.00	\$3,900.00	\$5,283.00	\$5,283.00	<u>\$4,960.00</u>	\$4,960.00
					150-2770 - Volvo SD115B Varies by unit available 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) See below		Dynapac CA2500D 2013 or 2014 172 hours per month 172 hours per month \$22.67 per hour over limit		Sakai / SV544D / 2018-2022 3000 176 \$38.84 per hour		Caterpillar, CS54B, 2016 3000 160 Hours See below	
4	Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 21,000 lb State Make/Model/Year State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided State Maximum Use Per Month State Additional Costs over Max Hours	1	month		\$5,750.00	\$5,750.00	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$4,050.00</u>	\$4,050.00
					150-2920 - Volvo DD110C Varies by unit available 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) See below						Caterpillar, CB54B, 2016 3000 160 See below	
5	Padfoot Vibratory Soil Compactor, 24,000 lbs State Make/Model/Year State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided State Maximum Use Per Month State Additional Costs over Max Hours	1	month		DID NOT MEET SPECS		\$3,900.00	\$3,900.00	\$5,283.00	\$5,283.00	<u>\$5,600.00</u>	\$5,600.00
					150-2970 - Volvo Shell Kit Varies by unit available 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) See below		Dynapac CA2500PD 2013 Or 2014 172 hours per month 172 hours per month \$22.67 per hour over limit		Sakai / SV544T / 2018-2022 3000 176 \$38.84 per hour		Caterpillar, CP54B 3000 160 See below	
6	Water Truck 4,000 Gallon Minimum State Make/Model/Year State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided State Maximum Use Per Month State Additional Costs over Max Hours	1	month		\$4,450.00	\$4,450.00	No Bid		No Bid		<u>\$5,000.00</u>	\$5,000.00
					659-6050 - Freightliner MS-106 Varies by unit available 160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk) See below						Caterpillar, CT6, 2016 3000 160 See below	
7	Water Truck 2,000 Gallon Minimum	1	month		<u>\$2,500.00</u>	\$2,500.00	No Bid		No Bid		NO LONGER AVAILABLE	

	State Make/Model/Year			659-6040 - Hino 338							
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available							
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)							
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below							
8	Compact Track Loader, 3,000 lb	1	month	<u>\$2,200.00</u>	\$2,200.00	\$2,900.00	\$2,900.00	NO LONGER AVAILABLE	No Bid		
	State Make/Model/Year			200-1470 - Kubota SVL95-2S							
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available							
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)							
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below							
9	Skid Steer Loader, 2,200 lbs	1	month	<u>\$1,375.00</u>	\$1,375.00	\$2,400.00	\$2,400.00	NO LONGER AVAILABLE	No Bid		
	State Make/Model/Year			200-1360 - Bobcat S590							
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available							
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)							
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below							
10	Dozer, 43,500 lb Minimum	1	month	No Bid		<u>\$8,500.00</u>	\$8,500.00	\$10,659.00	\$10,659.00	\$13,600.00	\$13,600.00
	State Make/Model/Year					JD 850K, Cat D6T or equal/2013+		John Deere/850K/2016-2019		Caterpillar D6TXW/D6XW, 2016	
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided					172 hours per month		4000		3000	
	State Maximum Use Per Month					172 hours per month		176		160	
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours					\$49.42 per hour over limit		\$60.56 per hour		See below	
11	Motor Grader, 31,000 lb Minimum	1	month	No Bid		<u>\$7,000.00</u>	\$7,000.00	\$10,200.00	\$10,200.00	\$11,685.00	\$11,685.00
	State Make/Model/Year					John Deere 770G 2011+		John Deere/770GP/2016-2019		Caterpillar, 140M, 150 2016	
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided					172 hours per month		3000		3000	
	State Maximum Use Per Month					172 hours per month		176		160	
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours					\$40.70 per hour over limit		\$56.31 per hour		See below	
12	Wheeled Rubber Tire Asphalt Paver, 26,000 lb	1	month	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		DID NOT MEET SPECS	
	State Make/Model/Year									Caterpillar, AP555 Track, 2016	
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided									3000	
	State Maximum Use Per Month									160	
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours									See below	
13	Asphalt Distributor 2,000 Gallon Tank	1	month	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
14	Aggregate Spreader	1	month	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
15	Self- Propelled Broom	1	month	<u>\$2,231.00</u>	\$2,231.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	State Make/Model/Year			105-3020 - Laymor SM400							
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			/SM450 CAB							
	State Maximum Use Per Month			Varies by unit available							
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)							
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below							
16	Fork Lift, Diesel	1	month	<u>\$1,050.00</u>	\$1,050.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	State Make/Model/Year			450-2110 - DOOSAN D25S-7							
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available							
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)							
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below							
17	Fork Lift, LPG	1	month	<u>\$975.00</u>	\$975.00	No Bid		No Bid		No Bid	
	State Make/Model/Year			450-2120 - Toyota 8FGU25							

	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
18	Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 3,300 lb	1	month	<u>\$1,625.00</u> \$1,625.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	State Make/Model/Year			150-2860 - Volvo DD25BW			
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
19	Walk Behind Concrete Saw, Gasoline, Push Type	1	month	<u>\$574.00</u> \$574.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	State Make/Model/Year			100-2810 - EDCO SK-14-13H			
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
20	Handheld Concrete Saw	1	month	<u>\$574.00</u> \$574.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	State Make/Model/Year			100-2740 - Stihl TS800			
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
21	Vibratory Plate Compactor	1	month	<u>\$395.00</u> \$395.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	State Make/Model/Year			150-1260 - Multiquip MVC88CTHW			
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
22	Solar Message Board	1	month	<u>\$1,040.00</u> \$1,040.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	State Make/Model/Year			660-1070 -WANCO WTMMB-A			
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
23	Skid Steer Loader, High Flow, 2,300 lbs with Cold Planer Attachment	1	month	<u>\$4,308.00</u> \$4,308.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
	State Make/Model/Year			200-1362/290-2075 - Bobcat S630H			
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
24	Regenerative Air Sweeper with High Lift Dump, 10,000 lbs	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
25	Mini-Excavator, 10,500 lbs operating weight	1	month	<u>\$2,000.00</u> \$2,000.00	No Bid	NO LONGER AVAILABLE	No Bid
	State Make/Model/Year			240-1500 Bobcat E50			
	State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided			Varies by unit available			
	State Maximum Use Per Month			160 hrs (8 hr day/40 hr wk)			
	State Additional Costs over Max Hours			See below			
26	Half-Lane Cold Planer	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid

27	Cold Planer attachment for Compact Track Loader	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
28	Tracked mobile inclined screen, with rinser/washing equipment with diesel engine	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
29	Asphalt Patch Truck	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
30	Sealcoat Machine, 300-500 gallon	1	month	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid