2022-260 SERVICES, SEMI-ANNUAL MULTI-SURFACE FLOOR CLEANING

CARPET 911 CLEANING &
RESTORATION

Guardian Power Cleaning of
Dallas, Inc. dba Guardian
Services

APEX Group Holdings, Inc. dba
APEX Surface Care

VIXAGON LOGISTICS LLC

Mangwenya LLC

RAS Services, Inc.

SERVPRO ALLEN

Contractors Plus Roofing &
Construction, LLC

Total Price $91,723.00

Total Price $124,242.33

Total Price $319,748.70

Total Price $558,979.80

Total Price $601,362.71

Total Price $637,066.35

Total Price; $967,604.92

Total Price

$3,649,696.50)

Line #

Description

Qry

uoMm

Unit led

Unit led

Unit led

Unit led

Unit led

Unit led

Unit led

Unit

CARPET CLEANING - State price per square foot for carpet cleaning - Shampooed
with wet extraction method and drying fans. See Attachment B for quantities of
carpet at each County location. Cleaning will be scheduled two (2) times per
annual period. (Vendor should bid this to include all charges and fees, including
but not limited to labor, equipment, travel, and fuel charges. Cleaning products
are to be supplied by the awarded vendor.)

917230

square foot

$0.10] $91,723.00}

$40,358.12

$0.09 $82,550.70

$0.20 $183,446.00,

$0.35 $321,030.50

$0.30} $275,169.00)

$0.50} $458,615.00

$1.75

$1,605,152.50

VINYL COMPOSITION TILE (VCT) CLEANING - State price per square foot for
stripping of finish and reapplying with two (2) coats of floor finish on hard surface.
Cleaning will be scheduled two (2) times per annual period. See Attachment B for
quantities of hard surface at each County location. (Vendor should bid this to
include all charges and fees, including but not limited to labor, equipment, travel,
and fuel charges. Cleaning products are to be supplied by the awarded vendor.)

516742

square foot

No Bid

$0.1217 $62,887.50

$0.40) $206,696.80

$0.65 $335,882.30

$0.50] $258,371.00

$0.60! $310,045.20

$0.90! $465,067.80

$3.75

$1,937,782.50]

TERRAZZO TILE CLEANING - State price per square foot for stripping of finish and
reapplying with two (2) coats of floor finish on hard surface. See Attachment B for
quantities of Terrazzo tile at each County location. Cleaning will be scheduled two
(2) times per annual period. (Vendor should bid this to include all charges and
fees, including but not limited to labor, equipment, travel, and fuel charges.
Cleaning products are to be supplied by the awarded vendor.)

61000

square foot|

No Bid

$0.3442 $20,996.20

$0.50 $30,500.00

$0.65 $39,650.00

$0.36) $21,960.00

$0.85! $51,850.00

$0.72, $43,920.00

$1.75)

$106,750.00

UNSCHEDULED FLOOR CARE - CARPET CLEANING - State price per square foot for
carpet cleaning - Shampooed with wet extraction method and drying fans. See
Attachment B for quantities of carpet at each County location. (Vendor should bid
this to include all charges and fees, including but not limited to labor, equipment,
travel, and fuel charges. Cleaning products are to be supplied by the awarded
vendor.)

square foot

No Bid

$0.04

$0.10] $0.10]

$0.20) $0.20)

$0.35 $0.35,

$0.50) $0.50)

$0.50) $0.50)

$3.25)

$3.25

UNSCHEDULED FLOOR CARE - VINYL COMPOSITION TILE (VCT) CLEANING - State
price per square foot for stripping of finish and reapplying with two (2) coats of
floor finish on hard surface. See Attachment B for quantities of hard surface at
each County location. (Vendor should bid this to include all charges and fees,
including but not limited to labor, equipment, travel, and fuel charges. Cleaning
products are to be supplied by the awarded vendor.)

square foot|

No Bid

$0.1217 $0.12

$0.50] $0.50]

$0.65 $0.65

$0.50 $0.50,

$0.70) $0.70)

$0.90) $0.90)

$5.00)

$5.00)

UNSCHEDULED FLOOR CARE - TERRAZZO TILE CLEANING - State price per square
foot for stripping of finish and reapplying with two (2) coats of floor finish on hard
surface. See Attachment B for quantities of Terrazzo tile at each County location.
(Vendor should bid this to include all charges and fees, including but not limited to
labor, equipment, travel, and fuel charges. Cleaning products are to be supplied
by the awarded vendor.)

square foot

No Bid

$0.3442 $0.34

$0.60) $0.60)

$0.65 $0.65

$0.36 $0.36!

$0.95! $0.95!

$0.72, $0.72

$3.25

$3.25

HW Global Resources, LLC is deemed non-responsive

Primary
Secondary

Draft Until Awarded

11/15/2022
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