IFB 2023-081 GROUNDS MAINTENANCE EQUIPMENT

LANDMARK EQUIPMENT, INC

RICHARDSON SAW AND LAWNMOWER COMPANY

FOUR BROTHERS FORD TRACTOR, INC.

PLANO MOTOR MART, INC.

Total Price | $11,721.26 Total Price $40,076.90 Total Price $51,493.28 Total Price $62,558.79
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 stihl HT131 Pole Pruner, or County Approved Equal. 2 EACH $637.49 $1,274.98 $596.78 $1,193.56 $629.99 $1,259.98 $599.99 $1,199.98
Stihl MS441 Chai ith 18" Bar, Case and Two (2) S
2 ! ainsaw wi ar, Caseand Two (2) Spare ) ¢, NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,252.79 $2,505.58
Chains, or County Approved Equal.
Stihl MS400 Chai ith 18" Bar, Case and Two (2) S
2ALTL Cf:ains amnsaw wi ar, Caseand Two (2) Spare ) ¢, NO BID NO BID *$1,012.26 $2,024.52 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stihl MS400 C-M Chai ith 18" Bar, Case and Two (2
2am2 Y ’ ainsawwl ar, Caseand Two (2) 5 ppeyy NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID *$1,021.99 $2,043.98 NO BID NO BID
Spare Chains.
MS 462 Chai ith 18" Bar, Case and Two(2) S
ZYRER amnsaw wi ar, Case and Two(2) Spare 2 EACH $1,264.79 $2,529.58 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Stihl MS362 C-M Chainsaw with 16" Bar, Case, and Two (2)
D e ] 4 EACH NO BID NO BID $873.87 $3,495.48 $877.59 $3,510.36 $819.09 $3,276.36
IMS 362 Chai ith 16" Bar, Case and two(2) S
3ALTL ainsaw wi o, e e Gre) e 4 EACH $861.89 $3,447.56 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
ichains, or County approved equal
Stihl MS362 C-M Chainsaw with 25" Bar, Case, and Two (2)
4 qpare Chaims, or County Apbroved Equal. 3 EACH NO BID NO BID $895.48 $2,686.44 $887.59 $2,662.77 $836.79 $2,510.37
IMS 362 Chai ith 25" Bar, Case and two(2) S
aaT1 e ainsawwi ar, Case and two(2) Spare 3 EACH $889.09 $2,667.27 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
iChains, or County Approved Equal
Stihl MS462 C-M Chainsaw with 20" Bar, Case, and Two (2)
B i e ] 1 EACH NO BID NO BID $1,263.04 $1,263.04 NO BID NO BID $1,252.79 $1,252.79
5ALTL [MS 462 IS Chainsaw 1 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $1,273.99 $1,273.99 NO BID NO BID
6  Stihl BG-86 Hand Held Blower, or County Approved Equal. 1 EACH $237.99 $237.99 $224.82 $224.82 $235.19 $235.19 $223.99 $223.99
7 Stihl BR430 Backpack Blower, or County Approved Equal. 1 EACH $382.49 $382.49 $358.00 $358.00 $377.99 $377.99 $359.99 $359.99
Stihl HL94K Hedger 30" (145 d County A d
8 quual edger 30 (145 degree), or County Approve 2 EACH NO BID NO BID $418.41 $836.82 $445.19 $890.38 $423.99 $847.98
{HL 94 K 145 Hedger 24" (145 d County A d
qual edger 24" (145 degree), or County Approved ¢y $450.49 $900.98 NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID NO BID NOBID
“Stihl HS82T Hedger with 30" cutting blade with guard
9 ! et ML IECIE N LR, Gl 2 EACH NO BID NO BID $502.85 $1,005.70 $529.19 $1,058.38 $463.99 $927.98
County Approved Equal.
{HS 82 T Hed, ith 24" cutting blade with d, or Count
9ALTL selEre LI LRI NI ), CrEetmay EACH $492.99 $985.98 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
:Approved Equal.
10 stihl FC111 Edger, or County Approved Equal. 5 EACH $450.49 $2,252.45 $426.00 $2,130.00 $445.19 $2,225.95 $423.99 $2,119.95
I e Ll e e P $407.99 $4,895.88 $410.67 $4,928.04 $403.19 $4,838.28 $383.99 $4,607.88
Auto Cut Head, or County Approved Equal. . s i e . T : T
Stihl FS360C-EM Brush Cutter, Bike Handle, or Count
2 rush tutter, Sike Handle, or Lounty 3 EACH $892.49 $2,677.47 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $919.99 $2,759.97
Approved Equal.
12 ALTL Stihl FS 361C-EM 3 EACH NO BID NO BID $890.54 $2,671.62 $965.99 $2,897.97 NO BID NO BID
Billy Goat TKV650SPH Chipper Vac, or County A d
13 E;J’al oa PP VLS CIr ety (LIS 1 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $2,175.00 $2,175.00
13 ALT1 Billy Goat TKV601SP 1 EACH NO BID NO BID $1,718.25 $1,718.25 $1,740.00 $1,740.00 NO BID NO BID
Honda HRS16KSPKA 21" Push M County A d
14 E:Sala ush Viower, or Lounty Approve 3 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $469.00 $1,407.00
14 ALT1 Toro 21462 3 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID *$425.00 $1,275.00 NO BID NO BID
14 ALT2 Honda HRN216PKA 3 EACH NO BID NO BID $529.99 $1,589.97 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Echo WT1640 Walk Behind Tri County A d
15 E:u‘;l ClLSERel VTS Clr gy AR 3 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $649.99 $1,949.97
15 ALT1 ‘Echo WT-1610 Walk Behind Trimmer 3 EACH NO BID NO BID $520.00 $1,560.00 $530.00 $1,590.00 NO BID NO BID
Scag 52" STTII-52V-31BV ZTR Riding M Count
16 A;apgrove ¢ Equal cling Viower, or Lounty 1 EACH NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID $12,479.00 $12,479.00 $12,479.00 $12,479.00
16 ALTL 'Scag STTII-52V-26CV-EFI 1 EACH NO BID NO BID $12,869.00 $12,869.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
Scag 52" SWZL52V-22FSE, Hydro-Drive Walk Behind Mower,
17 EACH NO BID NO BID 8,072.00 8,072.00 8,072.00 8,072.00 8,072.00 8,072.00
22hp Kawasaki 651FSE engine, or County Approved Equal. e %8, s %8, s %8,
Scag 61" STTII-61V-40BV-EFI ZTR Riding M Count
18 8 cing Mower, ortounty 4 Eacw NO BID NO BID $13,883.00 $13,883.00 $13,883.00 $13,883.00 $13,883.00 $13,883.00

Approved Equal.

*Did not meet specifications.
Draft Until Award 1/25/2023
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