
Bid Tabulation

Draft document until award. 12/8/2022 2023-080 

Industrial Power LLC

David Hunt dba 
Davids Paint and 

Body

Maaco Collision 
Repair & Auto 

Painting (Collision 
Repair Unit 3, LLC)

Texas Kenworth Co. 
dba MHC Kenworth-

Dallas
Line # Description QTY UOM Unit Unit Unit Unit

1 Light Duty Vehicle: Body Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $55.00 $48.00 No Bid
2 Light Duty Vehicle: Aluminum Body Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $55.00 $48.00 No Bid
3 Light Duty Vehicle: Frame Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $55.00 $75.00 No Bid
4 Light Duty Vehicle: Glass Repair Labor 1 hour No Bid $55.00 $48.00 No Bid
5 Light Duty Vehicle: Mechanical Labor 1 hour No Bid $140.00 $125.00 No Bid
6 Light Duty Vehicle: Paint Technician Labor 1 hour No Bid $55.00 $48.00 No Bid
7 Light Duty Vehicle: Paint Supplies Labor 1 hour No Bid $45.00 $36.00 No Bid

8
Light Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts-Domestic 1 hour No Bid 5.0% 5.0% No Bid

9
Light Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts-Import 1 hour No Bid 5.0% 5.0% No Bid

10
Light Duty Vehicle: Discount Off 
Aftermarket/Used Replacement Parts 1 hour No Bid 5.0% 5.0% No Bid

11 Light Duty Vehicle: Towing 1 lump sum No Bid $0.00 $85.00 No Bid
12 Medium Duty Vehicle: Body Repair Labor 1 hour $100.10 $55.00 $55.00 $105.00
13 Medium Duty Vehicle: Frame Repair Labor 1 hour $140.00 $55.00 $75.00 $125.00
14 Medium Duty Vehicle: Glass Repair Labor 1 hour $100.10 $55.00 $55.00 $105.00
15 Medium Duty Vehicle: Mechanical Labor 1 hour $140.00 $140.00 $125.00 $145.00
16 Medium Duty Vehicle: Paint Technician Labor 1 hour $100.10 $55.00 $55.00 $105.00
17 Medium Duty Vehicle: Paint Supplies Labor 1 hour $48.00 $45.00 $36.00 $80.00

18
Medium Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts 1 hour 30.0% 5.0% 5.0% 25.0%

19
Medium Duty Vehicle: Discount Off 
Aftermarket/Used Replacement Parts 1 hour 30.0% 5.0% 5.0% 30.0%

20 Medium Duty Vehicle: Towing 1 lump sum No Bid $0.00 $85.00 $1,000.00
21 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Body Repair Labor 1 hour $100.10 $100.00 $85.00 $105.00
22 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Frame Repair Labor 1 hour $140.00 $100.00 $105.00 $125.00
23 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Glass Repair Labor 1 hour $100.10 $100.00 $55.00 $105.00
24 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Mechanical Labor 1 hour $140.00 $140.00 $125.00 $145.00
25 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Paint Technician Labor 1 hour $100.10 $100.00 $55.00 $105.00
26 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Paint Supplies Labor 1 hour $48.00 $45.00 $36.00 $80.00

27
Heavy Duty Vehicle: Discount Off OEM 
Replacement Parts-Domestic 1 hour 30.0% 5.0% 5.0% 25.0%

28
Heavy Duty Vehicle: Discount Off 
Aftermarket/Used Replacement Parts 1 hour 30.0% 5.0% 5.0% 30.0%

29 Heavy Duty Vehicle: Towing 1 lump sum No Bid $0.00 $85.00 $1,150.00

Primary Award
Secondary Award
No Award

Red River Truck Repair is determined to be non-
responsive.


	Lines

