
LINE NO. DESCRIPTION EST. QTY UOM COOPERATIVE PRICE PER UNIT TOTAL PRICE OF LINE 
ITEM COOPERATIVE2 PRICE PER UNIT3 TOTAL PRICE OF LINE 

ITEM4 COOPERATIVE5 PRICE PER UNIT6 TOTAL PRICE OF LINE 
ITEM7 COOPERATIVE8 PRICE PER UNIT9 TOTAL PRICE OF LINE 

ITEM10

1 Lexmark C734, C736 - Black Return Toner Cartridge 180 each DIR-CPO-4438 $105.89 $19,060.20 DIR-CPO-4438 $118.58 $21,344.32 OMNIA 19-12R $171.80 $30,924.00 TIPS 200105 $164.88 $29,678.40

2 Lexmark C734, C736 - Cyan Return Toner Cartridge 115 each DIR-CPO-4438 $167.67 $19,282.05 DIR-CPO-4438 $188.42 $21,668.35 OMNIA 19-12R $272.03 $31,283.45 TIPS 200105 $262.00 $30,130.00

3 Lexmark C734, C736 - Magenta Return Toner Cartridge 140 each DIR-CPO-4438 $167.67 $23,473.80 DIR-CPO-4438 $188.42 $26,378.86 OMNIA 19-12R $272.03 $38,084.20 TIPS 200105 $262.00 $36,680.00

4 Lexmark C734, C736 - Yellow Return Toner Cartridge 100 each DIR-CPO-4438 $167.67 $16,767.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $188.42 $18,842.05 OMNIA 19-12R $272.03 $27,203.00 TIPS 200105 $262.00 $26,200.00

5 Lexmark C734, C736 - Photoconductor Unit 1100 each DIR-CPO-4438 $26.88 $29,568.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $28.50 $31,350.00 OMNIA 19-12R $44.99 $49,489.00 TIPS 200105 $39.62 $43,582.00
6 Lexmark C734, C736 - Waste Toner Bottle 90 each DIR-CPO-4438 $10.09 $908.10 DIR-CPO-4438 $7.75 $697.76 OMNIA 19-12R $12.99 $1,169.10 TIPS 200105 $10.77 $969.30

7 Lexmark C734, C736 - 110-120V Fuser Maintenance Kit 20 each DIR-CPO-4438 $195.99 $3,919.80 Buyboard 656-21 $233.29 $4,665.80 OMNIA 19-12R $230.00 $4,600.00 TIPS 200105 $227.98 $4,559.60

8 Lexmark C734, C736 - Transfer Module Kit 40 each DIR-CPO-4438 $181.69 $7,267.60 Buyboard 656-21 $220.39 $8,815.60 OMNIA 19-12R $230.00 $9,200.00 TIPS 200105 $214.25 $8,570.00
9 Lexmark C746, C748 - Black Toner Cartridge 200 each DIR-CPO-4438 $133.21 $26,642.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $149.47 $29,893.18 OMNIA 19-12R $137.03 $27,406.00 TIPS 200105 $207.82 $41,564.00
10 Lexmark C746, C748 - Cyan Toner Cartridge 150 each DIR-CPO-4438 $148.53 $22,279.50 DIR-CPO-4438 $186.26 $27,939.20 OMNIA 19-12R $273.59 $41,038.50 TIPS 200105 $259.00 $38,850.00
11 Lexmark C746, C748 - Magenta Toner Cartridge 120 each DIR-CPO-4438 $148.53 $17,823.60 DIR-CPO-4438 $186.26 $22,351.36 OMNIA 19-12R $273.59 $32,830.80 TIPS 200105 $259.00 $31,080.00
12 Lexmark C746, C748 - Yellow Toner Cartridge 140 each DIR-CPO-4438 $148.53 $20,794.20 DIR-CPO-4438 $186.26 $26,076.59 OMNIA 19-12R $273.59 $38,302.60 TIPS 200105 $259.00 $36,260.00

13 Lexmark CS310, CS410, CS510 - 110-120V Fuser 
Maintenance Kit 10 each DIR-CPO-4438 $253.95 $2,539.50 Buyboard 656-21 $304.78 $3,047.80 OMNIA 19-12R $322.70 $3,227.00 TIPS 200105 $300.88 $3,008.80

14 Lexmark CS310dn, CS410dn, CS510de - Black/Color 
High Yield Imaging Kit 65 each DIR-CPO-4438 $172.98 $11,243.70 DIR-CPO-4438 $196.07 $12,744.59 OMNIA 19-12R $290.99 $18,914.35 TIPS 200105 $263.34 $17,117.10

15 Lexmark CS410-CS510 - Black/Color High Yield Waste 
Toner Cartridge 90 each DIR-CPO-4438 $7.77 $699.30 DIR-CPO-4438 $7.88 $709.41 OMNIA 19-12R $7.71 $693.90 TIPS 200105 $10.95 $985.50

16 Lexmark CS510de - Black High Yield Toner Cartridge 490 each DIR-CPO-4438 $69.44 $34,025.60 Buyboard 656-21 $79.34 $38,877.18 OMNIA 19-12R $70.26 $34,427.40 TIPS 200105 $106.55 $52,209.50

17 Lexmark CS510de - Cyan High Yield Toner Cartridge 310 each DIR-CPO-4438 $92.49 $28,671.90 Buyboard 656-21 $107.11 $33,202.82 OMNIA 19-12R $94.00 $29,140.00 TIPS 200105 $143.81 $44,581.10

18 Lexmark CS510de - Magenta High Yield Toner Cartridge 440 each DIR-CPO-4438 $92.49 $40,695.60 Buyboard 656-21 $107.08 $47,116.24 OMNIA 19-12R $93.24 $41,025.60 TIPS 200105 $153.91 $67,720.40

19 Lexmark CS510de - Yellow High Yield Toner Cartridge 382 each DIR-CPO-4438 $92.49 $35,331.18 Buyboard 656-21 $107.08 $40,905.46 OMNIA 19-12R $94.00 $35,908.00 TIPS 200105 $143.81 $54,935.42

20 Lexmark CS720, CS725, CX725 - Cyan Return Toner 
Cartridge 50 each DIR-CPO-4438 $79.12 $3,956.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $91.43 $4,571.50 OMNIA 19-12R $85.19 $4,259.50 TIPS 200105 $116.96 $5,848.00

21 Lexmark CS720, CS725, CX725 - Magenta Return Toner 
Cartridge 50 each DIR-CPO-4438 $79.12 $3,956.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $91.43 $4,571.50 OMNIA 19-12R $85.19 $4,259.50 TIPS 200105 $116.96 $5,848.00

22 Lexmark CS720de - Black Return Toner Cartridge 125 each DIR-CPO-4438 $112.94 $14,117.50 DIR-CPO-4438 $126.55 $15,818.18 OMNIA 19-12R $113.72 $14,215.00 TIPS 200105 $167.58 $20,947.50
23 Lexmark CS720de - Cyan Return Toner Cartridge 125 each DIR-CPO-4438 $129.28 $16,160.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $145.02 $18,127.84 OMNIA 19-12R $130.31 $16,288.75 TIPS 200105 $192.03 $24,003.75

24 Lexmark CS720de - Magenta Return Toner Cartridge 125 each DIR-CPO-4438 $129.28 $16,160.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $145.02 $18,127.84 OMNIA 19-12R $130.31 $16,288.75 TIPS 200105 $191.83 $23,978.75

25 Lexmark CS720de - Yellow Return Toner Cartridge 175 each DIR-CPO-4438 $129.28 $22,624.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $88.32 $15,455.68 OMNIA 19-12R $85.19 $14,908.25 TIPS 200105 $116.96 $20,468.00
26 Lexmark CS720de - Color Imaging Unit 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $191.43 $957.15 DIR-CPO-4438 $222.12 $1,110.59 OMNIA 19-12R $168.54 $842.70 TIPS 200105 $287.49 $1,437.45
27 Lexmark CS720de - Black Imaging Unit 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $65.55 $327.75 DIR-CPO-4438 $75.29 $376.47 OMNIA 19-12R $104.99 $524.95 TIPS 200105 $103.94 $519.70
28 Lexmark CS720de - Waste Toner Bottle 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $17.40 $87.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $19.09 $95.47 OMNIA 19-12R $27.99 $139.95 TIPS 200105 $25.28 $126.40
29 Lexmark CS720de - Fuser 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $407.78 $2,038.90 Buyboard 656-21 $459.53 $2,297.65 OMNIA 19-12R $424.31 $2,121.55 TIPS 200105 $453.66 $2,268.30

30 Lexmark MS415dn-MS510dn - Black High Yield Toner 
Cartridge 315 each DIR-CPO-4438 $112.52 $35,443.80 DIR-CPO-4438 $130.74 $41,182.67 OMNIA 19-12R $131.52 $41,428.80 TIPS 200105 $156.17 $49,193.55

31 Lexmark MS415dn-MS510dn - Imaging Unit 50 each DIR-CPO-4438 $36.12 $1,806.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $40.04 $2,001.76 OMNIA 19-12R $38.90 $1,945.00 TIPS 200105 $46.18 $2,309.00

32 Lexmark MS510, MS510dn - 110-120V Fuser 
Maintenance Kit, Black 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $226.60 $1,133.00 Buyboard 656-21 $274.80 $1,374.00 OMNIA 19-12R $327.76 $1,638.80 TIPS 200105 $267.50 $1,337.50

33 Lexmark MS810 - Imaging Unit 45 each DIR-CPO-4438 $38.55 $1,734.75 DIR-CPO-4438 $42.81 $1,926.53 OMNIA 19-12R $41.60 $1,872.00 TIPS 200105 $49.39 $2,222.55

34 Lexmark MS810, MS811 - 110 - 120V Fuser Maintenance 
Kit, Black 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $229.67 $1,148.35 Buyboard 656-21 $278.38 $1,391.88 OMNIA 19-12R $364.27 $1,821.35 TIPS 200105 $271.13 $1,355.65

35 Lexmark MS810 - Black High Yield Toner Cartridge 200 each DIR-CPO-4438 $325.15 $65,030.00 Buyboard 656-21 $379.38 $75,875.29 OMNIA 19-12R $368.61 $73,722.00 TIPS 200105 $508.21 $101,642.00
36 Lexmark Re-Inking Ribbon 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $12.92 $64.60 N/A NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $18.25 $91.25 TIPS 200105 $14.03 $70.15

37 Lexmark T640, T642, T644 - Black High Yield Toner 
Cartridge 20 each DIR-CPO-4438 $304.08 $6,081.60 DIR-CPO-4438 $368.82 $7,376.40 OMNIA 19-12R $354.66 $7,093.20 TIPS 200105 $459.85 $9,197.00

38 Lexmark T654 - Black High Yield Toner Cartridge 40 each DIR-CPO-4438 $385.10 $15,404.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $449.55 $17,982.12 OMNIA 19-12R $389.51 $15,580.40 TIPS 200105 $519.17 $20,766.80

39 Lexmark T650, T652, T654 - 110 - 120V Fuser 
Maintenance Kit, Black 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $263.44 $1,317.20 Buyboard 656-21 $311.31 $1,556.53 OMNIA 19-12R $341.45 $1,707.25 TIPS 200105 $304.29 $1,521.45

40 Lexmark X746-748 - Black High Yield Toner Cartridge 130 each DIR-CPO-4438 $123.88 $16,104.40 DIR-CPO-4438 $143.82 $18,697.06 OMNIA 19-12R $203.67 $26,477.10 TIPS 200105 $193.16 $25,110.80

41 Lexmark X746-748 - Cyan Toner Cartridge 100 each DIR-CPO-4438 $138.39 $13,839.00 Buyboard 656-21 $160.80 $16,080.00 OMNIA 19-12R $275.94 $27,594.00 TIPS 200105 $215.96 $21,596.00
42 Lexmark X746-748 - Magenta Toner Cartridge 80 each DIR-CPO-4438 $138.39 $11,071.20 Buyboard 656-21 $160.80 $12,864.00 OMNIA 19-12R $275.94 $22,075.20 TIPS 200105 $215.96 $17,276.80
43 Lexmark X746-748 - Yellow Toner Cartridge 70 each DIR-CPO-4438 $138.39 $9,687.30 Buyboard 656-21 $160.80 $11,256.00 OMNIA 19-12R $240.99 $16,869.30 TIPS 200105 $215.96 $15,117.20

44 Lexmark X954dhe - Black High Yield Toner Cartridge 40 each DIR-CPO-4438 $79.16 $3,166.40 DIR-CPO-4438 $91.47 $3,658.82 OMNIA 19-12R $130.52 $5,220.80 TIPS 200105 $122.85 $4,914.00

45 Lexmark X954dhe - Cyan High Yield Toner Cartridge 20 each DIR-CPO-4438 $370.50 $7,410.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $432.47 $8,649.41 OMNIA 19-12R $607.93 $12,158.60 TIPS 200105 $580.85 $11,617.00

46 Lexmark X954dhe - Magenta High Yield Toner Cartridge 20 each DIR-CPO-4438 $370.50 $7,410.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $432.47 $8,649.41 OMNIA 19-12R $607.93 $12,158.60 TIPS 200105 $580.85 $11,617.00

47 Lexmark X954dhe - Yellow High Yield Toner Cartridge 12 each DIR-CPO-4438 $370.50 $4,446.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $432.47 $5,189.65 OMNIA 19-12R $607.93 $7,295.16 TIPS 200105 $580.85 $6,970.20

48 Lexmark X954dhe - Black Photoconductor Unit 20 each DIR-CPO-4438 $180.95 $3,619.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $205.15 $4,103.06 OMNIA 19-12R $308.99 $6,179.80 TIPS 200105 $275.56 $5,511.20
49 Lexmark X954dhe - Waste Toner Bottle 40 each DIR-CPO-4438 $22.27 $890.80 DIR-CPO-4438 $24.76 $990.59 OMNIA 19-12R $24.23 $969.20 TIPS 200105 $34.43 $1,377.20
50 Lexmark MS 431 DN - Black Toner 100 each DIR-CPO-4438 $264.02 $26,402.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $297.34 $29,734.09 OMNIA 19-12R $284.85 $28,485.00 TIPS 200105 $339.08 $33,908.00
51 Lexmark MS 521DN - High Yield Toner 16 each DIR-CPO-4438 $271.99 $4,351.84 DIR-CPO-4438 $317.18 $5,074.82 OMNIA 19-12R $293.48 $4,695.68 TIPS 200105 $347.78 $5,564.48
52 Lexmark MS 521 DN - Imaging Unit 2 each DIR-CPO-4438 $72.51 $145.02 DIR-CPO-4438 $78.54 $157.08 OMNIA 19-12R $95.99 $191.98 TIPS 200105 $86.18 $172.36
53 Lexmark MS 621 DN - Black Toner 80 each DIR-CPO-4438 $279.95 $22,396.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $315.36 $25,229.09 OMNIA 19-12R $302.12 $24,169.60 TIPS 200105 $371.77 $29,741.60
54 Lexmark MS 821 DN - High Yield Toner 40 each DIR-CPO-4438 $181.77 $7,270.80 DIR-CPO-4438 $211.58 $8,463.06 OMNIA 19-12R $195.78 $7,831.20 TIPS 200105 $232.70 $9,308.00
55 Lexmark MS 821 DN - Imaging Unit 4 each DIR-CPO-4438 $59.06 $236.24 DIR-CPO-4438 $66.31 $265.24 OMNIA 19-12R $103.99 $415.96 TIPS 200105 $99.01 $396.04
56 Lexmark MS 821 DN - Fuser 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $233.19 $1,165.95 Buyboard 656-21 $282.55 $1,412.75 OMNIA 19-12R $308.99 $1,544.95 TIPS 200105 $278.95 $1,394.75
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57 Lexmard CS 431 DW - Black Toner 64 each DIR-CPO-4438 $80.94 $5,180.16 DIR-CPO-4438 $93.56 $5,988.14 OMNIA 19-12R $87.16 $5,578.24 TIPS 200105 $123.89 $7,928.96
58 Lexmard CS 431 DW - Cyan Toner 24 each DIR-CPO-4438 $162.63 $3,903.12 DIR-CPO-4438 $189.16 $4,539.95 OMNIA 19-12R $176.22 $4,229.28 TIPS 200105 $241.96 $5,807.04
59 Lexmard CS 431 DW - Magenta Toner 24 each DIR-CPO-4438 $162.63 $3,903.12 DIR-CPO-4438 $189.16 $4,539.95 OMNIA 19-12R $176.22 $4,229.28 TIPS 200105 $250.50 $6,012.00
60 Lexmard CS 431 DW - Yellow Toner 24 each DIR-CPO-4438 $162.63 $3,903.12 DIR-CPO-4438 $189.16 $4,539.95 OMNIA 19-12R $176.22 $4,229.28 TIPS 200105 $241.96 $5,807.04
61 Lexmard CS 431 DW - Wate Toner Bottle 10 each DIR-CPO-4438 $14.65 $146.50 DIR-CPO-4438 $11.99 $119.90 OMNIA 19-12R $19.82 $198.20 TIPS 200105 $16.05 $160.50
62 Lexmard CS 431 DW - Fuser Maintenance Kit 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $86.22 $431.10 Buyboard 656-21 $92.60 $463.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $91.41 $457.05
63 Lexmard CS 431 DW - Transfer Module 8 each DIR-CPO-4438 $130.33 $1,042.64 Buyboard 656-21 $152.15 $1,217.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $140.89 $1,127.12
64 Lexmark CS 421/521 DN - Black Toner 40 each DIR-CPO-4438 $103.13 $4,125.20 DIR-CPO-4438 $119.54 $4,781.65 OMNIA 19-12R $111.37 $4,454.80 TIPS 200105 $152.91 $6,116.40
65 Lexmark CS 421/521 DN - Cyan Toner 25 each DIR-CPO-4438 $126.47 $3,161.75 DIR-CPO-4438 $146.85 $3,671.18 OMNIA 19-12R $136.81 $3,420.25 TIPS 200105 $187.83 $4,695.75
66 Lexmark CS 421/521 DN - Magenta Toner 25 each DIR-CPO-4438 $126.47 $3,161.75 DIR-CPO-4438 $146.85 $3,671.18 OMNIA 19-12R $136.81 $3,420.25 TIPS 200105 $187.83 $4,695.75
67 Lexmark CS 421/521 DN - Yellow Toner 25 each DIR-CPO-4438 $126.47 $3,161.75 DIR-CPO-4438 $146.85 $3,671.18 OMNIA 19-12R $136.81 $3,420.25 TIPS 200105 $187.83 $4,695.75
68 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Black and Color Imaging Unit 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $200.00 $1,000.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $226.88 $1,134.41 OMNIA 19-12R $319.99 $1,599.95 TIPS 200105 $290.50 $1,452.50
69 Lexmark CS 521 DN - Waste Toner Bottle 2 each DIR-CPO-4438 $20.84 $41.68 DIR-CPO-4438 $23.11 $46.21 OMNIA 19-12R $21.52 $43.04 TIPS 200105 $29.78 $59.56
70 Lexmark CS 421/521 DN - Fuser 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $129.76 $648.80 Buyboard 656-21 $156.72 $783.59 NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $154.82 $774.10
71 Lexmark CS 720 DE - Yellow Toner 25 each DIR-CPO-4438 $129.28 $3,232.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $150.14 $3,753.53 OMNIA 19-12R $139.86 $3,496.50 TIPS 200105 $192.03 $4,800.75
72 Lexmark CX 725 DHE - Black Toner 40 each DIR-CPO-4438 $231.33 $9,253.20 DIR-CPO-4438 $269.58 $10,783.06 OMNIA 19-12R $379.99 $15,199.60 TIPS 200105 $344.82 $13,792.80
73 Lexmark CX 725 DHE - Cyan Toner 25 each DIR-CPO-4438 $250.77 $6,269.25 DIR-CPO-4438 $292.33 $7,308.24 OMNIA 19-12R $411.99 $10,299.75 TIPS 200105 $373.94 $9,348.50
74 Lexmark CX 725 DHE - Magenta Toner 25 each DIR-CPO-4438 $250.77 $6,269.25 DIR-CPO-4438 $292.33 $7,308.24 OMNIA 19-12R $411.99 $10,299.75 TIPS 200105 $373.94 $9,348.50
75 Lexmark CX 725 DHE - Yellow Toner 25 each DIR-CPO-4438 $250.77 $6,269.25 DIR-CPO-4438 $292.33 $7,308.24 OMNIA 19-12R $411.99 $10,299.75 TIPS 200105 $387.12 $9,678.00
76 Lexmark X954 - 110 - 120V Fuser Maintenance Kit 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $601.44 $3,007.20 Buyboard 656-21 $671.54 $3,357.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $662.97 $3,314.85

77 HP 72 - Photo Black High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge 10 each DIR-TSO-4159 $64.94 $649.40 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.25 $692.50 OMNIA 19-12R $61.38 $613.80 DIR-TSO-4159 $70.55 $705.50

78 HP 72 - Cyan High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $64.94 $324.70 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.25 $346.25 OMNIA 19-12R $61.38 $306.90 DIR-TSO-4159 $70.55 $352.75
79 HP 72 - Magenta High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $64.94 $324.70 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.25 $346.25 OMNIA 19-12R $61.38 $306.90 DIR-TSO-4159 $70.55 $352.75
80 HP 72 - Yellow High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge 10 each DIR-TSO-4159 $64.94 $649.40 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.25 $692.50 OMNIA 19-12R $61.38 $613.80 DIR-TSO-4159 $70.55 $705.50
81 HP 72 - Gray High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge 10 each DIR-TSO-4159 $64.94 $649.40 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.25 $692.50 OMNIA 19-12R $61.38 $613.80 DIR-TSO-4159 $70.55 $705.50
82 HP 72 - Matte Black High Yield (130ml) Ink Cartridge 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $64.94 $324.70 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.25 $346.25 OMNIA 19-12R $51.55 $257.75 DIR-TSO-4159 $70.55 $352.75
83 HP 72 - Black/Yellow Printhead 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $68.05 $340.25 DIR-TSO-4159 $72.56 $362.80 OMNIA 19-12R $64.36 $321.80 DIR-TSO-4159 $73.98 $369.90
84 HP 72 - Gray/Photo Black Printhead 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $68.05 $340.25 DIR-TSO-4159 $72.56 $362.80 OMNIA 19-12R $64.36 $321.80 DIR-TSO-4159 $73.98 $369.90
85 HP 72 - Cyan/Magenta Printhead 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $68.05 $340.25 DIR-TSO-4159 $72.56 $362.80 OMNIA 19-12R $64.36 $321.80 DIR-TSO-4159 $73.98 $369.90
86 HP 87X - Black High Yield Toner Cartridge 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $155.68 $778.40 DIR-TSO-4159 $240.89 $1,204.47 OMNIA 19-12R $256.11 $1,280.55 DIR-TSO-4159 $230.50 $1,152.50
87 HP 902XL - Black Toner 6 each DIR-TSO-4159 $31.65 $189.90 DIR-TSO-4159 $36.99 $221.94 OMNIA 19-12R $34.77 $208.62 DIR-TSO-4159 $34.56 $207.36
88 HP 902XL - Cyan Toner 6 each DIR-TSO-4159 $19.00 $114.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $21.75 $130.50 OMNIA 19-12R $19.45 $116.70 DIR-TSO-4159 $20.28 $121.68
89 HP 902XL - Magenta Toner 6 each DIR-TSO-4159 $19.00 $114.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $21.75 $130.50 OMNIA 19-12R $19.45 $116.70 DIR-TSO-4159 $20.28 $121.68
90 HP 902XL - Yellow Toner 6 each DIR-TSO-4159 $19.00 $114.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $21.75 $130.50 OMNIA 19-12R $19.45 $116.70 DIR-TSO-4159 $20.28 $121.68
91 HP LaserJet Pro - M 255 DW - Black Toner 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $62.52 $312.60 DIR-TSO-4159 $72.56 $362.82 OMNIA 19-12R $104.89 $524.45 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.24 $346.20
92 HP LaserJet Pro - M 255 DW - Cyan Toner 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $66.00 $330.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $76.67 $383.35 OMNIA 19-12R $110.89 $554.45 DIR-TSO-4159 $73.17 $365.85
93 HP LaserJet Pro - M 255 DW - Magenta Toner 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $66.00 $330.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $76.67 $383.35 OMNIA 19-12R $110.89 $554.45 DIR-TSO-4159 $73.17 $365.85
94 HP LaserJet Pro - M 255 DW - Yellow Toner 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $66.00 $330.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $76.67 $383.35 OMNIA 19-12R $110.89 $554.45 DIR-TSO-4159 $73.17 $365.85
95 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Cyan Ink Cartridge 5 each Buyboard 615-20 $25.04 $125.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R NO BID NO BID BUYBOARD 661-22 $37.26 $186.30

95a Primera 53606 Original Inkjet Ink Cartridge - Black, Cyan, 
Yellow, Magenta - 4 / Pack 5 each NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $109.95 $549.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID

96 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Magenta Ink Cartridge 5 each Buyboard 615-20 $25.04 $125.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $27.95 $139.75 BUYBOARD 661-22 $33.20 $166.00
97 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Yellow Ink Cartridge 5 each Buyboard 615-20 $25.04 $125.20 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $27.95 $139.75 BUYBOARD 661-22 $33.20 $166.00
98 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Black Ink Cartridge 5 each Buyboard 615-20 $32.78 $163.90 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $109.95 $549.75 BUYBOARD 661-22 $42.67 $213.35
99 Primera Bravo 4100 Series - Print Head 5 each Buyboard 615-20 $74.51 $372.55 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $79.95 $399.75 NO BID NO BID NO BID
100 Lexmark C950 - Magenta High Yield Toner 10 each DIR-CPO-4438 $370.50 $3,705.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $432.47 $4,324.71 OMNIA 19-12R $647.99 $6,479.90 TIPS 200105 $580.85 $5,808.50

101 Lexmark C950 - Cyan High Yield Toner 10 each DIR-CPO-4438 $370.50 $3,705.00 DIR-CPO-4438 $432.47 $4,324.70 OMNIA 19-12R $647.99 $6,479.90 TIPS 200105 $580.85 $5,808.50

102 Hewlett Packard Officejet Pro 8710 Magenta / Cyan / 
Yellow Ink HP952 (3/PK) 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $71.34 $356.70 DIR-TSO-4159 $56.25 $281.25 OMNIA 19-12R $53.96 $269.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID

103 Hewlett Packard Officejet Pro 8710 High Yield Black Ink 
HP952 F6U19AN#140 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $35.66 $178.30 DIR-TSO-4159 $38.25 $191.25 OMNIA 19-12R $41.19 $205.95 DIR-TSO-4159 $39.08 $195.40

104 Hewlett Packard Laserjet P2035 Toner Cartridge CE505A 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $48.13 $240.65 DIR-TSO-4159 $73.39 $366.94 OMNIA 19-12R $76.86 $384.30 DIR-TSO-4159 $70.22 $351.10

105 Hewlett Packard 62XL Tri-Color Ink C2P07AN 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $32.98 $164.90 DIR-TSO-4159 $38.62 $193.12 OMNIA 19-12R $34.41 $172.05 DIR-TSO-4159 $36.06 $180.30
106 Hewlett Packard 62XL Black Ink C2P05AN 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $31.66 $158.30 DIR-TSO-4159 $37.02 $185.12 OMNIA 19-12R $31.74 $158.70 DIR-TSP-4159 $34.56 $172.80

107 CANON CR-150 CHECK SCANNER INK CANON PG 
245XL 6 each Buyboard 615-20 $22.45 $134.70 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $20.73 $124.38 TIPS 200105 $24.26 $145.56

108 Lexmark CS720/CX725 Transfer Module 20 each DIR-CPO-4438 $338.39 $6,767.80 Buyboard 656-21 $381.68 $7,633.65 OMNIA 19-12R $370.99 $7,419.80 TIPS 200105 $376.80 $7,536.00
109 Lexmark MS521/621 Maintenance Kit 5 each DIR-CPO-4438 $214.43 $1,072.15 Buyboard 656-21 $231.11 $1,155.53 NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $225.95 $1,129.75
110 HP 62XL Black Ink 50 each DIR-TSO-4159 $31.66 $1,583.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $31.99 $1,599.50 OMNIA 19-12R $31.74 $1,587.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $34.56 $1,728.00
111 HP 62XL Color Ink 50 each DIR-TSO-4159 $71.29 $3,564.50 DIR-TSO-4159 $34.75 $1,737.50 OMNIA 19-12R $34.41 $1,720.50 DIR-TSO-4159 $36.06 $1,803.00
112 Okidata C711 Fuser 2 each DIR-CPO-4413 $264.68 $529.36 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $285.99 $571.98 TIPS 200105 $255.50 $511.00
113 Black Imaging Drum for Okidata C711 Printer 5 each DIR-CPO-4413 $78.50 $392.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $99.49 $497.45 TIPS 200105 $103.11 $515.55
114 Transfer Belt for Okidata C711 Printer 5 each DIR-CPO-4413 $106.50 $532.50 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $166.99 $834.95 NO BID NO BID NO BID

115 Fuser Maintenance Kit for HP M605 Printer No. F2G76A - 
Check Printer 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $268.42 $536.84 NO BID NO BID NO BID OMNIA 19-12R $329.89 $659.78 DIR-TSO-4159 $300.21 $600.42

116 HP 89A Black Toner Cartridge 3 each DIR-TSO-4159 $96.78 $290.34 DIR-TSO-4159 $113.27 $339.81 OMNIA 19-12R $164.89 $494.67 DIR-TSO-4159 $108.37 $325.11
117 HP 87A Black Toner Cartridge 3 each DIR-TSO-4159 $151.62 $454.86 DIR-TSO-4159 $178.12 $534.35 OMNIA 19-12R $199.16 $597.48 DIR-TSO-4159 $170.43 $511.29

118 HP Designjet Z9 Pro 64IN - HP 776 Photo Black Standard 
Yield Ink 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $331.98 $663.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $299.61 $599.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID DIR-TSO-4159 $328.13 $656.26

119 HP Designjet Z9 Pro 64IN - HP 776 Chromatic Blue High 
Yield Ink 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $331.98 $663.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $299.61 $599.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID DIR-TSO-4159 $328.13 $656.26

120 HP Designjet Z9 Pro 64IN - HP 776 Gray High Yield Ink 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $331.98 $663.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $299.61 $599.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID DIR-TSO-4159 $328.13 $656.26

121 HP Designjet Z9 Pro 64IN - HP 776 Matte Black Standard 
Yield Ink 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $331.98 $663.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $299.61 $599.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID DIR-TSO-4159 $328.13 $656.26

122 HP Designjet Z9 Pro 64IN - HP 776 Cyan Standard Yield 
Ink 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $331.98 $663.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $299.61 $599.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID DIR-TSO-4159 $328.13 $656.26

123 HP Designjet Z9 Pro 64IN - HP 776 Chromatic Green 
Standard Yield Ink 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $331.98 $663.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $299.61 $599.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID DIR-TSO-4159 $328.13 $656.26

124 Okidata C931E Waste Toner Bottles 5 each DIR-CPO-4413 $33.00 $165.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $20.74 $103.70
125 HP 731 Designjet Printhead 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $86.97 $434.85 DIR-TSO-4159 $89.25 $446.25 OMNIA 19-12R $135.30 $676.50 DIR-TSO-4159 $94.86 $474.30
126 HP 730 Designjet Photo Black Ink 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $125.21 $626.05 DIR-TSO-4159 $128.01 $640.05 OMNIA 19-12R $179.00 $895.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $137.05 $685.25
127 HP 730 Designjet Matte Black Ink 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $125.21 $626.05 DIR-TSO-4159 $128.01 $640.05 OMNIA 19-12R $179.00 $895.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $137.05 $685.25
128 HP 730 Designjet Gray Ink 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $125.21 $626.05 DIR-TSO-4159 $128.01 $640.05 OMNIA 19-12R $179.00 $895.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $137.05 $685.25



129 HP 730 Designjet Cyan Ink 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $125.21 $626.05 DIR-TSO-4159 $128.01 $640.05 OMNIA 19-12R $179.00 $895.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $137.05 $685.25
130 HP 730 Designjet Magenta Ink 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $125.21 $626.05 DIR-TSO-4159 $128.01 $640.05 OMNIA 19-12R $179.00 $895.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $137.05 $685.25
131 HP 730 Designjet Yellow Ink 5 each DIR-TSO-4159 $125.21 $626.05 DIR-TSO-4159 $128.01 $640.05 OMNIA 19-12R $179.00 $895.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $137.05 $685.25
132 HP Officejet Pro 8610 Black Ink Cartridge #950 4 each DIR-TSO-4159 $23.16 $92.64 DIR-TSO-4159 $26.75 $107.01 OMNIA 19-12R $23.68 $94.72 DIR-TSO-4159 $24.98 $99.92
133 HP Officejet Pro 8610 Yellow Ink Cartridge #951 4 each DIR-TSO-4159 $16.81 $67.24 Buyboard 656-21 $23.01 $92.05 OMNIA 19-12R $16.89 $67.56 DIR-TSO-4159 $27.80 $111.20
134 Micr Toner for an HP Laserjet M605 Printer 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $406.45 $812.90 Buyboard 656-21 $501.71 $1,003.41 OMNIA 19-12R $459.00 $918.00 NO BID NO BID NO BID
135 HP CF360A 508A Black Toner 12 each DIR-TSO-4159 $108.75 $1,305.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $127.41 $1,528.94 OMNIA 19-12R $142.24 $1,706.88 DIR-TSO-4159 $121.91 $1,462.92
136 HP CF361A 508A Cyan Toner 12 each DIR-TSO-4159 $136.09 $1,633.08 DIR-TSO-4159 $159.74 $1,916.89 OMNIA 19-12R $178.33 $2,139.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $152.85 $1,834.20
137 HP CF362A 508A Yellow Toner 12 each DIR-TSO-4159 $136.09 $1,633.08 DIR-TSO-4159 $159.74 $1,916.89 OMNIA 19-12R $178.33 $2,139.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $152.85 $1,834.20
138 HP CF363A 508A Magenta Toner 12 each DIR-TSO-4159 $136.09 $1,633.08 DIR-TSO-4159 $159.74 $1,916.89 OMNIA 19-12R $178.33 $2,139.96 DIR-TSO-4159 $152.85 $1,834.20
139 MURATEC F-116, Fax Toner DKT 116 4 each Buyboard 615-20 $70.95 $283.80 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
140 HP Designjet 771 Maintenance Cartridge 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $93.58 $187.16 DIR-TSO-4159 $71.72 $143.44 OMNIA 19-12R $89.00 $178.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $69.05 $138.10
141 HP 771 Matte Black/Chromatic Red Printhead 2 each DIR-TSO-4159 $177.91 $355.82 DIR-TSO-4159 $190.76 $381.52 OMNIA 19-12R $253.00 $506.00 DIR-TSO-4159 $195.21 $390.42

142 Lexmark CS730, 735, CX730 Black Return Programme 
22K Toner Cartridge 6 each DIR-CPO-4438 $305.05 $1,830.30 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $381.51 $2,289.06

143 Lexmark CS/CX730 Cyan Return Programme 10.5K 
Toner Cartridge 6 each DIR-CPO-4438 $292.37 $1,754.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $365.59 $2,193.54

144 Lexmark CS/CX730 Magenta Return Programme 10.5K 
Toner Cartridge 6 each DIR-CPO-4438 $292.37 $1,754.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $365.59 $2,193.54

145 Lexmark CS/CX730 Yellow Return Programme 10.5K 
Toner Cartridge 6 each DIR-CPO-4438 $292.37 $1,754.22 NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $365.59 $2,193.54

146 Lexmark Transfer Module for Lexmark 
CS421DN/CS521DN 6 each DIR-CPO-4438 $227.73 $1,366.38 Buyboard 656-21 $246.12 $1,476.71 NO BID NO BID NO BID TIPS 200105 $242.97 $1,457.82

*Draft Until Award 1/25/2023


