

129	HP 730 Designjet Cyan Ink	5	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$125.21	\$626.05	DIR-TSO-4159	\$128.01	\$640.05	OMNIA 19-12R	\$179.00	\$895.00	DIR-TSO-4159	\$137.05	\$685.25
130	HP 730 Designjet Magenta Ink	5	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$125.21	\$626.05	DIR-TSO-4159	\$128.01	\$640.05	OMNIA 19-12R	\$179.00	\$895.00	DIR-TSO-4159	\$137.05	\$685.25
131	HP 730 Designjet Yellow Ink	5	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$125.21	\$626.05	DIR-TSO-4159	\$128.01	\$640.05	OMNIA 19-12R	\$179.00	\$895.00	DIR-TSO-4159	\$137.05	\$685.25
132	HP Officejet Pro 8610 Black Ink Cartridge #950	4	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$23.16	\$92.64	DIR-TSO-4159	\$26.75	\$107.01	OMNIA 19-12R	\$23.68	\$94.72	DIR-TSO-4159	\$24.98	\$99.92
133	HP Officejet Pro 8610 Yellow Ink Cartridge #951	4	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$16.81	\$67.24	Buyboard 656-21	\$23.01	\$92.05	OMNIA 19-12R	\$16.89	\$67.56	DIR-TSO-4159	\$27.80	\$111.20
134	Micr Toner for an HP Laserjet M605 Printer	2	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$406.45	\$812.90	Buyboard 656-21	\$501.71	\$1,003.41	OMNIA 19-12R	\$459.00	\$918.00	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
135	HP CF360A 508A Black Toner	12	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$108.75	\$1,305.00	DIR-TSO-4159	\$127.41	\$1,528.94	OMNIA 19-12R	\$142.24	\$1,706.88	DIR-TSO-4159	\$121.91	\$1,462.92
136	HP CF361A 508A Cyan Toner	12	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$136.09	\$1,633.08	DIR-TSO-4159	\$159.74	\$1,916.89	OMNIA 19-12R	\$178.33	\$2,139.96	DIR-TSO-4159	\$152.85	\$1,834.20
137	HP CF362A 508A Yellow Toner	12	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$136.09	\$1,633.08	DIR-TSO-4159	\$159.74	\$1,916.89	OMNIA 19-12R	\$178.33	\$2,139.96	DIR-TSO-4159	\$152.85	\$1,834.20
138	HP CF363A 508A Magenta Toner	12	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$136.09	\$1,633.08	DIR-TSO-4159	\$159.74	\$1,916.89	OMNIA 19-12R	\$178.33	\$2,139.96	DIR-TSO-4159	\$152.85	\$1,834.20
139	MURATEC F-116, Fax Toner DKT 116	4	each	Buyboard 615-20	\$70.95	\$283.80	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID
140	HP Designjet 771 Maintenance Cartridge	2	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$93.58	\$187.16	DIR-TSO-4159	\$71.72	\$143.44	OMNIA 19-12R	\$89.00	\$178.00	DIR-TSO-4159	\$69.05	\$138.10
141	HP 771 Matte Black/Chromatic Red Printhead	2	each	DIR-TSO-4159	\$177.91	\$355.82	DIR-TSO-4159	\$190.76	\$381.52	OMNIA 19-12R	\$253.00	\$506.00	DIR-TSO-4159	\$195.21	\$390.42
142	Lexmark CS730, 735, CX730 Black Return Programme 22K Toner Cartridge	6	each	DIR-CPO-4438	\$305.05	\$1,830.30	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	TIPS 200105	\$381.51	\$2,289.06
143	Lexmark CS/CX730 Cyan Return Programme 10.5K Toner Cartridge	6	each	DIR-CPO-4438	\$292.37	\$1,754.22	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	TIPS 200105	\$365.59	\$2,193.54
144	Lexmark CS/CX730 Magenta Return Programme 10.5K Toner Cartridge	6	each	DIR-CPO-4438	\$292.37	\$1,754.22	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	TIPS 200105	\$365.59	\$2,193.54
145	Lexmark CS/CX730 Yellow Return Programme 10.5K Toner Cartridge	6	each	DIR-CPO-4438	\$292.37	\$1,754.22	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	TIPS 200105	\$365.59	\$2,193.54
146	Lexmark Transfer Module for Lexmark CS421DN/CS521DN	6	each	DIR-CPO-4438	\$227.73	\$1,366.38	Buyboard 656-21	\$246.12	\$1,476.71	NO BID	NO BID	NO BID	TIPS 200105	\$242.97	\$1,457.82

*Draft Until Award 1/25/2023