GTS Technology Solutions, Inc.

Netsync Network Solutions, Inc.

Unique Digital Technology, LLC

SHI Government Solutions

Waypoint Solutions LLC

DIR-TSO-3763 DIR-TSO-3763 * DIR-TSO-3763 & DIR-TSO-4299 DIR-CPO-4444 DIR-TSO-4288
No. |Item Description |Qty. |Unit Bid Price Extended Price Unit Bid Price Extended Price |Unit Bid Price Extended Price |Unit Bid Price Extended Price |Unit Bid Price Extended Price
1]VxRail P670F 1/$667,284.36 $667,284.36 $667,047.87 $667,047.87 $549,692.19 $549,692.19 $721,831.50 $721,831.50 $830,953.62 $830,953.62
DMZ Servers -
2|PROD 1/$100,560.63 $100,560.63 $86,803.80 $86,803.80 $83,479.83 $83,479.83 $96,348.30 $96,348.30 No bid No bid
3|DMZ Servers - DR 1/$100,560.63 $100,560.63 $86,803.80 $86,803.80 $83,479.83 $83,479.83 $96,348.30 $96,348.30 No bid No bid
Total $868,405.62 $840,655.47 $716,651.85 $914,528.10

* Line item 1 is through Coop DIR-TSO-4299; Line item 2-3 are through Coop DIR-TSO-3763

1/27/23 draft until award






