2023-169 Purchase of Uniforms and Clothing Items - Cooperative Quote

Groovy Designs LLC Minority Authority Uniform LLC ServiceWear Apparel, Inc. CAVENDER STORES, LTD.
MISD RFP2019-556 BuyBoard 670-22 OMNIA R210102 City of Frisco 2102-051
Co-op thru 4/24/24 Co-op thru 5/31/25 Co-op thru 5/31/24 +2 1year options Current term thru 4/30/23 +3 1year options remain
10% off catalog price 25% off catalog price 42.5% off catalog price Price per unit as specified
Estimated Price Per |Personaliz|Total Personaliz Price Per [Personaliz|Total
Qty Per Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended Price Per |ation Cost |Total Price |Extended Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended
Line SHIRTS Logo/Personalization Year Item Quoted Blank Per Item [ltem Price Item Quoted Each Blank|Per Item |PerItem |Price Item Quoted Blank Per Item [ltem Price |'tem Quoted Price Per Unit
Port Authority KS0OP Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County Port Authority Port Authority
1|approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast K500P K500P Red Kap SK96" NO BID
Port Authority KS0OP Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County
XL|approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 227|XL or smaller $24.00 $0.00|  $24.00 $5,448.00|XL or smaller $15.75 $3.50 $19.25|  $4,369.75|XL or smaller $15.26 $5.75 $21.01 $4,769.27
Port Authority KS00P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County
2XL |approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 47]2XL $26.00 $0.00|  $26.00( $1,222.00)2XL $17.25 $3.50 $20.75 $975.25|2XL $15.26 $5.75[ $21.01 $987.47
Port Authority KS00P Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin County
3XL|approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 613XL $28.00 $0.00|  $28.00 $168.00]3XL $20.25 $3.50 $23.75 $142.50|3XL $15.26 $5.75[ $21.01 $126.06
Total $6,838.00) Total $5,487.50) Total $5,882.80|
Port Authority TLKS00P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin Port Authority Port Authority
2|County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast TLK500P $26.00 $0.00 $26.00 TLK500P Red Kap SK96" NO BID
Port Authority TLKS00P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin
XL |County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 42|XL or smaller $26.00 $0.00 $26.00( $1,092.00|XL or smaller $17.25 $4.00! $21.25 $892.50]XL or smaller $15.26 $5.75 $21.01 $882.42
Port Authority TLKS00P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin
2XL|County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 36]2XL $28.00 $0.00| $28.00| $1,008.00[2XL $20.25 $4.00 $24.25 $873.00]2XL $15.26 $5.75|  $21.01 $756.36|
Port Authority TLKS00P Tall Silk Touch Polo with Pocket (or Collin
3XL|County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 12]3xL $30.00 $0.00[  $30.00 $360.00]3XL $21.75 $4.00 $25.75 $309.00]3XL $15.26 $5.75|  $21.01 $252.12
Total $2,460.00) Total $2,074.50| Total $1,890.90|
Sport-Tek T475 Dry Zone Raglan Polo (or Collin County approved
3|equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast Sport-Tek T475 Sport-Tek T475 Red Kap SK96 NO BID
Sport-Tek T475 Dry Zone Raglan Polo (or Collin County approved
XL|equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 88IXL or smaller $24.00 $0.00 $24.00( $2,112.00|XL or smaller $15.30 $4.00 $19.30 $1,698.40|XL or smaller $15.26 $5.75 $21.01 $1,848.88|
Sport-Tek T475 Dry Zone Raglan Polo (or Collin County approved
2XL|equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 12]2xL $26.00 $0.00 $26.00 $312.00)2XL $16.80 $4.00 $20.80 $249.60]2XL $15.26 $5.75 $21.01 $252.12
Total $2,424.00 Total $1,948.00| Total $2,101.00|
4(District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast District DM130 District DM130 Jerzees TS14* NO BID
XL [District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 54|XL or smaller $14.00 $0.00 $14.00 $756.00]XL or smaller $8.25 $4.50 $12.75 $688.50]XL or smaller $7.35 $5.75 $13.10 $707.40|
2XL|District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent)  [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 6]2xL $16.00 $0.00[  $16.00 $96.00] 2xL $9.00 $4.50 $13.50 $81.00] 2xL $7.35 $5.75| $13.10 $78.60
Total $852.00 Total $769.50 Total $786.00
ALT 4|District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast Gildan TS13
XL|District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent)  [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 54 XL or smaller $7.35 $5.75 $13.10 $707.40|
2XL|District DM130 Perfect Tri Tee (or Collin County approved equivalent)  [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 6 2XL $7.35 $5.75 $13.10 $78.60
Total $786.00
HOODIES/SWEATSHIRTS/LIGHT JACKETS
Port & Company PC90H Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or Port & Company Port & Company
5|Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast PC90H PC90H Gildan US5052B NO BID
Port & Company PC90H Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or
XL|Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 8|XL or smaller $32.00 $0.00[  $32.00 $256.00]XL or smaller $21.95 $5.00 $26.95 $215.60 $30.68 $5.75|  $36.43 $291.44
Port & Company PC90H Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Sweatshirt (or
2XL|Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 7]2xL $34.00 $0.00[  $34.00 $238.00)2XL $25.30 $5.00 $30.30 $212.10 $30.68 $5.75|  $36.43 $255.01
Total $494.00 Total $427.70 Total $546.45
Port & Company PCI0HT Tall Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded Port & Company Port & Company
6|Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast PC90OHT PC90HT Gildan US5052B* NO BID
Port & Company PCI0HT Tall Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded
XL|Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 2|XL or smaller $34.00 $0.00[  $34.00 $68.00]XL or smaller $23.45 $8.00 $31.45 $62.90]XL or smaller $30.68 $5.75|  $36.43 $72.86
Port & Company PCI0HT Tall Essential Fleece Pullover Hooded
2XL|Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 3J2xL $36.00 $0.00[  $36.00 $108.002XL $26.80 $8.00 $34.80 $104.40]2XL $30.68 $5.75|  $36.43 $109.29
Total $176.00 Total $167.30 Total $182.15
Port & Company PC90ZH Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or Port & Company Port & Company
7|Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast PC90ZH PC90ZH Red Kap HJ10 NO BID
Port & Company PC90ZH Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or
XL|Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 30| XL or smaller $36.00 $0.00| $36.00| $1,080.00|XL or smaller $24.00 $5.00 $29.00 $870.00]XL or smaller $49.05 $5.75|  $54.80 $1,644.00
Port & Company PC90ZH Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Sweatshirt (or
2XL|Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 10]2xL $38.00 $0.00[  $38.00 $380.00)2XL $25.80 $5.00 $30.80 $308.00)2XL $49.05 $5.75|  $54.80 $548.00|
No award for lines 10 and 15 Total $1,460.00 Total $1,178.00 Total $2,192.00

'Item quoted does not meet specifications
*** Draft until award




2023-169 Purchase of Uniforms and Clothing Items - Cooperative Quote (cont.)

Groovy Designs LLC Minority Authority Uniform LLC ServiceWear Apparel, Inc. CAVENDER STORES, LTD.
MISD RFP2019-556 BuyBoard 670-22 OMNIA R210102 City of Frisco 2102-051
Co-op thru 4/24/24 Co-op thru 5/31/25 Co-op thru 5/31/24 +2 1year options Current term thru 4/30/23 +3 1year options remain
10% off catalog price 25% off catalog price 42.5% off catalog price Price per unit as specified
Estimated Price Per [Personaliz|Total Personaliz Price Per [Personaliz|Total
Qty Per Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended Price Per |ation Cost |Total Price |Extended Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended
Line HOODIES/SWEATSHIRTS/LIGHT JACKETS (CONT.) Logo/Personalization Year Item Quoted Blank Per item (ltem Price Item Quoted Each Blank|Per Item |PerItem |Price Item Quoted Blank Per item [ltem Price |'tem Quoted Price Per Unit
Port & Company PC90ZHT Tall Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded Port & Company Port & Company
8|Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast PC90ZHT PC90ZHT Red Kap HJ10 NO BID
Port & Company PC90ZHT Tall Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded
XL|Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 2|XL or smaller $36.00 $0.00[  $36.00 $72.00]XL or smaller $24.75 $8.00 $32.75 $65.50]XL or smaller $49.05 $5.75|  $54.80 $109.60|
Port & Company PC90ZHT Tall Essential Fleece Full-Zip Hooded
2XL|Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 8]2xL $38.00 $0.00[  $38.00 $304.00)2XL $26.90 $8.00 $34.90 $279.20)2XL $49.05 $5.75|  $54.80 $438.40|
Total $376.00 Total $344.70 Total $548.00
Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved
9(equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast Sport-Tek TST253 Sport-Tek TST253 NO BID
Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved
XL |equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 6|XL or smaller $37.00 $0.00 $37.00 $222.00]XL or smaller $25.50 $8.00! $33.50 $201.00|
Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved
2XL |equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 212xL $39.00 $0.00|  $39.00 $78.00)2XL $27.00 $8.00 $35.00 $70.00|
Sport-Tek ST253 1/4 Zip Sweatshirt (or Collin County approved
3XL|equivalent) Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 213xL $41.00 $0.00|  $41.00 $82.00]3XL $30.00 $8.00 $38.00 $76.00)
Total $382.00 Total $347.00
LawPro JC382 Flannel-Lined Jacket (or Collin County approved
10|equivalent) "ELECTIONS" Printed on Back in Large Reflective Letters 20|NO BID NO BID NO BID NO BID
WINTERWEAR
Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or
11Collin County approved equivalent) None Carhartt CT104393 Carhartt CT104393 Red Kap BD30BD* NO BID
Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or
XL |[Collin County approved equivalent) None 6]XL or smaller $120.00 $0.00[ $120.00 $720.00]XL or smaller $115.50 $0.00| $115.50 $693.00]XL or smaller $94.21 $0.00 $94.21 $565.26
Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or
2XL|Collin County approved equivalent) None 3]2XL $122.00 $0.00| $122.00 $366.00]2XL $115.50 $0.00:! $115.50 $346.50]2XL $94.21 $0.00 $94.21 $282.63
Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or
3XL|Collin County approved equivalent) None 1]3xL $124.00 $0.00| $124.00 $124.00]3XL $126.00 $0.00:! $126.00 $126.00]3XL $94.21 $0.00 $94.21 $94.21
Total $1,210.00| Total $1,165.50| Total $942.10
Carhartt CTT104393 Tall Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt
12 |Brown (or Collin County approved equivalent) None Carhartt CTT104393 Carhartt CTT104393 Red Kap BD30BD* NO BID
Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or
XL |[Collin County approved equivalent) None 6]xL or smaller $130.00 $0.00[ $130.00 $780.00]XL or smaller $126.00 $0.00| $126.00 $756.00]XL or smaller $94.21 $0.00 $94.21 $565.26
Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or
2XL|Collin County approved equivalent) None 3]2XL $132.00 $0.00| $132.00 $396.00]2XL $126.00 $0.00:! $126.00 $378.00]2XL $94.21 $0.00 $94.21 $282.63
Carhartt CT104393 Firm Duck Insulated Bib Overalls, Carhartt Brown (or
3XL|Collin County approved equivalent) None 1]3xL $134.00 $0.00| $134.00 $134.00]3XL $126.00 $0.00:! $126.00 $126.00]3XL $94.21 $0.00 $94.21 $94.21
Total $1,310.00) Total $1,260.00| Total $942.10
Carhartt CT104050 Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated Jacket, Carhartt
13 |Brown (or Collin County approved equivalent) None Carhartt CT104050 Carhartt CT104050 Red KapJDZOBD1 NO BID
Carhartt CT104050 Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated Jacket, Carhartt
XL [Brown (or Collin County approved equivalent) None 6]xL or smaller $120.00 $0.00[ $120.00 $720.00]XL or smaller $117.00 $0.00| $117.00 $702.00]XL or smaller $55.22 $0.00 $55.22 $331.32
Carhartt CT104050 Loose Fit Washed Duck Insulated Jacket, Carhartt
2XL|Brown (or Collin County approved equivalent) None 4]2XL $122.00 $0.00| $122.00 $488.00]2XL $117.00 $0.00:! $117.00 $468.00]2XL $55.22 $0.00 $55.22 $220.88)
Total $1,208.00| Total $1,170.00| Total $552.20
Carhartt CT101070 A18 Beanie, Carhartt Brown (or Collin County Wisconsin Knitting
14 |approved equivalent) None Carhartt CT101070 $20.00 $0.00 $20.00 $200.00|Carhartt CT101070 $21.00 $0.00 $21.00 $210.00|MB13NV $6.02 $0.00 $6.02 $60.20|NO BID
Cordova BYS17-12 Rubber Slush Boots (or Collin County approved
15 |equivalent) None 10|NO BID NO BID NO BID
SAFETY APPAREL
Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin Reflective Apparel Reflective Apparel
16 |County approved equivalent) Collin County Logo Printed in Black on Pocket VEA-103-CT VEA-103-CT NO BID NO BID
Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin
XL [County approved equivalent) Collin County Logo Printed in Black on Pocket 45|XL or smaller $26.00 $0.00 $26.00( $1,170.00|XL or smaller $15.00 $4.40 $19.40 $888.00)
Reflective Apparel VEA-103-CT Short Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin
2XL|County approved equivalent) Collin County Logo Printed in Black on Pocket 5|2xL $28.00 $0.00[  $28.00 $140.00)2XL $16.50 $4.40 $20.90 $119.50
No award for lines 10 and 15 Total $1,310.00|Screenprint Setup $15.00
'Item quoted does not meet specifications Total $1,022.50

*** Draft until award




2023-169 Purchase of Uniforms and Clothing Items - Cooperative Quote (cont.)

Groovy Designs LLC

Minority Authority Uniform LLC

ServiceWear Apparel, Inc.

CAVENDER STORES, LTD.

MISD RFP2019-556

BuyBoard 670-22

OMNIA R210102

City of Frisco 2102-051

Co-op thru 4/24/24

Co-op thru 5/31/25

Co-op thru 5/31/24 +2 1year options

Current term thru 4/30/23 +3 1year options remain

10% off catalog price

25% off catalog price

42.5% off catalog price

Price per unit as specified

Estimated Price Per [Personaliz|Total Personaliz Price Per [Personaliz|Total
Qty Per Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended Price Per |ation Cost |Total Price |Extended Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended
Line SAFETY APPAREL (CONT.) Logo/Personalization Year Item Quoted Blank Per item (ltem Price Item Quoted Each Blank|Per Item |PerItem |Price Item Quoted Blank Per item [ltem Price |'tem Quoted Price Per Unit
Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin Reflective Apparel Cornerstone
17 |County approved equivalent) Collin County Logo Printed in Black on Pocket VEA-202-CT-LM €s401Ls* NO BID NO BID
Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin
XL|County approved equivalent) Collin County Logo Printed in Black on Pocket 45|XL or smaller $30.00 $0.00[  $30.00| $1,350.00|XL or smaller $20.25 $4.40 $24.65| $1,124.25
Reflective Apparel VEA-202-CT-LM Long Sleeve Safety Shirt (or Collin
2XL|County approved equivalent) Collin County Logo Printed in Black on Pocket 5|2xL $32.00 $0.00[  $32.00 $160.00]2XL $21.75 $4.40 $26.15 $145.75
Total $1,510.00|Screenprint Setup $15.00
Total $1,285.00)
Cornerstone CSV105 ANSI 107 Class 2 Two-Tone Zippered Surveyor Vest Cornerstone Cornerstone Reflective Apparel
18|(or Collin County approved equivalent) None CSV105 CSV105 US3205B NO BID
Cornerstone CSV105 ANSI 107 Class 2 Two-Tone Zippered Surveyor Vest
XL|(or Collin County approved equivalent) None 40| XL or smaller $15.00 $0.00[  $15.00 $600.00]XL or smaller $17.10 $0.00 $17.10 $684.00]XL or smaller $24.59 $0.00[  $24.59 $983.60
Cornerstone CSV105 ANSI 107 Class 2 Two-Tone Zippered Surveyor Vest
2XL|(or Collin County approved equivalent) None 40[2xL $17.00 $0.00| $17.00 $680.00]2XL $18.60 $0.00 $18.60 $744.00|2XL $24.59 $0.00|  $24.59 $983.60
Total $1,280.00| Total $1,428.00 Total $1,967.20|
Cornerstone CSV405 ANSI 107 Class 2 Mesh Back Zippered Safety Vest Cornerstone Cornerstone
19|(or Collin County approved equivalent) None CSV405 CSV405 RedKap VYV6YE* NO BID
Cornerstone CSV105 ANSI 107 Class 2 Two-Tone Zippered Surveyor Vest
XL|(or Collin County approved equivalent) None 40| XL or smaller $15.00 $0.00[  $15.00 $600.00]XL or smaller $16.10 $0.00 $16.10 $644.00]XL or smaller $8.98 $0.00 $8.98 $359.20|
Cornerstone CSV105 ANSI 107 Class 2 Two-Tone Zippered Surveyor Vest
2XL|(or Collin County approved equivalent) None 40]2xL $17.00 $0.00|  $17.00 $680.00]2XL $17.55 $0.00 $17.55 $702.00]2XL $8.98 $0.00 $8.98 $359.20|
Total $1,280.00| Total $1,346.00) Total $718.40
20(Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast Reflective Apparel
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo Cornerstone CSJ500 Cornerstone CSJ500 US3157B NO BID
XL|Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece |Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 26
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo XL or smaller $65.00 $0.00| $65.00[ $1,690.00]XL or smaller $54.75 $4.50 $59.25|  $1,540.50|XL or smaller $104.50 $5.75| $110.25 $2,866.50
2XL[Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 13
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo 2XL $67.00 $0.00 $67.00 $871.00]2XL $56.25 $4.50 $60.75 $789.75|2XL $104.50 $5.75| $110.25 $1,433.25
3XL|Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 7
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo 3XL $69.00 $0.00|  $69.00 $483.00]3XL $59.25 $4.50 $63.75 $446.25|3XL $104.50 $5.75| $110.25 $771.75
4XL|Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece |Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 3
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo 4XL $71.00 $0.00| $71.00 $213.00)4XL $60.75 $4.50 $65.25 $195.75|4XL $104.50 $5.75| $110.25 $330.75
SXL|Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 1
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo SXL $73.00 $0.00| $73.00 $73.00[5XL $63.75 $4.50 $68.25 $68.25]5XL $104.50 $5.75| $110.25 $110.25
Total $3,330.00| Total $3,040.50| Total $5,512.50|
ALT 20(Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece |Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo Cornerstone CSJ502
XL|Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece |Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 26
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo XL or smaller $108.75 $4.50 $113.25|  $2,944.50
2XL[Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 13
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo 2XL $110.25 $4.50( $114.75 $1,491.75
3XL|Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 7
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo 3XL $113.25 $4.50( $117.75 $824.25)
4XL|Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece |Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 3
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo 4XL $114.75 $4.50( $119.25 $357.75)
SXL[Triple Crown TCP805 ANSI Class 3 Safety Jacket with Removable Fleece [Embroidered 2" Diameter Collin County Logo in 4 Colors on Breast 1
Liner (or Collin County approved equivalent) with "PUBLIC WORKS" Embroidered in Black Under Logo SXL $118.75 $4.50( $123.25 $123.25)
No award for lines 10 and 15 Total S5,741.50

*item quoted does not meet specifications
*** Draft until award




2023-169 Purchase of Uniforms and Clothing Items - Cooperative Quote (cont.)

Groovy Designs LLC Minority Authority Uniform LLC ServiceWear Apparel, Inc. CAVENDER STORES, LTD.
MISD RFP2019-556 BuyBoard 670-22 OMNIA R210102 City of Frisco 2102-051
Co-op thru 4/24/24 Co-op thru 5/31/25 Co-op thru 5/31/24 +2 1year options Current term thru 4/30/23 +3 1year options remain
10% off catalog price 25% off catalog price 42.5% off catalog price Price per unit as specified
Estimated Price Per [Personaliz|Total Personaliz Price Per [Personaliz|Total
Qty Per Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended Price Per |ation Cost |Total Price |Extended Each ation Cost |Price Per |Extended
Line JEANS Logo/Personalization Year Item Quoted Blank Per item (ltem Price Item Quoted Each Blank|Per Item |PerItem |Price Item Quoted Blank Per item [ltem Price |'tem Quoted Price Per Unit

21|936DEN Wrangler Cowboy Cut Rigid Slim Fit Jean, Waist 27-42, Length Wrangler 936DEN

30-36 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 27-42, L 30-36 $19.99
22|936DEN Wrangler Cowboy Cut Rigid Slim Fit Jean, Waist 29-36, Length Wrangler 936DEN

38-40 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 29-36, L 38-40 $22.99
23|13MW?Z Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Original Fit Jean, Waist 28-42, Wrangler 13MWZ

Length 30-36 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 28-42, L 30-36 $19.99
24|13MWZ Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Original Fit Jean, Waist 29-40, Wrangler 13MWZ

Length 38 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 29-40, L 38 $22.99
25|13MWZ Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Original Fit Jean, Waist 44-54, Wrangler 13MWZ

Length 32-34 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 44-54, L34 $22.99
26|13MWZPW Wrangler Cowboy Cut Original Fit Pre-Washed Jean, Waist Wrangler 13MWZPW

28-42, Length 30-36 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 28-42, L 30-36 $31.99
27|13MWZPW Wrangler Cowboy Cut Original Fit Pre-Washed Jean, Waist Wrangler 13MWZPW

29-40, Length 38 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 29-40, L 38 $33.99
28|13MWZPW Wrangler Cowboy Cut Original Fit Pre-Washed Jean, Waist Wrangler 13MWZPW

44-54, Length 32-34 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 44-54, L 32-34 $33.99
29|31MW?ZDN Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Relaxed Fit Jean, Waist 29-42, Wrangler 31MWZDN

Length 30-36 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 29-42, L 30-36 $19.99
30{31MWZDN Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Relaxed Fit Jean, Waist 30-38, Wrangler 31MWZDN

Length 38 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 30-38, L 38 $22.99
31{31MWZDN Wrangler Rigid Cowboy Cut Relaxed Fit Jean, Waist 44-46, Wrangler 31MWZDN

Length 30-34 (or Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 44-46, L 30-34 $22.99
32|31MWZPW Wrangler Relaxed Fit Jean, Waist 29-42, Length 30-36 (or Wrangler 31MWZPW

Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 29-42, L 30-36 $31.99
33|31MWZPW Wrangler Relaxed Fit Jean, Waist 30-38, Length 38 (or Collin Wrangler 31MWZPW

County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 30-38, L38 $32.99
34(31MWZPW Wrangler Relaxed Fit Jean, Waist 44-46, Length 30-34 (or Wrangler 31MWZPW

Collin County approved equivalent) None NO BID NO BID NO BID W 44-46, L 30-34 $32.99

No award for lines 10 and 15

Yitem quoted does not meet specifications
*** Draft until award




