IFB: 2022-055, PRINTING: GENERAL OFFICE FORMS TABULATION

2022-055 - Printing: General Office Forms (REBID)					Marfield, Inc.				extreme Bu	ss Services, LLC DBA usiness Services	Jayden Graphics Inc.			Scott-Merriman, Inc.			
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Un	it	Ext	ended	'	Jnit	Extended	Unit	Ext	tended	Un	it	Ext	tended
32		1000	each	\$	0.131	\$	130.60	\$	0.188	\$ 188.00	\$0.193	\$	193.20	NO BID		NO BID	
32	Cards/Tags/Stickers, Entry Forms - 3-1/4 X 7-3/8, color card	500	each	\$	0.194	\$	97 20	\$	0.294	\$ 147.00	\$0.280	\$	140.00	NO BID		NO BID	
32 stock. Print one side black ink. (500/box) Delivery: 2 weeks ARO.	100	each	\$	0.731	\$	73.10	\$	1.104	\$ 110.4	\$0.732	\$	73.20	NO BID		NO BID		
32 Total						\$	300.90			\$ 445.40		\$	406.40				
33		1000	each	\$	0.172	\$	171 90	\$	0.245	\$ 245.0	\$0.218	\$	218.40	NO BID		NO BID	
33	Cards/Tags/Stickers, Unidentified/Missing Person Forms - 3	500	each	\$	0.244	\$	121.75	\$	0.375	\$ 187.50	\$0.317	\$	158.40	NO BID		NO BID	
33	1/2 X 7 1/2. Various color card stock. Print two, sides black ink. (500/Box) Delivery: 2 weeks ARO.	100	each	\$	0.735	\$	73 50	\$	1.424	\$ 142.4	\$0.816	\$	81.60	NO BID		NO BID	
33 Total						\$	367.15			\$ 574.90)	\$	458.40				
36		1000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$	0.397	\$ 397.0	\$0.755	\$	755.00	NO BID		NO BID	
36	Cards/Tags/Sticker, Animal Services Door Knocker - 4-1/4 x 11, 2-Part NCR with backing manila index card stock. Collin	500	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$	0.660	\$ 330.0	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
36	County Logo in black print. Print one side, Black ink. Punch out die hole at top. Delivery: 2 weeks ARO.	250	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$	1.268	\$ 317.00	NO BID	NO BID		NO BID		NO BID	
36 Total										\$ 1,044.00		\$	755.00				
22		2000	each	\$	0.075	\$	149.60	\$	0.125	\$ 250.00	\$0.094	\$	188.60	\$	0.130	\$	260 000
22	Miscellaneous Forms - Accounts Payable Attorney Paysheet,	1000	each	\$	0.080	\$	80 00	\$	0.148	\$ 148.00	\$0.148	\$	147.90	\$	0.220	\$	220 000
22	1-part Form; 8-1/2 X 11; 20# Premium, 84 Bright; Print one side, black ink. Delivery: 10 days ARO.	500	each	\$	0.111	\$	55.70	\$	0.247	\$ 123.50	\$0.268	\$	133.85	\$	0.360	\$	180 000
22		100	each	\$	0.475	\$	47.45	\$	0.960	\$ 96.0	\$1.226	\$	122.60	\$	1.690	\$	169 000
22 Total						\$	332.75			\$ 617.50	,	\$	592.95			\$	829.000
50		50000	each	\$	0.182	\$	9,095 00	\$	0.061	\$ 3,050.00	\$0.056	\$	2,797.50	\$	0.120	\$	6,000 000
50	Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous - #10 Left Window	25000	each	\$	0.182	\$	4,557 50	\$	0.072	\$ 1,800.00	\$0.072	\$	1,789.50	\$	0.130	\$	3,250 000
50	Three Color Collin County Logo. Black Imprint - 1 side. Delivery: 10 days ARO.	10000	each	\$	0.192	\$	1,919 00	\$	0.915	\$ 9,150.00		\$	1,083.80		0.160	\$	1,600 000
50		5000	each	\$	0.182	\$	908 00	\$	0.113	\$ 565.00	\$0.153	\$	764.75	\$	0.210	\$	1,050 000
50 Total																	
55 1000						\$	16,479.50			\$ 14,565.00		\$	6,435.55			\$	11,900.000
51		50000	each	\$	0.152	\$	7,615 00	\$	0.074	\$ 3,700.0	\$0.063	\$	3,145.00	\$	0.140	\$	7,000 000
51		25000	each	\$	0.153	\$	3,817 50	\$	0.080	\$ 2,000.0	\$0.070	\$	1,747.50	\$	0.140	\$	3,500 000

Draft document until awarded 4/12/2023

IFB: 2022-055, PRINTING: GENERAL OFFICE FORMS TABULATION

2022-055 - Printing: General Office Forms (REBID)					Marfield, Inc.				Sebesta Business Services, LLC DBA Extreme Business Services			Jayden Graphics Inc.			Scott-Merriman, Inc.			
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Ur	nit	Ext	tended	Unit	\Box	Extended	Unit		Extended	ι	Jnit		Extended	
51		10000	each	\$	0.168	\$	1,682 00	\$ 0.10)4	\$ 1,040.00	\$0.091	\$	907.00	\$	0.150	\$	1,500 000	
51	Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous - #11 Plain Envelope, Black Imprint - 1 side. Delivery: 10 days ARO.	5000	each	\$	0.152	\$	760 50	\$ 0.11	16	\$ 580.00	\$0.105	\$	525.00	\$	0.170	\$	850 000	
51		3000	each	\$	0.155	\$	464.10	\$ 0.14	18	\$ 444.00	\$0.127	\$	381.30	\$	0.183	\$	549 000	
51		2000	each	\$	0.153	\$	305 80	\$ 0.17	75	\$ 350.00	\$0.200	\$	400.60	\$	0.270	\$	540 000	
51		1000	each	\$	0.159	\$	159 20	\$ 0.18	32	\$ 182.00	\$0.278	\$	277.70	\$	0.350	\$	350 000	
51 Total						\$	14,804.10			\$ 8,296.00		\$	7,384.10			\$	14,289.000	
55		50000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$ 0.14	18	\$ 7,400.00	\$0.167	\$	8,335.00	\$	0 230	\$	11,500 000	
55	Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous - 6x9 Brown Envelope With Metal Clasp and Adhesive; B Imprint - 1 side; Print on clasp side; Custom 2-hole drilling at opposite end of clasp. Delivery: 10 days ARO.	25000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$ 0.16	51	\$ 4,025.00	\$0.180	\$	4,492.50	\$	0 240	\$	6,000 000	
55		10000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$ 0.21	18	\$ 2,180.00	\$0.203	\$	2,033.00	\$	0 300	\$	3,000 000	
55		5000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$ 0.26	51	\$ 1,305.00	\$0.247	\$	1,235.00	\$	0 290	\$	1,450 000	
55		3000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$ 0.27	79	\$ 837.00	\$0.277	\$	831.00	\$	0.330	\$	990 000	
55		2000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$ 0.30)2	\$ 604.00	\$0.315	\$	630.00	\$	0.460	\$	920 000	
55		1000	each	NO BID		NO BID		\$ 0.37	71	\$ 371.00	\$0.429	\$	429.00	\$	0.610	\$	610 000	
55 Total										\$ 16,722.00		\$	17,985.50			\$	24,470.000	
62		50000	each	\$	0.151	\$	7,535 00	\$ 0.10)9	\$ 5,450.00	\$0.084	\$	4,180.00	\$	0.160	\$	8,000 000	
62		25000	each	\$	0.151	\$	3,777 50	\$ 0.12	22	\$ 3,050.00	\$0.092	\$	2,287.50	\$	0.170	\$	4,250 000	
62	Envelopes/Stationary/Miscellaneous - 6 1/2 X 9 1/2 White Open End Envelope. Gum seal. Print one side black ink. Delivery: 10 days ARO.	10000	each	\$	0.167	\$	1,673 00	\$ 0.15	50	\$ 1,500.00	\$0.119	\$	1,193.00	\$	0.180	\$	1,800 000	
62		5000	each	\$	0.150	\$	749 50	\$ 0.20)3	\$ 1,015.00	\$0.153	\$	763.00	\$	0.200	\$	1,000 000	
62		3000	each	\$	0.162	\$	484 80	\$ 0.23	36	\$ 708.00	\$0.189	\$	567.00	\$	0.230	\$	690 000	
62		2000	each	\$	0.151	\$	302 20	\$ 0.20	08	\$ 416.00	\$0.221	\$	441.80	\$	0.260	\$	520 000	
62		1000	each	\$	0.158	\$	158.40	\$ 0.30	06	\$ 306.00	\$0.321	\$	321.30	\$	0.360	\$	360 000	
62 Total						\$	14,680.40			\$ 12,445.00		\$	9,753.60			\$	16,620.000	

Draft document until awarded 4/12/2023