2019-188 Jail and Personal Inmate Supplies

Tabb Textiles | JAB TRADING Victory Supply Bob Barker Company Inc ICS JAIL
Co., Inc. INDUSTRIES SUPPLIES INC
Line #  Description Unit Unit Unit Unit Unit
1 BEDDING AND TOWELS: TOWELS: BATH TURKISH, WHITE, 20" X 40" No Bid No Bid $0.91|No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid VS|
Product Number BTWH2040
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $10.92
2 BEDDING AND TOWELS: WASH CLOTHS: WHITE, 12" x 12" No Bid No Bid $0.16| $0.22|No Bid
Brand Bid VS| Only sold per dozen
Product Number WCWHECO
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $1.92
3 BEDDING AND TOWELS: PILLOW CASES: WHITE STANDARD SIZE, POLYESTER COTTON BLEND No Bid No Bid $0.95] $0.77|No Bid
Brand Bid VS| Only sold per dozen
Product Number PCWH4234
Quantity per Case/Pkg 12
Price Per Case/Pkg $11.41
4 BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS COVER:PILLOW CASE STYLE 25"X75"X4", WHITE No Bid No Bid No Bid $3.75|No Bid
Brand Bid
Product Number
Quantity per Case/Pkg
Price Per Case/Pkg
5 BEDDING AND TOWELS: MATTRESS, SEALED SEAM, VINYL COVER, POLYESTER SCRIM 25"x75"x4" No Bid No Bid $66.46 $63.46[No Bid
Brand Bid VS|
Product Number MASV42575 350X 63 46 =
Quantity per Case/Pkg 1
Price Per Case/Pkg $66.46 $22!21 1 '00
6 BEDDING AND TOWELS: BLANKET: BED 62" x 80" WHITE OR GRAY No Bid No Bid $7.84|No Bid No Bid
Brand Bid VS|
Product Number BLW628070
Quantity per Case/Pkg 20
Price Per Case/Pkg $156.80

BEDDING AND TOWELS: SUICIDE BLANKET:54" X 80"
Brand Bid

Product Number

Quantity per Case/Pkg

Price Per Case/Pkg

No Bid

No Bid

$69.87

No Bid
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