
Line No. Category Description Estimated Quantity UOM Manufacturer Manufacturer Number Cooperative Contract Unit Price Extended Price Cooperative Contract Unit Price Extended Price Cooperative Contract Unit Price Extended Price

1 1
Havis 22' Console, 2020 Ford INT SUV - Motorola APEX6500 
Remote Head Radio Bracket EB25-XTL-1P Whelen Cencom 
Equipment Bracket EB40-CCS-1P

7 EACH HAVIS C-VS-1012-INUT Tarrant County 2022-200 $361.77 $2,532.39 BUYBOARD 698-23 $405.90 $2,841.30 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $392.00 $2,744.00

2 1 HAVIS SELF-ADJUSTING DOUBLE CONSOLE CUP HOLDER 7 EACH HAVIS CUP2-1001 Tarrant County 2022-200 $43.16 $302.12 BUYBOARD 698-23 $44.53 $311.71 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $43.89 $307.23
3 1 HAVIS 3" ACCESSORY POCKET, 2.5" DEEP 7 EACH HAVIS C-AP-0325-1 Tarrant County 2022-200 $30.66 $214.62 BUYBOARD 698-23 $32.90 $230.30 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $33.47 $234.29
4 1 HAVIS HVAC RELOCATION BRACKET KIT 7 EACH HAVIS CM009785-1 Tarrant County 2022-200 $36.38 $254.66 BUYBOARD 698-23 $37.77 $264.39 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $40.78 $285.46
5 1 HAVIS ARM REST - SIDE MOUNT 7 EACH HAVIS C-ARM-102 Tarrant County 2022-200 $56.44 $395.08 BUYBOARD 698-23 $59.46 $416.22 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $60.69 $424.83

6 1

One (1) lot including one (1) Havis Modular Storage Drawer Mount 
for 2021 Ford INT SUV, two (2) Medium Modular Storage Drawer 
with Medium-Duty Lock, one (1) Havis Hinged Lid Drawer Topper 
with Medium-Duty Slam Latch, and one (1) Drawer Connector Kit

7 EACH HAVIS
SBX-5004, SBX-1001, 
SBX-3001, SBX-4010

Tarrant County 2022-200 $2,540.76 $17,785.32 BUYBOARD 698-23 $2,506.05 $17,542.35 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $2,505.00 $17,535.00

7 1 Havis 11' Slide Out Locking Swing Arm with Motion Adapter 7 EACH HAVIS C-MD-112 Tarrant County 2022-200 $219.22 $1,534.54 BUYBOARD 698-23 $236.53 $1,655.71 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $241.83 $1,692.81
8 1 Havis USB-C & USB Type A Dual Port Charger 7 EACH HAVIS C-USB-3 Tarrant County 2022-200 $59.41 $415.87 BUYBOARD 698-23 $60.41 $422.87 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $65.84 $460.88

9 1 Havis 8.5' Heavy Duty Telescoping Pole with Side Mount & Short 
Handle (can be mounted internally or externally to the console)

7 EACH HAVIS C-HDM-204 Tarrant County 2022-200 $138.77 $971.39 BUYBOARD 698-23 $145.70 $1,019.90 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $153.87 $1,077.09

10 1
12.5" Wide Flat 30" Vehicle-Specific Console for 2021-2022 Ford - F-
150 Police Responder Motorola Bracket for APX6500 C-EB-25-XTL-
1P Cencom CCSRN-ST Equipment Mounting Bracket C-EB540-CC1 P

7 EACH HAVIS C-VSW-3000-F150-2 Tarrant County 2022-200 $626.33 $4,384.31 BUYBOARD 698-23 $675.89 $4,731.23 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $690.00 $4,830.00

11 1 HAVIS Accessory Pack, with Lid and Carpet Liner 7 EACH HAVIS C-AP-1395-L Tarrant County 2022-200 $169.21 $1,184.47 BUYBOARD 698-23 $191.38 $1,339.66 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $187.44 $1,312.08

12 1 Percentage Discount off Any Havis Products Not Included in the 
Above Lines

- PERCENTAGE HAVIS N/A Tarrant County 2022-200 45.4% 45.4% BUYBOARD 698-23 41.0% 41.0% Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 34.0% 34.0%

Category 1 Total Category 1 Total Category 1 Total

13 2

One (1) lot including one (1) Whelen 54" Legacy WeCanX Light Bar 
with Super Bright Clear Take Whelen 54" Downs and Alley Lights 
with Red/White/Blue/White Front Light Configuration & 
Red/Amber/Blue/Amber Rear Configuration and one (1) Whelen 
Light Bar Strap Mount Kit for a 2020+ Ford Interceptor Utility SUV

7 EACH WHELEN EB2SP3J, STPKT105 Tarrant County 2022-200 $1,657.00 $11,599.00 BUYBOARD 698-23 $2,098.89 $14,692.23 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $1,750.00 $12,250.00

14 2

One (1) lot including one (1) Whelen 54" Legacy WeCanX Light Bar 
with Super Bright Clear Take Whelen 54" Downs and Alley Lights 
with Red/White/Blue/White Front Light Configuration & 
Red/Amber/Blue/Amber Rear Configuration, one (1) Whelen Light 
Bar Strap Mount Kit for a 2020+ Ford Interceptor Utility SUV, one 
(1) Whelen Cencom Core Amp Control Module, one (1) Whelen 
WeCanX Console Mount 21 Button/Slide Control Head, one (1) 
Whelen OBDII CanPort Installation Kit for C399 for 2016-2019 Ford 
Interceptor Utility, 2020 Ford Interceptor Utility used with Factory 
Option 61B, 2016-2020 Ford F-150, 2018-2019 Ford, F-
250/350/450/550, Expedition and Transit 150/250/350, 2017-2019 
Ford Fusion (All Models), 2020 Ford Fusion Hybrid and 2016-2017 
Dodge Charger, and one (1) Whelen Vehicle-to-Vehicle Sync 
Module

7 EACH WHELEN
EB2SP3J, STPKT105, 

C399, CCTL7, C399K1, 
CV2V

Tarrant County 2022-200 $2,546.00 $17,822.00 BUYBOARD 698-23 $3,119.90 $21,839.30 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $2,900.00 $20,300.00

15 2

One (1) lot including one (1) Whelen Cencom Core Amp Control 
Module, one (1) Whelen WeCanX Console Mount 21 Button/Slide 
Control Head, one (1) Whelen OBDII CanPort Installation Kit for 
C399 for 2016-2019 Ford Interceptor Utility, 2020 Ford Interceptor 
Utility used with Factory Option 61B, 2016-2020 Ford F-150, 2018-
2019 Ford, F-250/350/450/550, Expedition and Transit 
150/250/350, 2017-2019 Ford Fusion (All Models), 2020 Ford 
Fusion Hybrid and 2016-2017 Dodge Charger, and one (1) Whelen 
Vehicle-to-Vehicle Sync Module

7 EACH WHELEN
C399, CCTL7, C399K1, 

CV2V
Tarrant County 2022-200 $889.00 $6,223.00 BUYBOARD 698-23 $1,241.20 $8,688.40 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $1,150.00 $8,050.00

16 2 Percentage Discount off Any Whelen Products Not Included in the 
Above Lines

- PERCENTAGE WHELEN N/A Tarrant County 2022-200 54.6% 54.6% BUYBOARD 698-23 48.0% 48.0% Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 40.0% 40.0%

Category 2 Total Category 2 Total Category 2 Total

17 3 SETINA DUAL T-RAIL GUNRACK WITH 2 UNIVERSAL XL LOCKS AND 
HANDCUFF KEY OVERRIDE

3 EACH SETINA GK10342UHKSVSCAXL Tarrant 2022-200 $481.22 $1,443.66 BUYBOARD 698-23 $449.90 $1,349.70 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $465.00 $1,395.00

18 3 SETINA FREE-STANDING BASE FOR SETINA T-RAIL GUNRACK FOR 
FORD F150 RESPONDER

3 EACH SETINA GF1382FDT15F150 Tarrant 2022-200 $277.31 $831.93 BUYBOARD 698-23 $289.50 $868.50 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $265.00 $795.00

19 3 Percentage Discount off Any Setina Products Not Included in the 
Above Lines

N/A SETINA N/A Tarrant County 2022-200 38.2% 38.2% BUYBOARD 698-23 32.0% 32.0% Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 23.0% 23.0%

Category 3 Total Category 3 Total Category 3 Total

20 4 PRO-GARD PRISONER TRANSPORT SEAT WITH POLY WINDOW 
CARGO BARRIER AND OUTBOARD SEAT BELTS

7 EACH PRO-GARD S4702UINT20OSB Tarrant 2022-200 $1,389.11 $9,723.77 BUYBOARD 698-23 $1,523.45 $10,664.15 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $1,485.00 $10,395.00

21 4 STREAMLIGHT STL-75675 RECHARGEABLE CLASSIC LED STINGER 
FLASHLIGHT WITH 12V CHARGER

3 EACH STREAMLIGHT 75675 Tarrant 2022-200 $112.48 $337.44 BUYBOARD 698-23 $99.72 $299.16 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $120.00 $360.00

22 4 JOTTO DESK MAGNETIC CONSOLE MIC CLIP, PN 425-3816 3 EACH JOTTO 425-3816 Tarrant 2022-200 $37.26 $111.78 BUYBOARD 698-23 No Bid No Bid Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $34.89 $104.67

23 4 TIGER TOUGH TACTICAL SEAT COVER SET, BLACK , FRONT ONLY, 
FOR FORD F150 RESPONDER

3 EACH N/A N/A No Contract $293.21 $879.63 BUYBOARD 698-23 No Bid No Bid Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $300.00 $900.00

24 4 STREAMLIGHT CLASSIC LED STINGER FLASHLIGHT WITH 12V DC 
CHARGER

7 EACH STREAMLIGHT 75664 Tarrant 2022-200 $129.76 $908.32 BUYBOARD 698-23 $99.72 $698.04 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $120.00 $840.00

25 4 MAGNETIC MIC 14 EACH INNOVATIVE PRODUCTS MMSU-1 No Contract $51.98 $727.72 BUYBOARD 698-23 $30.90 $432.60 Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 $34.89 $488.46

26 4 Percentage Discount off Other Miscellaneous Equipment not 
Herein Listed

- PERCENTAGE - N/A Tarrant County 2022-200 29.4% 29.4% BUYBOARD 698-23 10.0% 10.0% Allen Contract # 2020-6-101 12.0% 12.0%

Primary Awarded Vendor
Secondary Awarded Vendor

*Draft Until Award

$35,644.00 $45,219.93 $40,600.00

$2,275.59 $2,218.20 $2,190.00

Defender Supply, LLC G T Distributors, INC Priority Public Safety, LLC
Coop Quote for Emergency Vehicle Equipment (Annual Pricing per UOM and Percentage Discount through Cooperative)

$29,974.77 $30,775.64 $30,903.67


