2023-288 Medical Supplies Sample Pricing

—

Primary Award - McKesson Corporation
Secondary Award - Henry Schein, Inc.

McKesson Corporation

Performance Health Supply LLC, DBA Medco Supply

Company

NAO Global

Line Sourcewell 022422-MML BuyBoard 610-20 Choice Partners 20/0515G-07
1 Percentage Discount Off List/Catalog Pricing: 20% minimum discount 0-25% discount off catalog price 10 % discount off catalog price
Price Price Per (UOM Qty (UOM Price Price Per (UOM Qty (UOM Price Price Per (UOM Qty (UOM Price Price Per (UOM Qty (UOM
Line Qty UOM Description Quoted Eval UOM (Evaluated [Evaluated [Extended |Quoted Eval UOM (Evaluated |Evaluated [Extended |Quoted Eval UOM |Evaluated |Evaluated [Extended [Quoted Eval UOM (Evaluated [Evaluated [Extended
2 48|Can Caviwipes 6inx6.7in, 160 Wipes/Can, Metrex 13-1100, or Collin County approved equal $9.19 $9.19 48|Can $441.12 $11.87 $11.87 48|Can $569.76 $9.14 $9.14 48|Can $438.72 $13.64 $13.64 48|Can $654.72
3 48|Can Sanicloth Plus Germicide Canister, 160 Wipes/Can, or Collin County approved equal $5.84 $5.84 48|Can $280.32 $5.52 $5.52 48|Can $264.96 $6.15 $6.15 48|Ccan $295.20 $7.01 $7.01 48|Can $336.48
4 36|Can Lysol IC Disinfectant Spray, 19 Oz/Bottle, Crisp Linen Scent Preferred, or Collin County approved equal $8.09 $8.09 36|Can $291.24 $6.52 $6.52 36/|Can $234.72 $9.69 $9.69 36|Can $348.84 $24.04 $24.04 36|Can $865.44
5 5[Case  |Alcohol Prep Pads, 70% Isoproplyl, Large, 1.5inx3.25in, 2-Ply, 200/Box, 10 Box/Case $70.50[ $0.0353 10,000|Prep Pads $352.50 $52.60[ $0.0132 10,000|Prep Pads $131.50 $1.54| $0.0077 10,000|Prep Pads §77.00 $69.44| $0.0347 10,000|Prep Pads $347.20
6 4(Case Sponge, Gauze 4 Ply, 2in X 2 In, Non-Sterile, 8000 Total/Case $19.56| $0.0024 32,000|Each $78.24 $63.60| $0.0080 32,000|Each $254.40 $31.87| $0.0064 32,000(Each $203.97 $79.88| $0.0100 32,000|Each $319.52
7| 140(Box Bandage, Adhesive, 3/4in X 3in Stat Strip, 100/Box $2.59 $2.59 140|Box $362.60 $4.17 $4.17 140|Box $583.80 $2.25 $2.25 140|Box $315.00 $5.23 $5.23 140|Box $732.20
8 40|Box Bandage, Adhesive, 3x4in X 3in Strip, Spiderman Design, 100/Box, or Collin County approved equal $3.69 $3.69 40|Box $147.60 $3.89 $3.89 40|Box $155.60|No Bid 40|Box $0.00 $5.21 $5.21 40(Box $208.40
9 56|Bottle |Vionex Antimicrobial Liquid Soap With Pump, 18 Ounce, Metrex 10-1518, or Collin County approved equal $3.33| $0.1850 1,008|Ounce $186.48 $11.41| $0.7131 1,008(Ounce $718.83|No Bid 1,008|Ounce $0.00|No Bid 1,008[Ounce $0.00
10 22|Bottle |Lotion, Lubriderm, Unscented, 16 Ounce, or Collin County approved equal $6.55 $6.55 22|Bottle $144.10 $7.17 $7.17 22|Bottle $157.74 $7.43 $7.43 22|Bottle $163.46 $30.56 $30.56 22|Bottle $672.32
11 3|Case Electrode, Meditrace 210, 10/Pack, 50 Pack/Case, or Collin County approved equal $70.56 $70.56 3|Case $211.68 $80.00 $80.00 3|Case $240.00|No Bid 3|Case $0.00] $100.10f $100.10 3|Case $300.30
Aneroid Spygmomanometer Unit, Without Inflation Wrist Unit, Automatic, Digital, Adult, One Size Fits
12 7|Each  [Most $19.21|  $19.21 7|Each $134.47]  ¢$18.73|  $18.73 7|Each $131.11|No Bid 7|Each $0.00|No Bid 7|Each $0.00
13 33|Each Digital Blood Pressure Monitor, 1-Tube Automatic Inflation, Adult Large Cuff, With Case $21.53 $21.53 33|Each $710.49 $38.27 $38.27 33|Each $1,262.91 $61.63 $61.63 33(Each $2,033.79 $89.59 $89.59 33|Each $2,956.47
Blood Glucose Meter Kit, With Ability to Store Results, Includes: Battery, Case, Lancing Device, Sample
14 32|Kit Lancets and Test Strips $26.32 $26.32 32|Kit $842.24 $13.99 $13.99 32|Kit $447.68 $28.76 $28.76 32|Kit $920.32 $10.99 $10.99 32|Kit $351.68
15 23|Each Oximeter, Fingertip, Pulse, Basic $15.19 $15.19 23|Each $349.37 $24.97 $24.97 23|Each $574.31 $17.48 $17.48 23|Each $402.04 $36.08 $36.08 23|Each $829.84
Welch Allyn 44WT-B, BP Spot 4400 Spot Check and Vital Signs Monitoring NIBP, Thermometer, SPO2, or
16 4|Each Collin County approved equal $2,447.37| $2,447.37 4|Each $9,789.48| $2,801.21| $2,801.21 4|Each $11,204.84] $2,969.03| $2,969.03 4|Each $11,876.12] S$3,566.77| $3,566.77 4|Each $14,267.08
Syringe/Needle, Vanishpoint, 3ml, 23 Gauge, 1 Inch Retractable Needle, 100/Box, or Collin County
17 1(Box approved equal $34.44 $34.44 1(Box $34.44 $39.04 $39.04 1(Box $39.04|No Bid 1|Box $0.00 $49.60 $49.60 1(Box $49.60
Syringe/Needle, Vanishpoint, 3ml, 25 Gauge, 5/8 Inch Retractable Needle, 100/Box, or Collin County
18 1(Box approved equal $34.44 $34.44 1(Box $34.44 $39.04 $39.04 1(Box $39.04|No Bid 1|Box $0.00 $58.34 $58.34 1(Box $58.34
19 50|Box Needle, Eclipse Safety, 23 Gauge, 1 Inch, 100/Box, or Collin County approved equal $14.76 $14.76 50|Box $738.00 $27.29 $27.29 50|Box $1,364.50|No Bid 50|Box $0.00 $35.94 $35.94 50|Box $1,797.00
Blood Collection Set, 23 Gauge, 3/4 Inch, Safety Needle, 12 Inch Sterile Tubing, 50/Box, BD # 367283, or
20| 103(Box Collin County approved equal $81.27 $81.27 103|Box $8,370.81 $89.14 $89.14 103|Box $9,181.42|No Bid 103|Box $0.00 $121.86 $121.86 103|Box $12,551.58
21 6|Case Sharps Container, Red, 2 Gallon, 20 Per Case $51.59 $2.58 120|Each $309.54 $3.37 $3.37 120|Each $404.40 $4.19 $4.19 120(Each $502.80 $156.40 $7.82 120|Each $938.40
22 4|Pack Epinephrine, Pen Injctr 0.3mg (2/Pk) NDC 00115- 1694-49, or Collin County approved equal $269.90| $269.90 4|Pack $1,079.60] $265.82| $265.82 4|Pack $1,063.28|No Bid 4|Pack $0.00] $362.48| $362.48 4|Pack $1,449.92
23 4|Pack Epinephrine Jr, Pen Injctr 0.15mg(2/Pk) NDC 00115-1695-49, or Collin County approved equal $269.90| $269.90 4|Pack $1,079.60] $265.82| $265.82 4|Pack $1,063.28|No Bid 4|Pack $0.00] $362.48| $362.48 4|Pack $1,449.92
24 80|SDV Kenalog-40 Mg SDV, 1 MI, NDC 00003-0293-05, or Collin County approved equal $5.91 $5.91 80|SDV $472.80 $11.67 $11.67 80|SDV $933.60|No Bid 80|SDV $0.00 $16.61 $16.61 80|SDV $1,328.80
25 6|Kit Glucagon Emer 1 Mg Kit, NDC 00002-8031-01, or Collin County approved equal $233.61 $233.61 6|Kit $1,401.66 $292.51 $292.51 6|Kit $1,755.06|No Bid 6|Kit $0.00|No Bid 6|Kit $0.00
26 80|SDV Methylprednisolone 40 Mg SDV, 1ml, NDC 70121-1573-01, or Collin County approved equal $5.40 $5.40 80|SDV $432.00 $10.52 $10.52 80|SDV $841.60|No Bid 80|SDhV $0.00 $14.79 $14.79 80|SDV $1,183.20
27| 250|Box Micro-Touch NitraFree Nitrile Gloves, Latex Free, Size Medium, 100/Box, or Collin County approved equal $7.33 $7.33 250(Box $1,832.50 $11.42 $11.42 250(Box $2,855.00 $5.11 $12.78 250(Box $3,193.75 $12.35 $12.35 250(Box $3,087.50
NeoPro EC Chloroprene Gloves, Latex Free, Powder Free, Size Medium, 50/Box, or Collin County approved
28| 250(Box equal $10.03 $10.03 250(|Box $2,507.50 $11.46 $11.46 250(|Box $2,865.00|No Bid 250|Box $0.00 $16.02 $16.02 250(|Box $4,005.00
29| 250|Box Microflex Nitrile Gloves, Latex Free, Cobalt Blue, Size Medium, 300/Box, or Collin County approved equal $6.84 $20.52 250(Box $5,130.00 $19.86 $19.86 250(Box $4,965.00|No Bid 250(Box $0.00 $10.94 $10.94 250(Box $2,735.00
Moldex 1510 Medical N95, Non-Sterile, Level 3, Size X-Small, 20/Box, 8 Box/Case, or Collin County
30 12|Case  |approved equal $214.03| S214.03 12|Case $2,568.36|No Bid 12|Case $0.00]No Bid 12|Case $0.00] S$209.52| S$209.52 12|Case $2,514.24
Moldex 1511 Medical N95, Non-Sterile, Level 3, Size Small, 20/Box, 8 Box/Case, or Collin County approved
31 12[Case equal $216.44| S$216.44 12[Case $2,597.28|No Bid 12[Case $0.00|No Bid 12|Case $0.00|No Bid 12[Case $0.00
Moldex 1512 Medical N95, Non-Sterile, Level 3, Size Medium, 20/Box, 8 Box/Case, or Collin County
32 12|Case  |approved equal $218.90| $218.90 12|Case $2,626.80|No Bid 12|Case $0.00]No Bid 12|Case $0.00|No Bid 12|Case $0.00
Moldex 1513 Medical N95, Non-Sterile, Level 3, Size Large 20/Box, 8 Box/Case, or Collin County approved
33 12|Case equal $221.41 $1.38 1,920(Mask $2,656.90|No Bid 1,920(Mask $0.00 $28.00 $1.40 1,920(Mask $2,688.00|No Bid 1,920(Mask $0.00
O&M Halyard 46827, Medical N95, Level 3, Size Small, 35/Box, 6 Box/Case, or Collin County approved
34 8|Case equal $421.32 $2.0063 1,680(Mask $3,370.58 $45.14 $1.2897 1,680(Mask $2,166.70|No Bid 1,680(Mask $0.00 $325.22 $1.5487 1,680(Mask $2,601.76
O&M Halyard 46767, Medical N95, Level 3, Size One Size, 35/Box, 6 Box/Case, or Collin County approved
35 8|Case equal $363.33 $1.21 1,680 Mask $2,034.65 $45.14| $1.2897 1,680|Mask $2,166.70|No Bid 1,680 Mask $0.00|No Bid 1,680|Mask $0.00
Evaluation based on sample pricing. Draft until award. Total $53,599.39 Total $48,635.77
Cooperative quotes were received from Performance Health Supply LLC, DBA Medco Supply Company and Adjusted Total* $43,150.05

NAO Global, however, they were not considered since the were unable to bid on multiple line items
through a cooperative contract.

* With Lines 30-33 "No-bid" by Henry Schein Removed
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