2021-229 Change Order 2 Rebid Item Tabulation

MTS Partners, 1st Run *Saitech Inc.
Line Item Inc. dba iPrint Computer Unit Price
Number Description Part Technologies Services, Inc.
Number Unit Price Unit Price
1.1 Lexmark MS431DN 2950050 $279.00 No Bid $349.00
1.2 MS431DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED $69.00 $59.50
WARRANTY No Bid
8 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS431DN - 550 [295S0600 $95.00 $149.50
Sheet Tray No Bid
2.1 Lexmark MS621DN 3650400 $539.00 No Bid $799.00
2.2 MS621DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED ———- $199.00 $239.00
WARRANTY No Bid
9 Lexmark Paper Tray for MS621DN - 5503653110 $189.00 $210.00
Sheet Tray No Bid
3.1 Lexmark MS821DN 50G0100 $699.00 [No Bid $999.00
3.2 MS821DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED $169.00 $209.00
WARRANTY No Bid
5.1 Lexmark CS521DN 42C0060 $390.00 [No Bid $549.00
5.2 CS521DN - 3 YEAR EXTENDED 169.00 $187.00
WARRANTY No Bid
UPGRADE Fujitsu ScanSnap iX1600 PAO3770- $469.00 $449.00
23 SHTFDSCAN 40 PPM WLT B615 )
No Bid

WTH

* Non responsive as vendor does not agree to keep the price for the whole contract period






