

2023-209 Bid Tabulation

				Enterprise Holdings, LLC. TXMAS Contract 975-C1	*Hertz Corporation TXMAS Contract 975-C1
Line #	Description	QTY	UOM	Monthly Rate \$ Non Airport	Monthly Rate \$ Non Airport
1	Economy Sedan	1	month	\$703.40	\$669.80
2	Compact Sedan	1	month	\$703.40	\$669.80
3	Intermediate Sedan	1	month	\$740.60	\$705.40
4	Standard Sedan	1	month	\$740.60	\$705.40
5	Full Size Sedan	1	month	\$799.20	\$761.20
6	Premium Sedan	1	month	\$1,747.80	\$1,278.00
7	Minivan	1	month	\$1,385.40	\$1,157.00
8	Midsize SUV	1	month	\$1,321.60	\$1,172.20
9	Standard SUV	1	month	\$1,321.60	\$1,172.20
10	Full Size SUV	1	month	\$1,833.00	\$1,776.20
11	Premium SUV	1	month	\$1,833.00	\$1,776.20
12	Small Pick-Up Truck	1	month	\$1,492.00	\$1,218.00
13	Large Pick-Up Truck	1	month	\$1,598.60	\$1,278.00
14	Cargo Van/HD Cargo Van	1	month	\$1,979.20	\$1,522.40
15	HD XL/Mini Cargo Van	1	month	\$2,131.60	No Bid
16	Intermediate Hybrid Sedan	1	month	\$1,044.40	\$954.00
17	Full Size Hybrid Sedan	1	month	\$1,151.00	No Bid
18	Jeep/Crossover	1	month	\$1,385.40	No Bid
19	Convertible	1	month	\$1,747.80	No Bid
20	12 Passenger Van	1	month	\$2,600.40	\$1,969.00
21	15 Passenger Van	1	month	\$2,984.20	No Bid
22	Electrical Vehicle	1	month	No Bid	\$1,725.40

* Non-Responsive as do Not meet specs: Departments requested window Tinted vehicles but Hertz "don't have window tints"; Hertz does not allow long term rental as requested by departments