2023-218 Firearms, Ammunition and Accessories

John Doe Investigations LLC

BROWNELLS, INC.

RTP ARMOR, LLC (RTP

Colorado Sunrise Holdings LLC

Courage Tactical LLC DBA

GT DISTRIBUTORS, INC.

Precision Delta Corporation

ARMOR) DBA TK Tactical CopsPlus NOTES
[Total Price! $13,060.00 Total Price $43,464.44 Total Price. $46,253.25|Total Price| $64,762.81|Total Price| $100,784.70| Total Price| $228,227.56/ Total Price $2,209,500.00
Price Price Price Price Price Price Price
Unit per Extended Unit per Extended Unit per Extended Unit per Extended Unit per Extended Unit per Extended Unit per Extended
Line# Description Mfgr uom each($) each($) each($) each($) each($) each($) each($)
a 9MM with night sights, 3-17 round magazines  Glock or Collin County approved equal each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $409.00 $84,663.00|No Bid
A/1brl i9mm with night sights, 3-17 round magazines  Heckler & Koch each | $529.00
2 Simulator Handgun, Fixed Sights, 5Ib Glock or Collin County aproved equal  each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $454.00 $2,270.00|No Bid
Training pistol with the look, feel and approximate weight of a
Glock17/22 provides enhanced dry-fire practice. The Shot Indicating
Resetting Trigger (SIRT) system assists shooters in developing proper
grip and trigger control without spending money on ammunition. Auto-
resetting trigger activates two red lasers - one when pressure is applied
to the trigger to serve as a take-up/trigger prep indicator (may be
2 ALT1 ideactivated), while the other displays “shot” placement, Features
standard sights and a functional magazine release that enables users to
practice reloads using the included weighted training magazine SPECS:
Molded polymer, black frame and red slide. 24.5 oz. (695g) wt. with
magazine. Lasers are SmW Max, 650nm wavelength, and are
windage/elevation adjustable. Includes one training magazine, Allen
wrenches, instructions, and training DVD. Uses one CR-123 battery,
included. * NEXT LEVEL TRAINING each $272.49*
Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor Includes 5 SilencerCo or Collin County approved
8x24 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount equal each | $900.00 $3,600.00(No Bid No Bid $715.00 $2,860.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid
Silencer, Omega 300 Suppressor, includes SilencerCo or Collin County approved
1/2x28 ASR Muzzle Brake and ASR Mount equal each | $900.00 $1,800.00|No Bid No Bid $715.00 $1,430.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid
Silencerco or Collin County approved
Silencer, Omega 36M Suppressor equal each | $850.00 $3,400.00{No Bid No Bid $959.00 $3,836.00|No Bid No Bid No Bid
Viking Tactics Padded Vickers Combat Sling, Blue Force Gear or Collin County
Black approved equal each |No Bid $64.95 $389.70|No Bid No Bid $49.00 $294.00| $35.26 $211.56|No Bid
Blue Force Gear or Collin County
AR-15/M16 Vickers Combat Sling approved equal each |No Bid $54.95 $219.80|No Bid No Bid $46.00 $184.00| $45.84 $183.36|No Bid
Brownell's or Collin County approved
1" HK Style Sling Snap Hook equal each |No Bid $7.99 $47.94(No Bid No Bid $7.35 $44.10 $6.84 $41.04(No Bid
10 Optics, Weapon Sight Eotech or Collin County approved equal each |No Bid $699.00 $2,796.00(No Bid $680.00 $2,720.00| $615.00 $2,460.00| $583.70 $2,334.80(No Bid
- Troy Industries or Collin County
AR-15 Flip-Up Adjustable Rear Sight approved equal each |No Bid $125.00 $500.00|No Bid No Bid $104.00 $416.00|No Bid No Bid
0 Double Star or Collin County approved
AR-15 ACE ARFX-E Skeleton Stock equal each [No Bid $117.79 $471.16|No Bid No Bid No Bid $94.12 $376.48|No Bid
Magazines, AR-15 PMAG-D-60 223/5.56 60RD  Magpul or Collin County approved
Polymer, Black equal each |No Bid $110.64 $33,192.00{ $124.10 $37,230.00| $118.00 $35,400.00| $107.00 $32,100.00( $103.20 $30,960.00|No Bid
Magazines, AR-15 PMAG GEN M3 223/5.56 Magpul or Collin County approved
14 "
30RD Polymer, Black equal each | $14.20 $4,260.00| $12.00 $3,600.00| $15.00 $4,500.00| $12.18 $3,654.00 $11.40 $3,420.00|  $12.01 $3,603.00(No Bid
5 Magpul or Collin County approved
Magazines, PMAG 17GL9, 3 Pack (Glock 17) equal each [No Bid $39.99 $279.93| $14.75 $103.25| $37.83 $264.81| $12.00 $84.00 $11.44 $80.08(No Bid
LaRue Tactical or Collin County
Scope Mount, Quick Detach 34MM approved equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $245.00 $1,470.00(No Bid No Bid
ASP, Inc or Collin County approved
Tri-Fold Disposable Restaints, 6-pack equal each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $35.00 $3.50  $420.00| $30.18 $5.03 $362.16|No Bid
L L4 G24 Mount Wilcox or Collin County approved equal each |No Bid No Bid No Bid $525.00 $6,300.00(No Bid No Bid No Bid
20 SureFire or Collin County approved
DS-SRO7-IT Dual Pressure Switch equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid $216.00 $2,592.00| $175.00 $2,100.00| $184.75 $2,217.00|No Bid
Surefire or Collin County approved
Pistol Light X300-U equal each No Bid No Bid No Bid $323.00 $3,876.00| $250.00 $3,000.00| $256.93 $3,083.16|No Bid
» Safariland or Collin County approved
ALS Holster, Glock 17, Basketweave equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.60 $21,190.40| $165.50 $25,487.00|No Bid
- Safariland or Collin County approved
ALS/SLS Holster, Shadow Systems DR920 equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $166.80 $25,854.00| $165.50 $25,652.50|No Bid
Safariland or Collin County approved
24 . " " . "
7395 7TS ALS HOLSTER/W/WEAPON LIGHT equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $120.00 $1,440.00 $107.32 $1,287.84(No Bid
- Safariland or Collin County approved
Mag Pouch, 79 Open Top 2x equal each |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $26.80 $4,127.20|  $26.52 $4,084.08(No Bid
Defense Technology or Collin County
Indirect Fire Munitions approved equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $24.88 $7,464.00(No Bid
- Defense Technology or Collin County
LMT 40MM Light Weight Single Shot Launcher  approved equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1,079.89 $3,239.67|No Bid
28 Defense Technology or Collin County
Chemical Munitions approved equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $45.49 $13,647.00|No Bid
- Defense Technology or Collin County
Chemical Ferret Rounds approved equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $28.90 $8,670.00(No Bid
- Precision Gun Specialities or Collin
Ammunition, Training: 9mm Yellow County approved equal box |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $58.50 $175.50|No Bid
2 Ammunition, Winchester 9mm luger Ranger Winchester or Collin County approved
One / 147 gr / Bonded JHP equal box |No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $570.00 $0.57 $570,000.00
32 ALTL MM LUGER+P 135 GR CRITICAL
iDUTY HORNADY box $28.79 $1.15
- Ammunition, Hornady 5.56 NATO 53 grain CX  Hornady or Collin County approved
TAP Patrol 20/BX equal each [No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17 $1.17 $1,170.00|No Bid




Ammunition, Hornady .223 Rem-62 grain TAP
Barrier

Ammunition, Federal Premium Tactical 12GA
1oz Ball Slug 5/BX

Ammunition, LE Only Brass Case Winchester
9mm 147 gr / FMJ / Training Ammo

EDERAL- 62 GR FULL METAL JACKET

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for
manufacturer bid on line 10 for items Not Listed
Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for
manufacturer bid on Magpul brand items not Listed
Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for
manufacturer bid on Safariland brand items Not
Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for
manufacturer bid on Hornady brand items not
Listed Herein

Percent Discount Off Latest Suggested List Price for
manufacturer bid on Winchester brand items not
Listed Herein

Ammunition, Winchester 45 Automatic / 230 gr

Hornady or Collin County approved
equal

Federal Premium or Collin County

approved equal
Winchester or Collin County approved

equal

FEDERAL

Winchester or Collin County approved
|

SPEER LAWMAN
Winchester or Collin County approved
equal each

$0.89 $0.89

$89)

$0.87  $870.00|No Bid

$0.89  $890.00|No Bid

$285.00 $0.29 $28,500.

$571.00 $0.57 $571,

10.0% -

15.0% -

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$0.59 $0.59

$591

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

20.0% -

30.0% -
47.0% -

No Bid $168.50 $0.34 $168,50
$0.53 $0.53

No Bid $465.00 $0.47 $46




Winchester USA 223 Remington Ammo 55
Grain Full Metal JacketCase of 1000 (50Boxes of

62 ALTL150) (Cost Per Case $550.00)(Cost Per
Round:$.55) Winchester each $0.55  $0.55
- Ammunition, Winchester Ranger 40 SW'/ 180 gr Winchester or Collin County approved
/Bonded JHP equal box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $269.50 $0.54 $269,500.00,
S PEER GOLD DOT-40 S&W 180 GR GDHP AMMO SPEER GOLD DOT box $32.29 $0.65
" Ammunition, Winchester Ranger 223 Winchester or Collin County approved
Remington / 64 gr / Power-Point equal box No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $137.00 $0.14 $137,000.00
B4ALTL (e pERAL- 64 GR. SP FEDERAL box $17.25 $0.86
- Ammunition, Hornady .223 Remington /53 gr / Hornady or Coliin County approved
CX TAP Patrol equal each No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $1.17 $1.17  $1,170.00|No Bid
6 Ammunition, Federal Premium American Eagle Federal Premium or Collin County
Rifle 308 Win / 150 grain approved equal each No Bid $1.45 $1.45 $1,450.00|No Bid No Bid $1.18 $1.18 $1,180.00(No Bid

* Did not meet department specifications.

Line items not awarded: 6, 18, 30, 35, 39-44, 46, 47, 49, 50-53, 55, 56, 58, 60




