Office of the Purchasing Agent
Collin County Administration Building

Contract Modification Document 2300 Bloomdale Rd, Ste 3160
McKinney, TX 75071
972-548-4165
Vendor: Vulcan Construction Materials LLC Contract No. 2022-333
dba Vulcan Materials Company Contract: Aggregate for Surface Treatment
545 E. John Carpenter Frwy, #950 and Rip Rap

Irving, TX 75062

YOU ARE DIRECTED TO MAKE THE FOLLOWING MODIFICATION TO THIS CONTRACT

1 Renew contract for a 1-year period of October 1, 2023 through and inciuding September 30, 2024.

2 In accordance with Section 4.6 Price Redetermination clause, change pricing to
proposed unit pricing per the attached documentation.

Except as provided herein, all terms and conditions of the contract remain in full force and effect and may only be modified in
writing signed by both parties.

Change Order No. 1 has been accepted and authorized by authority of Collin County Commissioners Court

by Court Order No. effective on October 1, 2023.
ACCEPTED BY:
r
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HISTORICAL INFORMATION

Awarded by Court Order No. 2022-1125-10-17

Renewal No. 1 Court Order No.
Renewal No. Court Order No.
Change Order No. 1 Court Order No. Summary renewal, price increase




Change Order No. 1 attached documentation
IFB 2022-333 Road Materials, Aggregate for Surface Treatment and Rip Rap

PRIMARY
SECONDARY
TERTIARY
Vulcan Materials Company LLC dba Vulcan
Construction Materials
Line#  Description QTY UOoOM Current Price Proposed Price % Increase

1 State cost of Type B, Grade 3, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney

Stockpile 16000 ton No Bid
1 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton
1 Delivered to Anna 1 ton

Delivered to Copeville 1 ton
5 State cost of Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney

Stockpile 13000 ton $53.39 $57.82 8.29%
2 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton S 56.00 $60.64 8.29%
2 Delivered to Anna 1 ton S 55.54 $60.14 8.29%
2 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton S 54.76 $59.30 8.29%
3 State cost of Type B, Grade 5, Aggregate per ton delivered to the McKinney

Stockpile 1000 ton No Bid
3 Delivered to Farmersville 1 ton
3 Delivered to Anna 1 ton
3 Delivered to Copeville 1 ton

PICK UP

4 Type B, Grade 3 Aggregate ---- State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at

your plant site by Collin County trucks. 1 ton No Bid
5 Type B, Grade 4, Aggregate ---- State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at

your plant site by Collin County trucks. 1 ton $31.25 $33.84 8.29%

Type B, Grade 5 Aggregate --- State cost for Collin County to PICK UP at your
6 plant site by Collin County trucks 1 ton No Bid
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