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Off ice of the Purchasing Agent 
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COLLIN COUNTY, TEXAS 

 
ADDENDUM NO. FOUR (4)            IFB NO. 2022-292 
 

 
INVITATION FOR BID 

 
FOR  

 
CONSTRUCTION: BUILDING AUTOMATION SYSTEM UPGRADES 

 
DATE:  March 22, 2023 
 
NOTICE TO ALL PROSPECTIVE BIDDERS: 
 
PLEASE MAKE THE FOLLOWING CHANGES TO THE INVITATION FOR BID: 
 
CHANGES TO DIVISION 00 41 00 BID FORM: 
 
ADD PRE-BID CONFERENCE: 
 
A PRE-BID CONFERENCE will be held by Collin County at 4600 Community Ave. McKinney, TX 75071 
on Tuesday, March 28, 2023 at 2:30 P.M. in order for bidders to ask questions regarding the proposed work. It 
is the bidder’s responsibility to review the site and documents to gain a full understanding of the requirements 
of the bid. 
 
 
 
EXTEND QUESTION CUTOFF DATE: 
 
FROM: 02/02/2023 AT 5:00 PM (CST) 
 
TO: 04/03/2023 AT 5:00 PM (CST) 
 
 
 
EXTEND BID CLOSING DATE: 
 
FROM: 03/23/2023 AT 2:00 PM (CST) 
 
TO: 04/13/2023 AT 2:00 PM (CST) 
 
 
 



 
 
ADD ATTRIBUTE NO. 28: ADDENDUM NO. 4 ACKNOWLEDGEMENT 
 
ALL OTHER TERMS AND CONDITIONS OF THE SOLICITATION AND SPECIFICATIONS REMAIN 
THE SAME. 
 
SINCERELY, 
MICHELLE CHARNOSKI, NIGP-CPP, CPPB 
PURCHASING AGENT 
 
/HA 



2022-292 Addendum 4

Construction, Building Automation System Upgrades

Issue Date: 12/20/2022

Questions Deadline: 4/3/2023 05:00 PM (CT)

Response Deadline: 4/13/2023 02:00 PM (CT)

Collin County Purchasing

Contact Information

Contact: Hunter Alley Senior Buyer
Address: Purchasing

Admin. Building
Ste. 3160
2300 Bloomdale Rd.
Ste. 3160
McKinney, TX 75071

Phone: (972) 548-4117
Fax: (972) 548-4694
Email: halley@co.collin.tx.us
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Event Information

Number: 2022-292 Addendum 4
Title: Construction, Building Automation System Upgrades
Type: Invitation for Bid - Construction
Issue Date: 12/20/2022
Question Deadline: 4/3/2023 05:00 PM (CT)
Response Deadline: 4/13/2023 02:00 PM (CT)
Notes: Resulting contract will be a general contract to furnish and install new controllers to

replace the existing Honeywell X50’s and install Honeywell XL’s and furnish and
install Jace 8000 to replace the existing R2 Jaces.  This is required to allow for
maintenance and the ability to communicate with Collin County’s BAS network.

Ship To Information

Address: See Purchase Order
McKinney, TX 75071

Billing Information

Address: Auditor
Admin. Building
Ste. 3100
2300 Bloomdale Rd.
Ste. 3100
McKinney, TX 75071

Bid Activities

Pre-Bid Conference 1/17/2023 2:00:00 PM (CT)

A PRE-BID CONFERENCE will be held by Collin County at 4600 Community Ave. McKinney, TX 75071 on Tuesday,
January 17, 2023 at 2:00 P.M. and Thursday, January 19, 2023 at 9:00 A.M in order for bidders to ask questions
regarding the proposed work. It is the bidder’s responsibility to review the site and documents to gain a full
understanding of the requirements of the bid.

Pre-Bid Conference 1/19/2023 9:00:00 AM (CT)

A PRE-BID CONFERENCE will be held by Collin County at 4600 Community Ave. McKinney, TX 75071 on Tuesday,
January 17, 2023 at 2:00 P.M. and Thursday, January 19, 2023 at 9:00 A.M in order for bidders to ask questions
regarding the proposed work. It is the bidder’s responsibility to review the site and documents to gain a full
understanding of the requirements of the bid.

Pre-Bid Conference [Addendum No. 4] 3/28/2023 2:30:00 PM (CT)

A PRE-BID CONFERENCE will be held by Collin County at 4600 Community Ave. McKinney, TX 75071 on Tuesday,
March 28, 2023 at 2:30 P.M. in order for bidders to ask questions regarding the proposed work. It is the bidder’s
responsibility to review the site and documents to gain a full understanding of the requirements of the bid.

Bid Attachments

LEGAL NOTICE.docx Download

Legal Notice

Collin County BAS Upgrade Specifications.pdf View Online

Division 00 & Division 23

Collin County BAS Upgrade Drawings.pdf View Online

BAS Drawings
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https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/extract.aspx?file=output%5Ccollincountytx%5C2022_12%5C86e2a934-6aaf-4edf-b2a9-d1812555742a.docx&name=LEGAL+NOTICE.docx
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=(Ri)Kn)D7_ozv!Vx)Kkl5wdp)H-!Ggs$Hn2f!Luay!Wm6)H)T)T9aoii!Vbqvl(Aj$A1!Nhj7(Ir)Lww$Wzm3)Xd)Qi4_x)Q_b!C!Z$Tx9!Mg3s7i-$Yklj1!Ql4$K$Zk661$N)Nzo$S(Q27$Zf!Zq_vp)B!A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=1igz(Vh)Qz0)Drcz1!Wwen-nf)Vf2)Ya!Y$Js!Jx!Tox36)G)Ti)L!Hn0f(I2$R!K(Ev)Zh$Jx)M)Kgx)J5!A7!K0$H!Ej5$R6aacx!Doq$D$C$C)R$Yb1t6(Lpjc8$H!Zd0)N!F3)Hc)K80)Ldgu$Mq!M3o!J)Ck(Umg
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=4(Mq)C)On!E_)O)Oi!Tyh$Vf!M!X_)Wq6q)Rj)Uc80leg!Bbop(J58$X!B3(E)Ge$X)Ahr)F)Y9!C!A$Ji!X2$Ft0l8tz!E$F$Bb8-ne61wd$Qsc)Tx$G(Ag7$Rl!B)Y!V)Vx)Vmvb)Rna$N!Edi_!Fj9m)G(T1)P!C$L2$Xg


01_2022-292 Addendum No. 1.doc View Online

Addendum No. 1

02_AD 1_00 21 13 Instruction to Bidders.doc View Online

00 21 13 Instructions to Bidders [AD 1]

05_00 41 00 Bid Form.pdf View Online

00 41 00 Bid Form [AD 1]

10_Response (MD) to ADD #1.pdf View Online

Mechanical Engineer's Memorandum 01.25.23 [AD 1]

20_M1.1 - MINIMUM SECURITY.pdf View Online

M1.1 - MINIMUM SECURITY [AD 1]

30_M1.4 - CENTRAL PLANT - FIRST FLOOR.pdf View Online

M1.4 - CENTRAL PLANT - FIRST FLOOR [AD 1]

30_M1.5 - CENTRAL PLANT - SECOND FLOOR.pdf View Online

M1.5 - CENTRAL PLANT - SECOND FLOOR [AD 1]

40_M1.6A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.6A - ADMIN [AD 1]

50_M1.7A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.7A - ADMIN [AD 1]

60_M1.8A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.8A - ADMIN [AD 1]

70_M1.9A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.9A - ADMIN [AD 1]

80_M1.10A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.10A - ADMIN [AD 1]

90_M1.11A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.11A - ADMIN [AD 1]

100_M1.12A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.12A - ADMIN [AD 1]

110_2022-292 Pre-Bid Attendance Records.pdf View Online

Pre-Bid Attendance Records 01/17 & 01/19

01_2022-292_Addendum_No._2.doc View Online

Addendum No. 2

Bid Form_AD2.pdf View Online

00 41 00 BID FORM [AD 2]

01_2022-292 Addendum No. 3.doc View Online

Addendum No. 3

23 09 00 INSTRUMENTATION AND CONTROL FOR HVAC.pdf View Online

23 09 00 INSTRUMENTATION AND CONTROL FOR HVAC [AD 3]

211410 - M1.1 - MINIMUM SECURITY.pdf View Online

M1.1 MINIMUM SECURITY [AD 3]

211410 - M1.2 - ANIMAL SHELTER.pdf View Online

M1.2 ANIMAL SHELTER [AD 3]
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https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=4(Mq)C)On!E_)O)Oi!Tyh$Vf!M!X_)Wq6q)Rj)Uc80leg!Bbop(J58$X!B3(E)Ge$X)Ahr)F)Y9!C!A$Ji!X2$Ft0l8tz!E$F$Bb8-ne61wd$Qsc)Tx$G(Ag7$Rl!B)Y!V)Vx)Vmvb)Rna$N!Edi_!Fj9m)G(T1)P!C$L2$Xg
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=k5(O6)P0tmon)Orwcn!W)E)H!Ehgg$T!Xc!Xqo-)O)Y)E!Avdirf(Np8h0dgjsx$Ci!W5jyz(Uvk)Zon$Z)B)Sk)N4!Y!S0isz$K!J$Yr!X1$I8$Mk$D5)H$Jmwxdh5(G$Xb6!Cwj-)R!F)Cjbf)Wd)A05l$I!Mueg
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=k(Dv)Bg)Oyoc!Q93bz5d)D)I!H$K!J!Vtd)I)Umo)C42!C-(V$O9!Afg72(L4v3xlrvggi)Tl79f$N)Yz)A)O!Obfsys!Bjk$C!C$I!Vxc$W0m$F$As7)Vfasrz$Ce(Do$H!F2o)E!F)V)R)Db$W!Rq!C)Fk8hog(N7bw
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=x7u!L3jo34eqs48ty5!T)H(T(C)P)T-s$G9t!L9!N-m!H$J)R)Hw$Jbc$Kx$Bb1(Es$C!V4_(X12a)L!L8l_(V4v(V!Tj$Rt$M(Dy(Joli$E!X$Swiy8)Fpx)T(Z)K!Ad$Oqwpk)Idk7_(U9y(Dxj9!M1e$K2(H(R1$N(Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=w7dy2-!Oyd!Wv)Clw(Ijo(T)Kb)U20o-$A!N9!Mb!Nug9$O)Oaz1h)N4vlws971_u0_$Wyg$H$S7t(L65az5h$H!G(Vtcly)Mlm!Y0(Ug(Lja!D$Kg$U(O(Le5$Mn7j!X6$E)Vj9)Lk(Dq5)Qqb6sn06k!Mg
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=p!J!Wah1)Om(I4p9o(Y)R)Ofr-v$Pal22b!N!Iskr!F$D)H0vz)Sm$Pc4$Kdll$H(S3$M!Owu(W)T8!Ih(Lgrc1d(Y!Xx$D$Le(Z(E$Afj!X$P)Hl)U(Sg)Qv61r!Np$Dk)Sn(K(Nxzux!X2paexk$Q(Q(G8$Z(Fz$Fqyxw
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=!B!Zm7x)U(U(Tyl)Z)Lx7ua$F!D9!W6!D$R_40)Y)Sfo0$T4$Iy5i$X(X$L!Fg(H2l)A!F(X07(E!Yatrbl$Tp$A(B(Nm$B!X2$Ll5x)U)Dmfh(K1)Evcejx!Vk$Wrv1uv)P(G7sj(W!Cs5dq818zg$Kl(Fp(Z$M(T$E!Fu(Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=bq!Q!Cgyl)Kt(U0n(Lf2)Sb)Ayj$Iu!L2!Fa4eq!S$Zg)Ka2)Md$Ar$Ex$E(R$O!A5yl(Izt)T!Oq5_om_3r(Un(V!D66or7$Wh$U-v33lqw(Gc(Hhb$Io!Uz$Bje)L)Q13(Zkr)Wjkj!Unik$W9)Grtnz(O(J!V$Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=!Xa4i!N8x2)Tua(I(H)Jlv)Rv-nwz77$O!X8s!W4!Q1qb$It)S1)Edjr$U$T2g$Oz(Vhqx0$G7mr!Hii(V)I!Iqbyl-(W(Az!D$B$D1(Nuviqe(I$Mwez!Sq$W)Q)I(Z61)Hv!R$A8xtwjs)E(Vr_m0(P5!X$Ntus(A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=!I8!Ij)S(N(Mp)Ne)B$B!Lv5_8!C_v!Kiq9$Z)R9ax)Fo_c$U$Sk$Be(Uj$S!S32yzgt(Wp)R0ow!Z(L0g(S!K$P$R(Y(Napf$L1!V$Bb)Li)U(O)D8!A$O7)Qcosc(Gk(K!G$W(Dz4r1t(T6vh$W(A3$Ov!T5h1u(J$O!U)K0ew
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=o!Nk0!Q)E1(Co1(L)Bu)Fx$Wq1!Dlo!T!Dm$Of)G8)Xky9c$L$C$Bws(Zd$Q!Br(Y)P!Z(Yk0(Hi!C$W$Sj(L(A$Mv!Le$X6)Qa)Sc(Mw)K!X$E)M(Q(F-8c!Yhn$U-(Xs-7b(O$Zg(F$Mnr4bl!Ekk(Vl$Y!X)Zp0w$Pphv!H!P!Qu!Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=8!Mh!K)Xihafn(Vzvmx(W_1t)Qmnq)Z$J!Do0id!Dqs19t4g7yi!Hp$Ot8n)T)Xa$Puhldr$Ua$D-(M$Zzn!Q(J)Vm!Hn(Qi-(O4!D$Q$Li4d2pbr--20-(K(Wfi_$E2i!H$D2)Y)L0m(C4)N4!Q$Kc)K59(Z(Zw
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=!V!Bg)B(M(Lk32)L35p)B$K!Myvy!Stq!E$I)U)P_8$N0$By$I(M$N!J(J)A88g!P7m1_(E_5i(B!N$C$Q5(G(F$Ctxv_jd72!Vs6s$Y4)Z)Yzq(Uquqqn)P!Aey_p9z6u$Y)Zr(Fbjaek(B!Kv-$Sl0(Rcx7(Ukc$C(Dw
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=7qk!T!R6)P(Gefs8j(Jdqv6y)Q)A4talm$Y!C!W!Qxv$N)D)Ub$Bp4$Ynj$W(Pls$Q5!D(Z)T!Oqk2tg(Y(Svn!M$Mqrs$Xo946(G-vr(X$N8!T$K)Jjogt)H7_5(Kqwk)K9au!Y$Hc9)Jk(A(T!W8$A(I4(M$O(Gabg$J!Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=0!Bd!E)Ta(T(B)H)O$N!A4t!Ka!Ez$G)Rt)Vw$Pz$Bg7x$R(M9$D!A9u272szw(Gben)H3v_!Fq(T(Yx!F$J$Q9ko(Z(G$Yx!Mq$X)Lo9)O(To)Q!H$U)A(F(W!H52$C(Ol7dy7bwe(Laikjo_$Mwm(Iote$J!H(Hcx0j$Kh5g
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=uq8d!Q!L)V(Utwgx37(Knmrnbj)Q7)F$C!Kx!N5!A$Jo395)I)Q0$B4cl$Xmkgp53$U3(T$Jv!Tov_6zb(P)N9!Wox(Z(U!Ii$B-28$Y(Q(U$D!Ms$Zrl)Lb)G(A)T!J$Jkp)S(B6y(Pr!Du76$Es(D_zqe(M$E(L$Ftv!E(A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=$L9)M$Th$F)Cmo1)Ey$Uscyl85)O$Hh(Yk!Z2qb(Q5yp(L-)S)Q)O_qtm!B-$Li!Bj$Xx(Vgv$Z(Ys$T!Ot$A_kv_a(X!Qgo(N(J)V!F$N(S(Nun!Gzr$Vcr)Mnh4sm5)Ph83!Bta!T$P(G23(Pu(D(Tp!Flm$Y)Eb!J)Sdk(A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=k9$E)Fi$Z2$Fr)Yz)N1$C)Y$Eb1h016_z(Hy!Z_(Teu61b4p8(D6)W)I)J-s!Uc$J!O$X(Z-g$M05(M5o$T5m-_4j7zfghqu9!L$P(Lwf!S(P4(Upc2)M!Z$Kj(K(Mf4y6xo!T$Db)Mx)M!C!Kq4$M(E(X4r71860w
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=$K0)G4c$J$Mc)J4)D$T)Voy8$Yglvd(N!Gm(Cm(Kr9)Z)C)K!Ti-6$D_m!V$O(L6bc$W(Jo5$V6!Nvx$R_(Eki!A(Bs2h0sh3l(Y)B!V$X(M(Cv2rq!X$L)O)Wv!E!Pwp$Pi7(Wu6(J(G-q(V!Z$Rrslx)T!K)F(Rk!Nct)Fxa$H!A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=ry$Ylkj)V$A$J5z4ija)Y7)Hf1i$Ab455)Essy$Seg1k7hg-(Cwj6ik-l!D5vy50b(Qftc(T7)Crfvh)Rz)S!Q$X!Jr$C-zyqy(Uiu$Qs(Qw8sb$Ray!J$O(Z!Q(Piq(U9i)Hvm!Te$Fc(Qy96(I!S$M)Tdw
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=6$J)Fc$Vfozoh$H)G)O1$Z3_)Gpm6$T(Yyl!S(Ln1oo-(O)Z8tdo)H)D!Tfx$P1u!Dllo_$J(Jf7g$H(Nj$Wqbn!U$Is(Mp9!Tiqn(W(L-)Js5d!Vc$P9xlj5s(Oev(Lg!Vt9$Pv69)U)M1q!O!Jypr$S-v4(X-(E(Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=$K)Z$G$Vn)L94)Jv$Lf)U3dt$V(E!N(Sfv(Htc_usypi63lnp)Ft)R6)W!L$R!Kal$Vmp(F$Bt(I$D1c!Zh$M(W!Yl(Yw(C)V7!B0$Ay(X(T!Hk$V)Mjl)L!Rr!A$B(Y(Cqy(F5x1(D_!P$S)Esm!L)Roxqc(Y!Qry)M$E!T0en!Dw)Q


211410 - M1.3 - JUVENILE DETENTION CENTER - CLUSTER IV.pdf View Online

M1.3 JUVENILE DETENTION CENTER – CLUSTER IV MEZZANINE [AD 3]

211410 - M1.4 - CENTRAL PLANT - FIRST FLOOR.pdf View Online

M1.4 CENTRAL PLANT – FIRST FLOOR [AD 3]

211410 - M1.5 - CENTRAL PLANT - SECOND FLOOR.pdf View Online

M1.5 CENTRAL PLANT – SECOND FLOOR [AD 3]

211410 - M1.6A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.6A FIRST FLOOR ADMIN [AD 3]

211410 - M1.7A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.7A SECOND FLOOR PLAN NORTH – ADMIN – ALTERNATE [AD 3]

211410 - M1.8A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.8A SECOND FLOOR PLAN SOUTH - ADMIN – ALTERNATE [AD 3]

211410 - M1.9A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.9A THIRD FLOOR PLAN NORTH - ADMIN – ALTERNATE [AD 3]

211410 - M1.10A- ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.10A THIRD FLOOR PLAN SOUTH - ADMIN – ALTERNATE [AD 3]

211410 - M1.11A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.11A FOURTH FLOOR PLAN - ADMIN – ALTERNATE [AD 3]

211410 - M1.12A - ADMIN.pdf View Online

M1.12A ROOF PLAN - ADMIN – ALTERNATE [AD 3]

2022-292 BAS BID FORM AD3.pdf View Online

00 41 00 BID FORM [AD 3]

01_2022-292_Addendum_No._4.doc View Online

Addendum No. 4

Requested Attachments

W-9
(Attachment required)

Conflict of Interest Questionnaire

Bid Attributes

1 eBid Notice

Collin County exclusively uses IonWave Technologies, Inc. (Collin County eBid) for the notification and
dissemination of all solicitations. The receipt of solicitations through any other means may result in your receipt of
incomplete specifications and/or addendums which could ultimately render your bid/proposal non-compliant. Collin
County accepts no responsibility for the receipt and/or notification of solicitations through any other means. Please
initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=$K)Z$G$Vn)L94)Jv$Lf)U3dt$V(E!N(Sfv(Htc_usypi63lnp)Ft)R6)W!L$R!Kal$Vmp(F$Bt(I$D1c!Zh$M(W!Yl(Yw(C)V7!B0$Ay(X(T!Hk$V)Mjl)L!Rr!A$B(Y(Cqy(F5x1(D_!P$S)Esm!L)Roxqc(Y!Qry)M$E!T0en!Dw)Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=m$Se)Utk$E$L3e)Mgjg8)Gjg0$Oy)N$N3o(Z!Ge(Ap(Rys)W)Z)Mt4!D2cz$Hzm!Wq$Epd(Cc54$Sr(Jz-$V5!B$Rpkal(Y!Fnx4(Y5(Mr4io-)T!Ye$F1(Q9d(J!F$P)Xs7bbt)H!R!D$Krqz(O9l(J(A(K!Viak-$Ce)Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=0a$Ks)Dtxl6$J8l$O)Nj)N$Bnrj)N$Hrwh(W!Hpcbs(E2p(L40)D5sl)Sojbdne)Coywk!Yifqhq6$K!Zgw008md0$S(A4$X1d03(B4$Cxi!B2$Ds(Pf!Svl(C(Ig)I!Qc$V9s(Ppbb4(Iay5!N$H)Ep)Lnqw
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=$Q186i--rm)Sdg3$Glr$W)Pil)Q$Z7)Gg$Feleyi(C6h!C(T1_q947(Q)Ih)Dbp5fdx7)I!X6$Fqx!Y56$Uo(L$Es(O-$Shja5wg!S4$Da4(P!Pc(Of_(Pb)D_cv!O$O(E(Q!Vvtaj$Fj)B)Q!Kw!Iia$D(Uhax(R(A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=8w35k$Zl7)Ozp$R$Spvx)N)G$F)R2q_$Og4f(K!Kl0r4(W-(Cf)B8359)Mon)Tum1!Fj$L!Z$Me(W$V(Wb4$J2!L$Hal(M!V(O2rf(Ls)Z!W$Q(W(H!Ds6$A)L)I!Tq!H4$L(J(Wrv(Ae0(Klp!Vi8$Jxwg)K_y!Lhr)S_lwg
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=qzogs$M9)Rt$K$B)R)U$U)O$Y(X!Y1yno(X(Sjzckt9zdlczz6)L)Kvhjj)X!F$M!Pxa$N0w68ii(W_e$N3fcq(Y$N7bz!Qc$P6(Mn5o!H-8(U(Re_)M_!F$Gt(E(K!Zug$Y5)S4-7)O!W1qt0!Isw5h$Wd(G(O(X(J!A
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=4$U0q5)S$Q$W-z7m)H)N3$Qwla)A$L3(T!S(Wv(E1xt)B8)Bs)T!L_lk$A2!Bshxbu$C-(C4$N(E$M!Lbdmul$W(Ui!L(M(Si)F!Pddk$V(Pdb(K!W0v$U)U)Xw!K!I$C(Mt(D(N(J!R$E)Jp-tr!Di)L(O!Xqc)Y4$V!Rh!D)F$Lk(Zsw
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=pxn$Qj)M$Lbee$A)Qy)Ld$W5)J8$M(J8!Gdvin(Cu0j(M)A)G)Wj05!O$F!A$Z(A$Ru(Hp$R7!Wa$U1v(N_d3!Sx3(Tu(Y)W!U9w$S(Ev(F!R$Y)H)A!E!N$Uwbc2(K(La(D8a(T!K4$Ar)Ejl!Ajl)Q(B6!B)N$Q!Q!N)B$Wxjke(Y$U2!Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=vioyqeix5!H!P!L!Nj(Pc2k3oa50bzl)S6cb!Gvt)Cqkf0y6bkbvf4jo$Wc(Uism$M!C4(Joy8s(Ulxa(P--o)Rk6p$F$U-j(Fzhnt!Y2mj(A$Uq)Y)A1l79h(Jh5!Uo_)D!O!Y4(X)B)G)Nt!B!I$W7c!Q
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=-!Dd!W!N5xlkhl!R(X)S!Xfc)K3$R8(Zt$J!Wg(Qa(Mt(V0mwv)S$Xk$L(U!Ip(Frm$Z3i)E)W(F!Cb)Z!Z!K(T5)S)Ch)Mfxk!V!Ohs_$Bw!Ka_)Zjf6!W18o!R)Z76jp4)Bn$Bc)S2_!J$V5i(Gj38pa!W$A!I)D2v203$Qg
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=b!Yj!Q!H!Wcu7(V)U!I)E$U0(U$E!T(Gsnxk8w(Lx(Grtn)J$H$I(B!T71(F7$I)B)Tl(Zx!Njc7h)H7!F83c!A6(A32)Mo9g8g)G)Xlo!S-!Ln$J!Oh)N!Pw56cojod0lr6!W)M0e)Q$O_)Ub!Qwju$A(Xw!I$Q!M)X$S0bow
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net/VendorLanding.aspx?eq=!Uln9!Xa3!L1el!It(Q)B!C-08)J$B(S$Zx!Wxwf-(L7(L(Ge_m)C$Pmocg6n--$V(Ap_!Gat(Lduds8$La0bk)P)M(Lknt0!Z)Pl!Ad9y-!R(Anx)W)J1pqbd)W0v0!Z4dl97!Se$Ouj!Wxej)Eo1b1z-!P!Q


2 Contact Information

List the contact name, email address and phone number of the main person(s) Collin County should contact in
reference to this solicitation. Contact(s) shall be duly authorized by the company, corporation, firm, partnership or
individual to respond to any questions, clarification, and or offers in response to this solicitation.

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

3 Calendar Days Bid

Please state the consecutive calendar days bid from notice to proceed through completion of project.

(Required: Numbers only)

4 Delivery

Delivery will be F.O.B. inside delivery at Collin County designated locations and all transportation charges are to be
paid by the supplier to destination. Please state delivery in calendar days from date of order.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

5 Exceptions (for IFB - Construction)

If you take any exceptions to the specifications, you must submit the exception/s as a Question via the public eBid
portal before the Question Cutoff Date for County consideration. The County will review and publish a response via
eBid. If you would like to offer any substitutions, please review the Instruction to Bidders Document 002113, Section
1.7 and submit by separate attachment. Please initial. 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

6 Insurance Acknowledgement – Construction/Public Works

I understand that the insurance requirements of this solicitation are required and are included in the submitted
pricing. The Contractor shall furnish certificates of insurance for both the Contractor and any subcontractor to the
Purchasing department if awarded all or a portion of the resulting contract. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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7 Bonding Requirement Acknowledgement

I understand that the bonding requirements of this solicitation are required and are included in the submitted
pricing. A bond certificate (payment, performance, and/or maintenance) as stated in the specification document
shall be submitted to the Purchasing department if I am awarded all or a portion of the resulting contract. Please
initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

8 Bid Bond Acknowledgement

I understand that accompanying this bid, is a certified check, cashier’s check or Bid Bond in the amount of five
percent (5%) of the total amount bid. Bidders submitting a bid via Collin County eBid shall upload a Bid Bond at
https://collincountytx.ionwave.net. Regardless of delivery method, all Bid Bonds shall be received prior to the bid
opening time to be considered.
I understand that the original Bid Bond shall be received in the Collin County Purchasing Department no later than
close of business on the third working day after the bid opening. Late receipt of original Bid Bond shall be
cause for rejection of bid. Please initial.

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

9 Subcontractors

State the business name of all subcontractors and the type of work they will be performing under this contract. If
you are fully qualified to self-perform the entire contract, please respond with "Not Applicable-Self Perform".

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

1
0

Reference No. 1

List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as
stated herein, have been provided. Texas references are preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact,
Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail. It is the responsibility of the Bidder/Proposer to ensure submitted
references will be responsive to the County’s requests. The County reserves the right to contact references other
than those listed, and to consider any information acquired from all references during the evaluation process.

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)
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1
1

Reference No. 2

List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as
stated herein, have been provided. Texas references are preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact,
Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail. It is the responsibility of the Bidder/Proposer to ensure submitted
references will be responsive to the County’s requests. The County reserves the right to contact references other
than those listed, and to consider any information acquired from all references during the evaluation process.

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

1
2

Reference No. 3

List a company or governmental agency, other than Collin County, where these same/like products/services, as
stated herein, have been provided. Texas references are preferred. Include the following: Company/Entity, Contact,
Address, City/State/Zip, Phone, and E-Mail. It is the responsibility of the Bidder/Proposer to ensure submitted
references will be responsive to the County’s requests. The County reserves the right to contact references other
than those listed, and to consider any information acquired from all references during the evaluation process.

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

1
3

Cooperative Contracts

As permitted under Title 8, Chapter 271, Subchapter F, Section 271.101 and 271.102 V.T.C.A. and Title 7, Chapter
791, Subchapter C, Section 791.025, V.T.C.A., other local governmental entities may wish to also participate under
the same terms and conditions contained in this contract. Each entity wishing to participate must enter into an inter-
local agreement with Collin County and have prior authorization from vendor. If such participation is authorized, all
purchase orders will be issued directly from and shipped directly to the local governmental entity requiring
supplies/services. Collin County shall not be held responsible for any orders placed, deliveries made or payment for
supplies/services ordered by these entities. Each entity reserves the right to determine their participation in this
contract. Would bidder be willing to allow other local governmental entities to participate in this contract, if awarded,
under the same terms and conditions?

 Yes   No
(Required: Check only one)
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1
4

Preferential Treatment

The County of Collin, as a governmental agency of the State of Texas, may not award a contract to a nonresident
bidder unless the nonresident's bid is lower than the lowest bid submitted by a responsible Texas resident bidder by
the same amount that a Texas resident bidder would be required to underbid a nonresident bidder to obtain a
comparable contract in the state in which the nonresident's principal place of business is located (Government
Code, Title 10, V.T.C.A., Chapter 2252, Subchapter A).
 
1. Is your principal place of business in the State of Texas?
2. If your principal place of business is not in Texas, in which State is your principal place of business?
3. If your principal place of business is not in Texas, does your state favor resident bidders (bidders in your state)
by some dollar increment or percentage?
4. If your state favors resident bidders, state by what dollar amount or percentage.

 

 

 

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 4000 characters allowed)

1
5

Debarment Certification

I certify that neither my company nor an owner or principal of my company has been debarred, suspended or
otherwise made ineligible for participation in Federal Assistance programs under Executive Order 12549,
“Debarment and Suspension,” as described in the Federal Register and Rules and Regulations. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
6

Immigration and Reform Act

I declare and affirm that my company is in compliance with the Immigration and Reform Act of 1986 and all
employees are legally eligible to work in the United States of America. I further understand and acknowledge that
any non-compliance with the Immigration and Reform Act of 1986 at any time during the term of this contract will
render the contract voidable by Collin County. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
7

Disclosure of Certain Relationships

Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code requires that any vendor considering doing business with a local
government entity disclose the vendor’s affiliation or business relationship that might cause a conflict of interest with
a local government entity. Subchapter 6 of the code requires a vendor to file a conflict of interest questionnaire
(CIQ) if a conflict exists. By law this questionnaire must be filed with the records administrator of Collin County no
later than the 7th business day after the date the vendor becomes aware of an event that requires the statement to
be filed. A vendor commits an offense if the vendor knowingly violates the code. An offense under this section is a
misdemeanor. By submitting a response to this request, the vendor represents that it is in compliance with the
requirements of Chapter 176 of the Texas Local Government Code. Please send completed forms to the Collin
County County Clerk's Office located at 2300 Bloomdale Rd., Suite 2104, McKinney, TX 75071. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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1
8

Anti-Collusion Statement

Bidder certifies that its Bid/Proposal is made without prior understanding, agreement, or connection with any
corporation, firm, or person submitting a Bid/Proposal for the same materials, services, supplies, or equipment and
is in all respects fair and without collusion or fraud. No premiums, rebates or gratuities permitted; either with, prior
to, or after any delivery of material or provision of services. Any such violation may result in Agreement cancellation,
return of materials or discontinuation of services and the possible removal from bidders list. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

1
9

Disclosure of Interested Parties

Section 2252.908 of the Texas Government Code requires a business entity entering into certain contracts with a
governmental entity to file with the governmental entity a disclosure of interested parties at the time the business
entity submits the signed contract to the governmental entity. Section 2252.908 requires the disclosure form (Form
1295) to be signed by the authorized agent of the contracting business entity, acknowledging that the disclosure is
made under oath and under penalty of perjury. Section 2252.908 applies only to a contract that requires an action
or vote by the governing body of the governmental entity before the contract may be signed or has a value of at
least $1 million. Section 2252.908 provides definitions of certain terms occurring in the section. Section 2252.908
applies only to a contract entered into on or after January 1, 2016. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
0

Notification Survey

In order to better serve our offerors, the Collin County Purchasing Department is conducting the following survey.
We appreciate your time and effort expended to submit your bid. Should you have any questions or require more
information please call (972) 548-4165. How did you receive notice of this request?

 Plano Star Courier   Plan Room   Collin County eBid Notification   Collin County Website

 Other
(Required: Check only one)

2
1

Construction Acknowledgement

Bidder, declares that the only person or parties interested in this bid are those principals named herein, that his/her
bid is made without collusion with any other person, firm or corporation, that he/she has carefully examined the
Contract Documents including the Advertisement for Bids, Instruction to Bidders, Construction Agreement,
Specifications and the Drawings, therein referred to and has carefully examined the locations, conditions and
classes of materials for the proposed work, and agrees that he/she will provide all the necessary labor, machinery,
tools, equipment, apparatus and other items incidental to construction and will do all the work and furnish all the
materials called for in the Contract Documents in the manner prescribed therein. Bidder hereby declares that
he/she has visited the site of the Work and has carefully examined the Contract Documents pertaining to the Work
covered by the above Bid, and he/she further agrees to commence work within ten (10) consecutive calendar days
after date of written Notice to Proceed and to substantially complete the work on which he/she has bid within the
number of days specified subject to such extensions of time allowed by Specifications. Bidder certifies that the bid
prices contained in this bid have been carefully checked and are submitted as correct and final. The prices have
been shown in words and figures for each item listed in this bid and it is understood that in the event of a
discrepancy, the words shall govern. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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2
2

Critical Infrastructure Affirmation

Pursuant to section 2274.0102 of the Texas Government Code, Respondent certifies that neither it nor its parent
company, nor any affiliate of Respondent or its parent company, is: (1) majority owned or controlled by citizens or
governmental entities of China, Iran, North Korea, Russia, or any other country designated by the Governor under
Government Code Section 2274.0103, or (2) headquartered in any of those countries. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
3

Energy Company Boycotts

Pursuant to Section 2274.002 of the Texas Government Code, should the contract have a value of $100,000 or
more and the company employs 10 or more full-time employees, Respondent represents and warrants that: (1) it
does not, and will not for the duration of the contract, boycott energy companies, and (2) will not boycott energy
companies during the term of the contract. If circumstances relevant to this provision change during the course of
the contract, Respondent shall promptly notify Agency. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
4

Firearm Entities and Trade Associations Discrimination

Pursuant to section 2274.002 of the Texas Government Code, should the contract have a value of $100,000 or
more and the company employs 10 or more full-time employees, Respondent verifies that: (1) it  does not have a
practice, policy, guidance, or directive that discriminates against a firearm entity or firearm trade association and (2)
will not discriminate during the term of the contract against a firearm entity or firearm trade association. If
circumstances relevant to this provision change during the course of the contract, Respondent shall promptly notify
Agency. Please initial.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
5

Addendum No. 1

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
6

Addendum No. 2

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)
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2
7

Addendum No. 3

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

2
8

Addendum No. 4

Please initial to verify your receipt of the addendum.

 

 

 
(Required: Maximum 1000 characters allowed)

Bid Lines

1 Package deleted as part of an Addendum

2 Package Header

Minimum Security Bid Grand Total

Quantity: 1 UOM: job Total: $

Item Notes: Total Material Cost (Line 2.1) and Total Labor Cost (Line 2.2) must add
up to the Bid Grand Total.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Items

2.1 Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

2.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3 Package Header

Animal Shelter Bid Grand Total

Quantity: 1 UOM: job Total: $
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Item Notes: Total Material Cost (Line 3.1) and Total Labor Cost (Line 3.2) must add
up to the Bid Grand Total.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Items

3.1 Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

3.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4 Package Header

Juvenile Detention Center -  Cluster IV Mezzanine Bid Grand Total

Quantity: 1 UOM: job Total: $

Item Notes: Total Material Cost (Line 4.1) and Total Labor Cost (Line 4.2) must add
up to the Bid Grand Total.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Items

4.1 Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

4.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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5 Package Header

Central Plant Bid Grand Total

Quantity: 1 UOM: job Total: $

Item Notes: Total Material Cost (Line 5.1) and Total Labor Cost (Line 5.2) must add
up to the Bid Grand Total.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Items

5.1 Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

5.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

6 Package Header

Alternate: Administration Building [includes sheets M1.6A, M1.7A, M1.8A, M1.9A, M1.10A, M1.11A, M1.12A]

Quantity: 1 UOM: job Total: $

Item Notes: Total Material Cost (Line 6.1) and Total Labor Cost (Line 6.2) must add
up to the Bid Grand Total.

Supplier Notes:  

 

 No bid

 Alternate specification
(Attach separate sheet)

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Package Items

6.1 Total Materials Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)

Deadline: 4/13/2023 02:00 PM (CT) 2022-292 Addendum 4Page 13 of 15 pages

Addendum No. 4: 00 41 00 BID FORM



6.2 Total Labor Cost Incorporated in Project
(Response required)

Quantity: 1 UOM: lump sum Price: $ Total: $

Supplier Notes:  

 
 No bid

 Additional notes
(Attach separate sheet)
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Supplier Information

Company Name:

Contact Name:

Address:

 

 

 

Phone:

Fax:

Email:

Supplier Notes

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

 

The undersigned hereby certifies the foregoing bid submitted by the company listed below hereinafter called “bidder” is
the duly authorized agent of said company and the person signing said bid has been duly authorized to execute same.
Bidder affirms that they are duly authorized to execute this contract; this company; corporation, firm, partnership or
individual has not prepared this bid in collusion with any other bidder or other person or persons engaged in the same
line of business; and that the contents of this bid as to prices, terms and conditions of said bid have not been
communicated by the undersigned nor by any employee or agent to any other person engaged in this type of business
prior to the official opening of this bid.

Print Name Signature
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