2023-356 Bid Tabulation

FY24 Tableau Software Maintenance Carahsoft SHI Government Solutions GTS Technology Solutions,
DIR TSO-4288 DIR TSO-4288 N/A
Total: $ 50,557.95 |Total: S 50,372.55 |Total: No bid
Line No. |Manufacture No. |Description |Qty |UoM Unit Cost Ext. Cost Unit Cost Ext. Cost Unit Cost [Ext. Cost
1 200001774-679 Tableau - Explorer (Server) 25 Each S 416.85 S 10,421.25] S 414.29 S 10,357.25 | No bid No bid
2 200001773-679 Tableau - Creator (Server) 24 Each S 833.70 S 20,008.80] S 833.40 S 20,001.60 | No bid No bid
3 200001773-679 Tableau - Creator (Server) 2 Each S 833.70 $ 1,667.40]S 83340 S 1,666.80 | No bid No bid
4 200001774-679 Tableau - Explorer (Server) 10 Each S 416.85 S 4,16850] S 414.29 S 4,142.90 | No bid No bid
5 200001775-679 Tableau - Viewer (Server) 100 Each S 14292 $ 14,292.00| $ 142.04 $ 14,204.00 | No bid No bid

8/3/2023 draft until award




