IFB 2023-363 Equipment, Rental: Road Construction and Right of Way Maintenance Equipment

PRIMARY AWARD

SECONDARY AWARD
TERTIARY AWARD
Star Tractor Ltd. RDO Equipment Co. Herc Rentals Inc. Holt Texas, LTD R B Everett & Co. Kirby Smith Machinery
Total Price]  $17,000.00] Total Price]  $32,735.00]  TotalPrice]  $45,758.00] Total Price]  $47,520.00]  Total Price]  $57,954.00 Total Price| $74,470.50
Line # Description Qry UomM Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended Unit Extended
1 Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000Ibs, 9-wheel,
compaction width 68" (ballasted up to 33,000 Ibs) 1 month  No Bid $6,290.00 $6,290.00No Bid $4,000.00 $4,000.00 $3,100.00 $3,100.00No Bid
State Make/Model/Year Sakai/GW754/2020-2023 Caterpillar / CW16 / 2022+ Bomag; BW 11 RH, 2021-2023
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3000 3000 ranging from 250 Hrs to 700 Hrs
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 40 176 Hours
State Additional Costs over Max Hours 39.31/hour Per hr based on rental rate None
Delivery Fee 400 903 200
Pick-up Fee 400 428 200
2 Pneumatic Compactor, 22,000 - 25,000Ibs, 8-wheel,
compaction width 82" (ballasted up to 35,000 Ibs) 1 month $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $6,290.00 $6,290.00]No Bid $5,280.00 $5,280.00 $5,510.00 $5,510.00 $4,968.00 $4,968.00
State Make/Model/Year Case/PT240/2015 Sakai/GW754/2020-2023 Caterpillar / CW34 / 2019+ Bomag BW 27 RH; 2021- 2023 HAMM / HP280i / 2021 - 2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 172 Hours 3000 3000 ranging from 350 Hrs to 750 Hrs 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 172 hours 160 40 176 Hrs 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $22.67 per hour over limit 39.31/hour Per hr based on rental rate None NA
Delivery Fee 600 400 1022 200 750.00
Pick-up Fee 600 400 452 200 750.00
3 Smooth Drum Vibratory Compactor, 23,000 |b 1 month $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $5,595.00 $5,595.00 $4,095.00 $4,095.00 $5,360.00 $5,360.00 $3,600.00 $3,600.00 $6,039.00 $6,039.00
State Make/Model/Year Dynapac/Bomag/ CA2500/BW211D-5 [Sakai/SV544D/2020-2023 \VOLVO SD115B Caterpillar / CS56 / 2019+ Bomag, BW 211 D,2021-2023 HAMM / HD + 120i / 2021 - 2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 172 Hours 3000 TBD at time of rental 4000 ranging from 500 Hrs to 1500 Hrs 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 172 Hours 160 8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth 40 176 Hrs 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours $22.67 per hour over limit 34.97/hour * See additional note Per hr based on rental rate None NA
Delivery Fee 5600 400 17 903 200 750
Pick-up Fee 5600 400 i 428 200 750
4 Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 21,000 b 1 month  INo Bid $6,140.00 $6,140.00 $5,750.00 $5,750.00 $4,320.00 $4,320.00 $4,950.00 $4,950.00 $4,554.00 $4,554.00
State Make/Model/Year Sakai/SW880/2020-2023 VOLVO DD110C Caterpillar / CB10/ 2018+ Bomag, BW 161 AD, 2021-2023 HAMM / HD110i + / 2021 - 2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3000 TBD at time of rental 3000 ranging from 350 Hrs to 750 Hrs
State Maximum Use Per Month 160 8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth 40 176 Hrs *MODEL DID NOT MEET
State Additional Costs over Max Hours 38.38/hour * See additional note Per hr based on rental rate None REQUESTED OPERATING
Delivery Fee 400 125 903 200 WEIGHT
Pick-up Fee 400 125 428 200
5 Padfoot Vibratory Soil Compactor, 24,000 Ibs 1 month $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $5,595.00 $5,595.00]No Bid $6,160.00 $6,160.00 $3,900.00 $3,900.00 $4,554.00 $4,554.00
State Make/Model/Year Dynapac/CA2500PD/2013 Sakai/SV544T/2020-2023 Caterpillar / CP56 / 2019+ Bomag, BW 211 PHD, 2021-2023 HAMM / HC130iP / 2021 - 2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 3000 3000 ranging from 750-1500 Hrs 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month *MODEL DID NOT MEET 160 40 176 Hours 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours REQUESTED OPERATING 34.97/hour Per hr based on rental rate None NA
Delivery Fee WEIGHT 400 903 200 750
Pick-up Fee 400 428 200 750
6 Water Truck 4,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month  [No Bid No Bid $4,800.00 $4,800.00 $4,240.00 $4,240.00]No Bid $5,265.00 $5,265.00
Frightliner or Peterbilt or Cat CT6 /
2015 and up (Road Water Truck w/
State Make/Model/Year FREIGHTLIN M2-106 Ledwell 4000 gallon tank) LIDELL / 4000 GALLON / 2020 - 2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided [ TBD at time of rental 6000 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth 40 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours * See additional note Per hr based on rental rate NA
Delivery Fee 125 903 750
Pick-up Fee 125 428 750
7 Water Truck 2,000 Gallon Minimum 1 month No Bid No Bid $3,150.00 $3,150.00fNo Bid No Bid $3,325.50 $3,325.50
State Make/Model/Year HINO 338 LIDELL / 2000 GALLON / 2020-2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided TBD at time of rental 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours * See additional note NA
Delivery Fee 125 750
Pick-up Fee 125 750
8 Compact Track Loader, 3,000 Ib 1 month  INo Bid No Bid $2,900.00 $2,900.00]No Bid No Bid $3,348.00 $3,348.00
State Make/Model/Year BOBCAT T740 [TAKEUCHI / TL12R2 / 2020-24
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided TBD at time of rental 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours * See additional note NA
Delivery Fee 125 450
Pick-up Fee 125 450
9 Skid Steer Loader, 2,200 Ibs 1 month $2,900.00 $2,900.00]No Bid $1,700.00 $1,700.00]No Bid No Bid $2,583.00 $2,583.00
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State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Self- Propelled Broom 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Fork Lift, Diesel 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Fork Lift, LPG 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Tandem Drum Vibratory Compactor, 3,300 Ib 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Walk Behind Concrete Saw, Gasoline, Push Type 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Handheld Concrete Saw 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Vibratory Plate Compactor 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Solar Message Board 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Skid Steer Loader, High Flow, 2,300 Ibs with Cold Planer

Attachment 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Mini-Excavator, 10,500 Ibs operating weight 1 month
State Make/Model/Year

State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided

State Maximum Use Per Month

State Additional Costs over Max Hours

Delivery Fee

Pick-up Fee

Kubota/SVL-75-2W/2022
172

172

$16.86 per hour over limit
5450

5450

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

BOBCAT S630
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$2,500.00 $2,500.00
LAYMOR SM450-ST
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$1,300.00 $1,300.00
[TOYOTA 8FDU25
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$1,200.00 $1,200.00
[TOYOTA 8FGU25
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$1,895.00 $1,895.00
VOLVO DD25BW
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$660.00 $660.00|
EDCO DS-20-13H
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$655.00 $655.00)
HILTI DSH 900-X
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
17
125
$465.00 $465.00|
MULTIQUIP MVC88VTHW
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$1,208.00 $1,208.00
WANCO WTMMB-A
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125

$4,475.00 $4,475.00
BOBCAT S630H & BOBCAT M7017
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125
$2,395.00 $2,395.00
BOBCAT E50
TBD at time of rental
8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth
* See additional note
125
125

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,070.00 $2,070.00
Broce, RIT 350; 2020-2023
ranging from 650-1200 Hrs
176 Hrs
None
200
200
No Bid

No Bid

$1,520.00 $1,520.00
Bomag; BW 90 AD, 2022-2023
ranging from 250-600 Hrs
176 Hours
None
200
200
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$2,280.00 $2,280.00
Doosan; DX 50-7, 2022-2023
ranging from 250 Hrs to 700 Hrs
176 Hours
No additional charge
200
200

TAKEUCHI / TL8R2 / 2020 - 2024
2000
160 HOURS
NA
450
450
$2,556.00 $2,556.00
BROCE / RCT350 96" / 2020-2024
2000
160 HOURS
NA
750
750
No Bid

No Bid

$1,188.00 $1,188.00
HAMM / HD8IVV / 2020 - 2024
2000
160 HOURS
NA
450
450
No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

No Bid

$5,652.00 $5,652.00
PLANER
2000
160 HOURS
NA
450
450
$3,015.00 $3,015.00
KOMATSU / PC78 / 2020 - 2024
2000
160 HOURS
67.50 per hour
450

450
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20 Padfoot Roller 54", 10,500 Ibs operating weight 1 month $2,400.00 $2,400.00 $2,825.00 $2,825.00 $3,305.00 $3,305.00]No Bid $3,348.00 $3,348.00 $2,835.00 $2,835.00
State Make/Model/Year [APT/1300PD/2016 Sakai/SV204T/2020-2023 VOLVO SD45B Bomag, BW 145 PHD, 2021 - 2023 HAMM / HC50iP / 2020 - 2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 172 3000 TBD at time of rental ranging from 600-1100 Hrs 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 172 Hours 160 8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth 176 Hrs 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours 13.95 17.66/hour * See additional note None NA
Delivery Fee 5450 400 125 200 750
Pick-up Fee 5450 400 125 200 750
21 5 8 . . . A
Padfoot roller 48", 5,900-7,400 Ibs operating weight 1 month  [No Bid No Bid $3,305.00 $3,305.00fNo Bid $2,976.00 $2,976.00fNo Bid
State Make/Model/Year VOLVO SD45B Bomag, BW 124PDH,2020-2023
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided TBD at time of rental ranging from 700-1500 Hrs
State Maximum Use Per Month 8 hrs/day, 40 hrs/wk, 160 hrs/mth 176 Hrs
State Additional Costs over Max Hours * See additional note None
Delivery Fee 125 200
Pick-up Fee 125 200
22 Reclaimer, approx. 60,000 Ibs operating weight 1 month  INo Bid No Bid No Bid $18,160.00 $18,160.00 $24,700.00 $24,700.00 $24,588.00 $24,588.00
State Make/Model/Year Caterpillar / RM500 / 2019 Bomag, RS 650, 2020-2023 WIRTGEN / WR240i / 2019 - 2024
State Maximum Meter Hours on Machine Provided 4000 ranging from 1200 - 2000 Hrs 2000
State Maximum Use Per Month 40 176 Hrs 160 HOURS
State Additional Costs over Max Hours Per hr based on rental rate None NA
Delivery Fee 1022 650 1000
Pick-up Fee 452 650 1000
Delivery in Calendar Days from Date of Order 2 Days 7 Days 1-2 Days 1-2 Weeks 5-7 Days 1-5 Days

*Additional:

Year of machine will be confirmed at|
time of rental. Make/Model will be
as listed or equivalent.; Additional
Costs over Max Hours: Use in excess
of one shift will be payable at the
hourly rate of 1/8 of the daily charge
(for a daily rental), 1/40 of the
weekly charge (for a weekly rental)
and 1/160 of the 4-week charge (for
a 4 week rental)

State Maximum Meter Hours on
Machine Provided: various hours,
rental units (range hours above)
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