
BuyBoard 646-21 Choice Partners 22/052SG Omnia Partners 2019000318 Sourcewell 070121-JHN BuyBoard 646-21
Total: 45,432.00$          Total: 56,127.60$          Total: 71,341.00$          Total: 136,828.61$        Total: 15,888.50$          

Line No Description Qty UoM Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost Unit Cost Ext Cost
1 GENERATOR 1000 KW DSL 27,884.00$          36,356.60$          35,710.00$          81,371.44$          NO BID

Day Rate 1 Each 2,093.00$            4,300.00$            2,750.00$            6,428.58$            NO BID
Weekly Rate 1 Each 5,233.00$            7,860.96$            8,200.00$            18,571.43$          NO BID

Monthly Rate 1 Each 15,698.00$          21,617.64$          22,000.00$          53,571.43$          NO BID
Cable (50ft) & Pigtail 1 JB 3,060.00$            178.00$                1,560.00$            400.00$                

Delivery Fee 1 JB 1,800.00$            2,400.00$            1,200.00$            2,400.00$            

2 GENERATOR 500 KW (501-1510) DSL T4F 12,722.00$          13,742.00$          28,830.00$          42,800.01$          10,863.00$          
Day Rate 1 Each 882.00$                1,420.00$            2,310.00$            3,571.43$            500.00$                

Weekly Rate 1 Each 2,205.00$            2,778.00$            6,300.00$            9,428.58$            2,450.00$            
Monthly Rate 1 Each 6,615.00$            8,266.00$            17,000.00$          27,000.00$          7,350.00$            

Cable (50ft) & Pigtail 1 JB 1,620.00$            178.00$                2,220.00$            400.00$                120.00$                
Delivery Fee 1 JB 1,400.00$            1,100.00$            1,000.00$            2,400.00$            443.00$                

3 GENERATOR 100 KW (501-1062) DSL 4,826.00$            6,029.00$            6,801.00$            12,657.16$          5,025.50$            
Day Rate 1 Each 266.00$                549.00$                391.00$                857.15$                450.50$                

Weekly Rate 1 Each 665.00$                1,101.00$            1,050.00$            2,571.43$            1,134.75$            
Monthly Rate 1 Each 1,995.00$            3,301.00$            3,000.00$            6,428.58$            2,877.25$            

Cable (50ft) & Pigtail 1 JB 900.00$                178.00$                1,560.00$            400.00$                120.00$                
Delivery Fee 1 JB 1,000.00$            900.00$                800.00$                2,400.00$            443.00$                

Sample pricing for evaluation purposes only. Awarded vendors are being awarded for the category in its entirety.
Draft Until Awarded 10/25/2023

PRIMARY SECONDARY TERTIARY QUATERNARY

H&E EQUIPMENT SERVICESCLIFFORD POWER SYSTEMS, INC.2024-072 EMERGENCY GENERATOR RENTAL
(Generator and Generator Accessories)

JOHNSON CONTROLS, INC.
HERC HOLDINGS INC.
DBA HERC RENTALSUNITED RENTALS, INC.


