2024-064 Computers, Peripherals, and Accessories

Summus Industries Inc.

Converge Technology Solutions

GTS Technology Solutions, Inc.

Cooperative Contract:

Cooperative Contract:

DIR-TSO-3763 DIR-TSO-3763 See cooperative and quote information on line
Line Description Qty Price Extended Qty Price Extended Qty Price Extended Quote No. | Co-op Contract
1|Desktop PC 302 | $1,365.91 $412,504.82 302 $1,609.79 $486,156.58 302 | $1,301.82 $393,149.64 |QT0105193 [DIR-TSO-3763-R
2|General Laptop 232 | $2,632.90 $610,832.80 232 $2,219.01 $514,810.32 232 | $1,882.93 $436,839.76 |QT0105194 [DIR-TSO-3763-R
3|2-in-1 1 $2,765.02 $2,765.02 1 $2,471.94 $2,471.94 1 $2,041.97 $2,041.97 QT0105195 ([DIR-TSO-3763-R
4|2-in-1 with GOBI 1 $2,867.23 $2,867.23 1 $2,575.10 $2,575.10 1 $2,182.60 $2,182.60 QT0105196 |[DIR-TSO-3763-R
5|MDC 6 $3,361.54 $20,169.24 6 $2,961.11 $17,766.66 6 $2,865.72 $17,194.32 QT0105197 |[DIR-TSO-3763-R
6{MDC with GOBI 1 $3,550.03 $3,550.03 1 $3,163.28 $3,163.28 1 $3,016.70 $3,016.70 QT0105198 |DIR-TSO-3763-R
7|Election Laptop 76 $1,691.65 $128,565.40 76 $1,513.82 $115,050.32 76 $1,389.50 $105,602.00 |QT0105199 [DIR-TSO-3763-R
8(24" Monitor 1011 $95.84 $96,894.24 1011 $128.35 $129,761.85 1011 $95.33 $96,378.63  [QT0105207 |DIR-TSO-3763-R
9|Optiplex Micro AlO Stand 302 $90.99 $27,478.98 302 $111.14 $33,564.28 302 $84.77 $25,600.54 QT0105207 |[DIR-TSO-3763-R
10|Dell KB216 Wired Multi-Media Keyboard English Black 232 $17.49 $4,057.68 232 $21.37 $4,957.84 232 $16.29 $3,779.28 QT0105207 |[DIR-TSO-3763-R
11(Dell MS116 Wired Mouse, Black 308 $17.49 $5,386.92 308 $21.37 $6,581.96 308 $16.29 $5,017.32 Q10105207 |DIR-TSO-3763-R
12|Dock - WD19S with 130W Adapter 232 $189.74 $44,019.68 232 $241.15 $55,946.80 232 $158.76 $36,832.32  [QT0105207 |DIR-TSO-3763-R
13[Dock - Vehicle Dock for Dell Latitude 5430 7 $696.99 $4,878.93 7 $747.99 $5,235.93 7 $573.96 $4,017.72 QT0105207 |[DIR-CPO-4751
14]4 Port USB 3.0 Hub with Individual Power Switches and LEDs 232 NO BID 232 $38.71 $8,980.72 232 $13.28 $3,080.96 QT0105207 |TIPS 230105
15|EcoLoop Pro Backpack 120 $43.74 $5,248.80 120 $53.43 $6,411.60 120 $40.75 $4,890.00 QT0105207 |DIR-TSO-3763-R
16|Targus Rolling Laptop Case or Collin County approved equal 50 $85.35 $4,267.50 50 $85.35 $4,267.50 50 $80.74 $4,037.00 Q70105207 |DIR-CPO-5097
17|Notebook docking station handle mounting kit for Dell 2 $69.38 $138.76 2 $26.71 $53.42" 2 $57.99 $115.98 Q70105207 |DIR-CPO-4751
18|USB 3.0 SuperSpeed 7-port USB Hub 76 $39.59 $3008.84" 76 $39.59 $3008.84" 76 $49.27 $3,744.52 QT0105207 |DIR-CPO-5097
19|USB Scan Gun 76 NO BID 76 $77.43 $5884‘681 NO BID
20|6Ft Hi-Speed USB 2.0 to USB B Cable Coiled - USB A-B M/M 6 76 $9.01 $684.76 76 $17.59 $1,336.84 76 $2.47 $187.72 QT0105207 |DIR-CPO-5097
21{QL-800 Label Printer 76 NO BID 76 $251.67 $19,126.92 76 $116.00 $8,816.00 QT0105207 |TIPS 230105
TOTAL| $1,377,319.63 TOTAL| $1,427,113.38 TOTAL| $1,156,524.98

Yitem quoted does not meet specifications
Line 19 not awarded
Southern Computer Warehouse was deemed non-responsive

Waypoint Business Solutions and CDW submitted responses of no bid

***Draft until award




	Bid Tab

